



[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	01
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 2 Definitions
Topic: 	Definition of Salvaged Material and Products 
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
N/A.
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
SECTION 202
DEFINITIONS
…
SALVAGED MATERIAL OR PRODUCT. A previously used building material or product that is reused without substantial modification of its form for the same or a different purpose.  Salvaged materials are minimally processed only, such as cleaning, repairing, resurfacing and resizing. 
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
SECTION 202
DEFINITIONS
…
SALVAGED MATERIAL OR PRODUCT. A previously used building material or product that is reused without substantial modification of its form for the same or a different purpose.  Salvaged materials are minimally processed only, such as cleaning, repairing, resurfacing and resizing. 
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes to add the definition for Salvaged Material or Product to Section 202 for coordination with the proposed amendments to Section 5.409.3 Product GWP – Prescriptive Option. This definition has been coordinated with BSC and is being co-adopted.
This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.


DSA COMMENTS
This item relates to Item 09, Embodied Carbon Reduction. These amendments are being co-adopted with BSC.






[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	02
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen,  Chapter 3 Green Building
Topic: 	Mandatory measures for public schools and community colleges
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
301.4 Mandatory measures for public schools and community colleges. [DSA-SS] New building construction and site work on a new or existing site shall comply with Section 301.4.
301.4.1 Building and site construction on a new site shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS. 
301.4.2 Work on an existing site shall comply with Section 301.4.2. 
301.4.2.1 Newly constructed site work shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS.
301.4.2.2 Newly constructed buildings shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS and Section 301.4.3.
301.4.2.3 Additions to existing buildings shall comply with Section 301.4.3.
301.4.2.4 Rehabilitated landscape areas shall comply with Sections 5.304.6 and 5.106.12.
301.4.2.5 Alterations and additions to existing parking facilities shall comply with Section 5.106.5.6.4. Additions to existing parking facilities shall comply with Section 5.106.12.
301.4.2.6 Alterations and additions to existing buildings shall comply with Sections 5.105.1, 5.106.5.6.5, 5.409, and 5.506.3.
301.4.3 Minimum rehabilitated landscape area requirement. A minimum rehabilitated landscape area equal to 75 percent of the footprint area of the building shall comply with Section 5.304.6 and Section 5.106.12. New buildings or additions to existing buildings less than 1,600 square feet shall not be required to comply with Section 301.4.3.
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
301.4 Mandatory measures for public schools and community colleges. [DSA-SS] New Bbuilding construction and site work on a new or existing site shall comply with Section 301.4.
301.4.1 Building construction and site construction work on a new site shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS.
301.4.2 Building construction and site wWork on an existing site shall comply with Table Section 301.4.2.
301.4.2.1 Newly constructed site work shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS.
301.4.2.2 Newly constructed buildings shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS and Section 301.4.3.
301.4.2.3 Additions to existing buildings shall comply with Section 301.4.3.
301.4.2.4 Rehabilitated landscape areas shall comply with Sections 5.304.6 and 5.106.12.
301.4.2.5 Alterations and additions to existing parking facilities shall comply with Section 5.106.5.6.4. Additions to existing parking facilities shall comply with Section 5.106.12.
301.4.2.6 Alterations and additions to existing buildings shall comply with Sections 5.105.1, 5.106.5.6.5, 5.409, and 5.506.3.
TABLE 301.4.2 – MANDATORY MEASURES FOR PUBLIC SCHOOLS AND COMMUNITY COLLEGES ON EXISTING SITES 
	PROJECT TYPE
	NEW
	ADDITIONS
	ALTERATION

	BUILDING
	Chapter 51
	5.106.5.6.5, 5.106.13, 5.304.3, 5.409, 5.506.3
	5.106.5.6.5, 5.304.3, 5.409, 5.506.3 

	SITE WORK
	Chapter 51
	Chapter 51
	Chapter 51

	PARKING FACILITY
	Chapter 51
	5.106.5.6.4, 5.106.12, 5.304.3 
	5.106.5.6.4, 5.304.3


1. Comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS.
[The following provisions are moved to Section 5.106.13 with minor modifications for clarity] 301.4.3 Minimum rehabilitated landscape area requirement. A minimum rehabilitated landscape area equal to 75 percent of the footprint area of the building shall comply with Section 5.304.6 and Section 5.106.12. New buildings or additions to existing buildings less than 1,600 square feet shall not be required to comply with Section 301.4.3.
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
301.4 Mandatory measures for public schools and community colleges. [DSA-SS] Building construction and site work on a new or existing site shall comply with Section 301.4.
301.4.1 Building construction and site work on a new site shall comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS.
301.4.2 Building construction and site work on an existing site shall comply with Table 301.4.2. 
TABLE 301.4.2 – MANDATORY MEASURES FOR PUBLIC SCHOOLS AND COMMUNITY COLLEGES ON EXISTING SITES
	PROJECT TYPE
	NEW
	ADDITIONS
	ALTERATION

	BUILDING
	Chapter 51
	5.106.5.6.5, 5.106.13, 5.304.3, 5.409, 5.506.3
	5.106.5.6.5, 5.304.3, 5.409, 5.506.3 

	SITE WORK
	Chapter 51
	Chapter 51
	Chapter 51

	PARKING FACILITY
	Chapter 51
	5.106.5.6.4, 5.106.12, 5.304.3 
	5.106.5.6.4, 5.304.3


1. Comply with Chapter 5 as adopted by DSA-SS.
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes to amend Section 301.4 Mandatory measures for public schools and community colleges to clarify that the section applies to all building construction, not only new building construction.
DSA-SS proposes to amend Section 301.4.1 for constancy of terminology.
DSA-SS proposes to amend Section 301.4.2 to clarify required mandatory measures based on project type by replacing the written descriptions in Section 301.4.2 with Table 301.4.2. 

DSA-SS proposes to relocate Section 301.4.3 Minimum Rehabilitated Landscape Area from the mandatory measures scoping section to the site development Section 5.106.13 to clarify that it is a technical requirement rather than a scope.
This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS
This Item relates to Item 04, Minimum Rehabilitated Landscape Area.







 [image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	03
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures
Topic: 	Reuse of Existing Building 
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
SECTION 5.105
DECONSTRUCTION AND REUSE
OF EXISTING STRUCTURES
5.105.1 Scope. 
[BSC-CG] …
[DSA-SS] Alteration(s) to existing building(s) where the combined altered floor area is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105.2, 5.409.2, or 5.409.3. Addition(s) to existing building(s) where the total floor area combined with the existing building(s) is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105.2, Section 5.409.2, or Section 5.409.3. 
Exception [BSC-CG, DSA-SS]: Combined addition(s) to existing building(s) of two times the area or more of the existing building(s) is not eligible to meet compliance with Section 5.105.2.
5.105.2 Reuse of existing building. An alteration or addition to an existing building shall maintain at a minimum 45 percent combined of the existing building’s primary structural elements (foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements) and existing building enclosure (roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes). Window assemblies, insulation, portions of buildings deemed structurally unsound or hazardous, and hazardous materials that are remediated as part of the project shall not be included in the calculation.
5.105.2.1 Verification of compliance. Documentation shall be provided in the construction documents to demonstrate compliance with Section 5.105.2.  
Note: Sample Worksheet WS-3 in Chapter 8 may be used to assist in documenting compliance with this section.
5.105.3 Deconstruction (Reserved).
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT

SECTION 5.105
DECONSTRUCTION AND REUSE
OF EXISTING STRUCTURES
5.105.1 Scope. Reserved. 
[BSC-CG] …
[DSA-SS] Alteration(s) to existing building(s) where the combined altered floor area is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105.2, 5.409.2, or 5.409.3. Addition(s) to an existing building(s) where the total floor area combined with the existing building(s) is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105.2, Section 5.409.2, or Section 5.409.3. 
[The following exception is moved to Section 5.409] Exception [BSC-CG, DSA-SS]: Combined addition(s) to an existing building(s) of two times the area or more of the existing building(s) is not eligible to meet compliance with Section 5.105.2.
5.105.2 Reuse of existing building. For reuse of existing buildings embodied carbon reduction requirements see Section 5.409. An alteration or addition to an existing building shall maintain at a minimum 45 percent combined of the existing building’s primary structural elements (foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements) and existing building enclosure (roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes). Window assemblies, insulation, portions of buildings deemed structurally unsound or hazardous, and hazardous materials that are remediated as part of the project shall not be included in the calculation. 
5.105.2.1 Verification of compliance. Documentation shall be provided in the construction documents to demonstrate compliance with Section 5.105.2.
Note: Sample Worksheet WS-3 in Chapter 8 may be used to assist in documenting compliance with this section.
5.105.3 Deconstruction (Reserved).
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED

SECTION 5.105
DECONSTRUCTION AND REUSE
OF EXISTING STRUCTURES
5.105.1 Reserved. 
5.105.2 Reuse of existing building. For reuse of existing buildings embodied carbon reduction requirements see Section 5.409.
5.105.3 Deconstruction (Reserved).
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA proposes to relocate embodied carbon reduction provisions related to reuse of existing building option to Section 5.409 where the other two options for compliance with CALGreen embodied carbon reduction are located. In response to stakeholder questions, this will clarify that there are three options for embodied carbon reduction compliance including Reuse of Existing Building Option as the first. Section 5.105.1 is proposed to be reserved for future use as this scoping language is duplicative to Section 5.409.1.  Exception to Section 5.105.1 is proposed to be moved to Section 5.409.1 Exception.
This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS
This Item relates to Item 09, Embodied Carbon Reduction. These amendments are being co-adopted with BSC.  







[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	04
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures
Topic: 	Minimum Rehabilitated Landscape Area
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
[The following language will be moved from Section 301.4.3 to Section 5.106.13 with minor modifications.]301.4.3 Minimum rehabilitated landscape area requirement. A minimum rehabilitated landscape area equal to 75 percent of the footprint area of the building shall comply with Section 5.304.6 and Section 5.106.12. New buildings or additions to existing buildings less than 1,600 square feet shall not be required to comply with Section 301.4.3.
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
[The following language is moved from Section 301.4.3 with minor modifications.] 301.4.35.106.13 Minimum rehabilitated landscape area requirement. [DSA-SS] A minimum rehabilitated An existing landscape area equal to a minimum 75 percent of the footprint area of the newly constructed building or addition to an existing building, which contains an existing irrigation system not in compliance with Section 5.304.6, shall be rehabilitated to comply with Section 5.304.3, Section 5.304.6, and Section 5.106.12. New buildings or additions to existing buildings less than 1,600 square feet shall not be required to comply with Section 301.4.3.
Exception: Newly constructed buildings or additions to existing buildings less than 1,600 square feet.
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
5.106.13 Minimum rehabilitated landscape area. [DSA-SS] An existing landscape area equal to a minimum 75 percent of the footprint area of the newly constructed building or addition to an existing building, which contains an existing irrigation system not in compliance with Section 5.304.6, shall be rehabilitated to comply with Section 5.304.3, Section 5.304.6, and Section 5.106.12. 
Exception: Newly constructed buildings or additions to existing buildings less than 1,600 square feet.
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes to amend Section 301.4.3 Minimum Rehabilitated Landscape Area Requirement to clarify what a rehabilitated landscape area is and what qualifies an existing landscape area to be rehabilitated.  The term “rehabilitated landscape area” comes from the California Department of Water Resources’ Model Water Efficient Landscape Ordinance (MWELO). MWELO Section 490.2 defines it as any landscape renovation project that requires a permit, plan check, or design review, complies with Section 491, and involves a modified landscape area of at least 2,500 square feet. Section 491 outlines when MWELO applies, including to certain existing non rehabilitated landscapes—specifically those installed before December 1, 2015, that are larger than one acre.
In practical terms, a rehabilitated landscape area refers to an existing landscape that has been updated to meet current outdoor water use requirements for irrigation standards. However, this meaning is not immediately clear in the CALGreen measure without prior familiarity with MWELO. Importantly, the term does not apply to existing landscapes without irrigation systems, since such areas are outside the scope of MWELO’s outdoor water use regulations, making this proposal necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations. 
DSA-SS also proposes to relocate Section 301.4.3 Minimum Rehabilitated Landscape Area from the mandatory measures scoping section to the site development Section 5.106.13 to clarify that it is a technical requirement rather than a scope.
DSA COMMENTS
This Item relates to Item 02, Mandatory Measures for Public Schools and Community Colleges.





[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	05
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s): 	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures, Division 5.3 Water Efficiency and Conservation
Topic: 	Nonfunctional Turf 
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE

5.304.1 Outdoor potable water use in landscape areas....
Notes:
1…
2…
5.304.2 Reserved.
5.304.3 Reserved.
…

SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
5.304.1 Outdoor potable water use in landscape areas....
Notes:
1…
2…
5.304.2 Reserved.
5.304.3 Reserved.Nonfunctional Turf. [DSA-SS]  
Note: On or after January 1, 2028, the use of potable water for irrigation of nonfunctional turf located on certain commercial, industrial, and institutional properties, as specified in Water Code (WAT) 10608.14, shall be prohibited.  See WAT Section 10608.14 for affected types of property, effective dates, duties and responsibilities for ensuring compliance.
…

CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
5.304.1 Outdoor potable water use in landscape areas....
Notes:
1…
2…
5.304.2 Reserved.
5.304.3 Nonfunctional Turf. [DSA-SS]  
Note: On or after January 1, 2028, the use of potable water for irrigation of nonfunctional turf located on certain commercial, industrial, and institutional properties, as specified in Water Code (WAT) 10608.14, shall be prohibited.  See WAT Section 10608.14 for affected types of property, effective dates, duties and responsibilities for ensuring compliance.
…
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes to remove the word Reserved from Section 5.304.3 and add section name of Nonfunctional Turf with a note regarding nonfunctional turf provisions applicable to non-residential applications for public schools and community colleges. The proposed note provides a pointer to the requirements of amended Sections of Division 6 of the Water Code, which amended Sections 10540, 10608.12, and 10608.22, added Section 110, and added Chapter 2.5 (commencing with Section 10608.14) to Part 2.55. 
This proposal is necessary to conform with existing statute AB1572 (2023) for nonfunctional turf and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations and statute.
DSA COMMENTS





[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	06
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures
Topic: 	Outdoor Potable Water Use in Landscape Areas
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
[bookmark: _Hlk196476580]5.304.6 Outdoor potable water use in landscape areas. For public schools and community colleges, landscape projects as described in Sections 5.304.6.1 and 5.304.6.2 shall comply with the California Department of Water Resources Model Water Efficient Landscape Ordinance (MWELO) commencing with Section 490 of Chapter 2.7, Division 2, Title 23, California Code of Regulations, except that the evapotranspiration adjustment factor (ETAF) shall be 0.65 with an additional water allowance for special landscape areas (SLA) of 0.35.
Exception: Any project with an aggregate landscape area of 2,500 square feet or less may comply with the prescriptive measures contained in Appendix D of the MWELO.   
5.304.6.1 Newly constructed landscapes. New construction projects with an aggregate landscape area equal to or greater than 500 square feet. 
5.304.6.2 Rehabilitated landscapes. Rehabilitated landscape projects with an aggregate landscape area equal to or greater than 1,200 square feet.
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
5.304.6 Outdoor potable water use in landscape areas. For public schools and community colleges, landscape projects as described in Sections 5.304.6.1 and 5.304.6.2 shall comply with the California Department of Water Resources Model Water Efficient Landscape Ordinance (MWELO) commencing with Section 490 of Chapter 2.7, Division 2, Title 23, California Code of Regulations, except that the evapotranspiration adjustment factor (ETAF) shall be 0.65 with an additional water allowance for special landscape areas (SLA) of 0.35.
Exception: Any project with an aggregate landscape area of 2,500 square feet or less may comply with the prescriptive measures contained in Appendix D Section 492 of the MWELO.   
5.304.6.1 Newly constructed landscapes. New construction projects with an aggregate landscape area equal to or greater than 500 square feet. 
5.304.6.2 Rehabilitated landscapes. Rehabilitated landscape projects with an aggregate landscape area equal to or greater than 1,200 square feet.
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
5.304.6 Outdoor potable water use in landscape areas. For public schools and community colleges, landscape projects as described in Sections 5.304.6.1 and 5.304.6.2 shall comply with the California Department of Water Resources Model Water Efficient Landscape Ordinance (MWELO) commencing with Section 490 of Chapter 2.7, Division 2, Title 23, California Code of Regulations, except that the evapotranspiration adjustment factor (ETAF) shall be 0.65 with an additional water allowance for special landscape areas (SLA) of 0.35.
Exception: Any project with an aggregate landscape area of 2,500 square feet or less may comply with the prescriptive measures contained in Section 492 of the MWELO.   
5.304.6.1 Newly constructed landscapes. New construction projects with an aggregate landscape area equal to or greater than 500 square feet. 
5.304.6.2 Rehabilitated landscapes. Rehabilitated landscape projects with an aggregate landscape area equal to or greater than 1,200 square feet.
STATEMENT OF REASONS
[bookmark: _Int_Q6FHMjNU]DSA-SS proposes to amend the exception to Section 5.304.6 for conformance with the Department of Water Resources MWELO, in which Appendix D was repealed on January 2, 2025 and prescriptive measures are contained in Section 492. 
This proposal is necessary for conforming with existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS





[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	07
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures
Topic: 	Definitions 
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
SECTION 5.402
DEFINITIONS

5.402.1 Definitions. The following terms are defined in Chapter 2. 
ADJUST.  
BALANCE. 
BUILDING COMMISSIONING. 
BUY CLEAN CALIFORNIA ACT (BCCA). 
CRADLE-TO-GRAVE. 
ORGANIC WASTE. 
REFERENCE STUDY PERIOD. 
TEST. 
TYPE III ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCT DECLARATION (EPD). 
FACTORY-SPECIFIC EPD. 
INDUSTRY-WIDE EPD (IW-EPD). 
PRODUCT-SPECIFIC EPD. 
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
SECTION 5.402
DEFINITIONS

5.402.1 Definitions. The following terms are defined in Chapter 2. 
ADJUST.  
BALANCE. 
BUILDING COMMISSIONING. 
BUY CLEAN CALIFORNIA ACT (BCCA). 
CRADLE-TO-GRAVE. 
ORGANIC WASTE. 
REFERENCE STUDY PERIOD. 
TEST. 
TYPE III ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCT DECLARATION (EPD). 
FACTORY-SPECIFIC EPD. 
INDUSTRY-WIDE EPD (IW-EPD). 
PRODUCT-SPECIFIC EPD. 
SALVAGED MATERIAL OR PRODUCT.
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
SECTION 5.402
DEFINITIONS

5.402.1 Definitions. The following terms are defined in Chapter 2. 
ADJUST.  
BALANCE. 
BUILDING COMMISSIONING. 
BUY CLEAN CALIFORNIA ACT (BCCA). 
CRADLE-TO-GRAVE. 
ORGANIC WASTE. 
REFERENCE STUDY PERIOD. 
TEST. 
TYPE III ENVIRONMENTAL PRODUCT DECLARATION (EPD). 
FACTORY-SPECIFIC EPD. 
INDUSTRY-WIDE EPD (IW-EPD). 
PRODUCT-SPECIFIC EPD. 
SALVAGED MATERIAL OR PRODUCT.
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes the new defined term Salvaged Material or Product is added to the list for consistency in the code. However, the term definition is in Chapter 2. 

This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS
This Item relates to Item 09, Embodied Carbon Reduction. These amendments are being co-adopted with BSC.  








[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	08
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures 
Topic: 	Weather Protection
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
5.407.1 Weather protection. Provide a weather-resistant exterior wall and foundation envelope as required by California Building Code Section 1402.2 (Weather Protection),
manufacturer’s installation instructions or local ordinance, whichever is more stringent.
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
5.407.1 Weather protection. Provide a weather-resistant exterior wall and foundation envelope as required by California Building Code Section 1402.2 (Weather Protection),
manufacturer’s installation instructions or local ordinance, whichever is more stringent. Reserved.
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
5.407.1 Reserved.
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes to repeal 5.407.1 Weather Protection as it is redundant with reference to California Building Code Section 1402.2 Weather Protection. This proposal is part of the CALGreen clean-up effort requested by stakeholders.

This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS
These amendments are being co-adopted with BSC.  







[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	09
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 5 Nonresidential Mandatory Measures
Topic: 	Embodied Carbon Reduction 
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
SECTION 5.409
LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT

5.409.1 Scope.
[BSC-CG] …
[DSA-SS] Projects consisting of newly constructed building(s) with a combined floor area of 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.409.2 or Section 5.409.3. Alteration(s) to existing building(s) where the combined altered floor area is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105.2, 5.409.2, or 5.409.3. Addition(s) to existing building(s) where the total floor area combined with the existing building(s) is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105.2, Section 5.409.2, or Section 5.409.3.
5.409.2 Whole building life cycle assessment. Projects shall conduct a cradle-to-grave whole building life cycle assessment performed in accordance with ISO 14040 and ISO 14044, excluding operating energy, and demonstrating a minimum 10-percent reduction in global warming potential (GWP) as compared to a reference baseline building of similar size, function, complexity, type of construction, material specification, and location that meets the requirements of the California Energy Code currently in effect. Software used to conduct the whole building life cycle assessment, including reference baseline building, shall have a data set compliant with ISO 14044, and ISO 21930 or EN 15804, and the software shall conform to ISO 21931 and/or EN 15978. The software tools and data sets shall be the same for evaluation of both the baseline building and the proposed building.
Notes:
1. Software for calculating whole building life cycle assessment is available for free at Athena Sustainable Materials Institute (https://calculatelca.com/software/impact-estimator/) and OneClick LCA-Planetary (www.oneclicklca.com/planetary). Paid versions include, but are not limited to, Sphera GaBi Solutions (gabi.sphera.com), SimaPro (simapro.com), One-Click LCA (www.oneclicklca.com) and Tally for Revit (apps.autodesk.com).
2. ASTM E2921-22 “Standard Practice for Minimum Criteria for Comparing Whole Building Life Cycle Assessments for Use with Building Codes, Standards, and Rating Systems” may be consulted for the assessment.
3. In addition to the required documentation specified in Section 5.409.2.3, Worksheet WS-9 may be required by the enforcing entity to demonstrate compliance with the requirements.
5.409.2.1 Building components. Building enclosure components included in the assessment shall be limited to glazing assemblies, insulation, and exterior finishes. Primary and secondary structural members included in the assessment shall be limited to footings and foundations, and structural columns, beams, walls, roofs, and floors.
5.409.2.2 Reference study period. The reference study period of the proposed building shall be equal to the reference baseline building and shall be 60 years.
5.409.2.3 Verification of compliance. A summary of the GWP analysis produced by the software and Worksheet WS-4 signed by the design professional of record shall be provided in the construction documents as documentation of compliance. A copy of the whole building life cycle assessment which includes the GWP analysis produced by the software, in addition to maintenance and training information, shall be included in the operation and maintenance manual and shall be provided to the owner at the close of construction. The enforcing agency may require inspection and inspection reports in accordance with Sections 702.2 and 703.1 during and at completion of construction to demonstrate substantial conformance. Inspection shall be performed by the design professional of record or third party acceptable to the enforcing agency.
5.409.3 Product GWP compliance—prescriptive path. Each product that is permanently installed and listed in Table 5.409.3 shall have a Type III environmental product declaration (EPD), either product-specific or factory-specific. 
5.409.3.1 Products shall not exceed the maximum GWP value specified in Table 5.409.3.
Exception: Concrete may be considered one product category to meet compliance with this section. A weighted average of the maximum GWP for all concrete mixes installed in the project shall be less than the weighted average maximum GWP allowed per Table 5.409.3 using Exception Equation 5.409.3.1. Calculations shall be performed with consistent units of measurement for the material quantity and the GWP value. For the purposes of this exception, industry-wide EPDs are acceptable.
Exception EQUATION 5.409.3.1
GWPn < GWPallowed
where 
GWPn = Σ (GWPn)(vn)   
and   
GWPallowed = Σ (GWPallowed)(vn)
and 
n = each concrete mix installed in the project
GWPn = the GWP for concrete mix n per concrete mix EPD, in kg CO2e/m3
GWPallowed = the GWP potential allowed for concrete mix n per Table 5.409.3 
vn = the volume of concrete mix n installed in the project, in m3
TABLE 5.409.3
PRODUCT GWP LIMITS
	Buy Clean California 
Materials Product Category 1
	Maximum acceptable GWP value (unfabricated)
(GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	Hot-rolled structural steel sections
	1.77
	MT CO2e/MT

	Hollow structural sections
	3.00
	MT CO2e/MT

	Steel plate
	2.61
	MT CO2e/MT

	Concrete reinforcing steel
	1.56
	MT CO2e/MT

	Flat glass
	2.50
	kg CO2e/MT 

	Light-density mineral wool board insulation
	5.83
	kg CO2e/1 m2

	Heavy-density mineral wool board insulation
	14.28
	kg CO2e/1 m2


Concrete, Ready-Mixed 2, 3
	Concrete Product Category
	Maximum GWP allowed value
(GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	up to 2499 psi  
	450
	kg CO2e/m3

	2500-3499 psi  
	489
	kg CO2e/m3

	3500-4499 psi
	566
	kg CO2e/m3

	4500-5499 psi
	661
	kg CO2e/m3

	5500-6499 psi
	701
	kg CO2e/m3

	6500 psi and greater
	799
	kg CO2e/m3


Concrete, Lightweight Ready-Mixed 2
	Concrete Product Category
	Maximum GWP allowed value (GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	up to 2499 psi  
	875
	kg CO2e/m3

	2500-3499 psi
	956
	kg CO2e/m3

	3500-4499 psi
	1,039
	kg CO2e/m3


1. The GWP values of the products listed in Table 5.409.3 are based on 175 percent of Buy Clean California Act (BCCA) GWP values, except for concrete products which are not included in BCCA.
2. For concrete, 175 percent of the National Ready Mix Concrete Association (NRMCA) 2022 version 3 Pacific Southwest regional benchmark values are used for the GWP allowed, except for High Early strength.
3. Concrete High Early Strength ready-mixed shall be calculated at 130 percent of the Ready mixed concrete GWP allowed values for each product category.

5.409.3.2 Verification of compliance. Calculations to demonstrate compliance, Type III EPDs for products required to comply, if included in the project, and Worksheet WS-5 signed by the design professional of record shall be provided on the construction documents. Updated EPDs for products used in construction shall be provided to the owner at the close of construction and to the enforcement entity upon request. The enforcing agency may require inspection and inspection reports in accordance with Sections 702.2 and 703.1 during and at completion of construction to demonstrate substantial conformance. Inspection shall be performed by the design professional of record or third party acceptable to the enforcing agency.


SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
SECTION 5.409
LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT EMBODIED CARBON REDUCTION
5.409.1 Scope. 
[BSC-CG] …
[DSA-SS] Projects consisting of newly constructed building(s) with a combined floor area of 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.409.23 or Section 5.409.34. Alteration(s) to existing building(s) where the combined altered floor area is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105409.2, 5.409.23, or 5.409.34. Addition(s) to existing building(s) where the total floor area combined with the existing building(s) is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.105409.2, Section 5.409.23, or Section 5.409.34. 
[The following exception is moved here from Section 5.105.1] Exception [BSC-CG, DSA-SS]: Combined addition(s) to existing building(s) of two times the area or more of the existing building(s) is not eligible to meet compliance with Section 5.105409.2.
[The following language is moved from Section 5.105.2 with minor modifications for clarity in the name of the section]
5.105409.2 Reuse of existing building option. An alteration or addition to an existing building shall maintain at a minimum 45 percent combined of the existing building’s primary structural elements (foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements) and existing building enclosure (roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes). Window assemblies, insulation, portions of buildings deemed structurally unsound or hazardous, and hazardous materials that are remediated as part of the project shall not be included in the calculation.
5.105409.2.1 Verification of compliance. Documentation shall be provided in the construction documents to demonstrate compliance with Section 5.105409.2.  
Note: Sample Worksheet WS-3 in Chapter 8 may be used to assist in documenting compliance with this section.
5.409.3 Product GWP compliance - prescriptive path option. Each product that is permanently installed and listed in Table 5.409.3 shall not exceed the maximum GWP value specified in Table 5.409.3 and shall have a Type III environmental product declaration (EPD), either product-specific or factory-specific. 
5.409. 3.1 Products shall not exceed the maximum GWP value specified in Table 5.409. 3.
Exceptions:
1: Salvaged materials and products are not required to have a Type III EPD and shall have a GWP of zero. 
Exception2: Concrete may be considered one product category to meet compliance with this section. Concrete mixes may be considered as aA weighted average of the maximum GWP for all concrete mixes installed in the project. The weighted average maximum GWP shall be less than the weighted average maximum GWP allowed per Table 5.409.3 using Exception Equation 5.409.3.1. Calculations shall be performed with consistent units of measurement for the material quantity and the GWP value. For the purposes of this exception, industry-wide EPDs are acceptable. 
Exception 2 EQUATION 5.409.3.1
…
TABLE 5.409.3
PRODUCT GWP LIMITS
	Buy Clean California 
Materials Product Category 1
	Maximum acceptable GWP value (unfabricated)
(GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	Hot-rolled structural steel sections
	1.77
	MT CO2e/MT

	Hollow structural sections
	3.00
	MT CO2e/MT

	Steel plate
	2.61
	MT CO2e/MT

	Concrete reinforcing steel
	1.56
	MT CO2e/MT

	Flat glass
	2.50
	kg CO2e/MT MT CO2e/MT

	Light-density mineral wool board insulation
	5.83
	kg CO2e/1 m2

	Heavy-density mineral wool board insulation
	14.28
	kg CO2e/1 m2


[bookmark: _Hlk125112050]Concrete, Ready-Mixed 2, 31
	Concrete Product Category
	Maximum GWP allowed value
(GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	up to 2499 psi  
	450
	kg CO2e/m3

	2500-3499 psi  
	489
	kg CO2e/m3

	3500-4499 psi
	566
	kg CO2e/m3

	4500-5499 psi
	661
	kg CO2e/m3

	5500-6499 psi
	701
	kg CO2e/m3

	6500 psi and greater
	799
	kg CO2e/m3


Concrete, Lightweight Ready-Mixed 2
	Concrete Product Category
	Maximum GWP allowed value (GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	up to 2499 psi  
	875
	kg CO2e/m3

	2500-3499 psi
	956
	kg CO2e/m3

	3500-4499 psi
	1,039
	kg CO2e/m3


1. The GWP values of the products listed in Table 5.409.3 are based on 175 percent of Buy Clean California Act (BCCA) GWP values, except for concrete products which are not included in BCCA.
2. For concrete, 175 percent of the National Ready Mix Concrete Association (NRMCA) 2022 version 3 Pacific Southwest regional benchmark values are used for the GWP allowed, except for High Early strength.
31. Concrete High Early Strength ready-mixed shall be calculated at 130 percent of the Ready mixed   concrete GWP allowed values for each product category.

5.409.3.21 Verification of compliance. …
[The following language is moved from Section 5.409.2 with minor modifications for clarity]
5.409.24 Whole building life cycle assessment – performance option. Projects shall conduct a cradle-to-grave whole building life cycle assessment performed in accordance with ISO 14040 and ISO 14044, excluding operating energy, and demonstrating a minimum 10-percent reduction in global warming potential (GWP) as compared to a reference baseline building of similar size, function, complexity, type of construction, material specification, and geographic location that meets the requirements of the California Energy Code currently in effect. Software used to conduct the whole building life cycle assessment, including reference baseline building, shall have a data set compliant with ISO 14044, and ISO 21930 or EN 15804, and the software shall conform to ISO 21931 and/or EN 15978. The software tools and data sets shall be the same for evaluation of both the baseline building and the proposed building.
Notes:
1. Software for calculating whole building life cycle assessment is available for free at Athena Sustainable Materials Institute (https://calculatelca.com/software/impact-estimator/) and OneClick LCA-Planetary (www.oneclicklca.com/planetary). Paid versions include, but are not limited to, Sphera GaBi Solutions (gabi.sphera.com), SimaPro (simapro.com), One-Click LCA (www.oneclicklca.com), and Tally for Revit (apps.autodesk.com).
2. ASTM E2921-22 “Standard Practice for Minimum Criteria for Comparing Whole Building Life Cycle Assessments for Use with Building Codes, Standards, and Rating Systems” may be consulted for the assessment.
3. In addition to the required documentation specified in Section 5.409.24.3, Worksheet WS-9 may be required by the enforcing entity to demonstrate compliance with the requirements.
5.409. 24.1 Building components. Building enclosure components included in the assessment shall be limited to glazing assemblies, insulation, and exterior finishes. Primary and secondary structural members included in the assessment shall be limited to footings and foundations, and structural columns, beams, walls, roofs, and floors.
5.409. 24.2 Reference study period. The reference study period of the proposed building shall be equal to the reference baseline building and shall be 60 years.

5.409. 24.3 Verification of compliance. A summary of the GWP analysis produced by the software and Worksheet WS-4 signed by the design professional of record shall be provided in the construction documents as documentation of compliance. A copy of the whole building life cycle assessment which includes the GWP analysis produced by the software, in addition to maintenance and training information, shall be included in the operation and maintenance manual and shall be provided to the owner at the close of construction. The enforcing agency may require inspection and inspection reports in accordance with Sections 702.2 and 703.1 during and at completion of construction to demonstrate substantial conformance. Inspection shall be performed by the design professional of record or third party acceptable to the enforcing agency.
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
SECTION 5.409
EMBODIED CARBON REDUCTION
5.409.1 Scope. 
[BSC-CG] (…) 
[DSA-SS] Projects consisting of newly constructed building(s) with a combined floor area of 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.409.3 or 5.409.4. Alteration(s) to existing building(s) where the combined altered floor area is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.409.2, 5.409.3, or 5.409.4. Addition(s) to existing building(s) where the total floor area combined with the existing building(s) is 50,000 square feet or greater shall comply with either Section 5.409.2, Section 5.409.3, or Section 5.409.4. 
Exception [BSC-CG, DSA-SS]: Combined addition(s) to existing building(s) of two times the area or more of the existing building(s) is not eligible to meet compliance with Section 5.409.2.
5.409.2 Reuse of existing building option. An alteration or addition to an existing building shall maintain at a minimum 45 percent combined of the existing building’s primary structural elements (foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements) and existing building enclosure (roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes). Window assemblies, insulation, portions of buildings deemed structurally unsound or hazardous, and hazardous materials that are remediated as part of the project shall not be included in the calculation.
5.409.2.1 Verification of compliance. Documentation shall be provided in the construction documents to demonstrate compliance with Section 5.409.2.  
Note: Sample Worksheet WS-3 in Chapter 8 may be used to assist in documenting compliance with this section.
5.409.3 Product GWP - prescriptive option. Each product that is permanently installed and listed in Table 5.409.3 shall not exceed the maximum GWP value specified in Table 5.409.3 and shall have a Type III environmental product declaration (EPD), either product-specific or factory-specific. 
Exceptions:
1: Salvaged materials and products are not required to have a Type III EPD and shall have a GWP of zero. 
2: Concrete mixes may be considered as a weighted average of the maximum GWP for all concrete mixes installed in the project. The weighted average maximum GWP shall be less than the weighted average maximum GWP allowed per Table 5.409.3 using Exception Equation 5.409.3. Calculations shall be performed with consistent units of measurement for the material quantity and the GWP value. For the purposes of this exception, industry-wide EPDs are acceptable. 
Exception 2 EQUATION 5.409.3
GWPn < GWPallowed
where 
GWPn = Σ (GWPn)(vn)   
and   
GWPallowed = Σ (GWPallowed)(vn)
and 
n = each concrete mix installed in the project
GWPn = the GWP for concrete mix n per concrete mix EPD, in kg CO2e/m3
GWPallowed = the GWP potential allowed for concrete mix n per Table 5.409.3 
vn = the volume of concrete mix n installed in the project, in m3
TABLE 5.409.3
PRODUCT GWP LIMITS
	Buy Clean California 
Materials Product Category 1
	Maximum acceptable GWP value (unfabricated)
(GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	Hot-rolled structural steel sections
	1.77
	MT CO2e/MT

	Hollow structural sections
	3.00
	MT CO2e/MT

	Steel plate
	2.61
	MT CO2e/MT

	Concrete reinforcing steel
	1.56
	MT CO2e/MT

	Flat glass
	2.50
	MT CO2e/MT

	Light-density mineral wool board insulation
	5.83
	kg CO2e/1 m2

	Heavy-density mineral wool board insulation
	14.28
	kg CO2e/1 m2


Concrete, Ready-Mixed 2, 3
	Concrete Product Category
	Maximum GWP allowed value
(GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	up to 2499 psi  
	450
	kg CO2e/m3

	2500-3499 psi  
	489
	kg CO2e/m3

	3500-4499 psi
	566
	kg CO2e/m3

	4500-5499 psi
	661
	kg CO2e/m3

	5500-6499 psi
	701
	kg CO2e/m3

	6500 psi and greater
	799
	kg CO2e/m3


Concrete, Lightweight Ready-Mixed 2
	Concrete Product Category
	Maximum GWP allowed value (GWP allowed)
	Unit of Measurement

	up to 2499 psi  
	875
	kg CO2e/m3

	2500-3499 psi
	956
	kg CO2e/m3

	3500-4499 psi
	1,039
	kg CO2e/m3


1. Concrete High Early Strength ready-mixed shall be calculated at 130 percent of the Ready mixed concrete GWP allowed values for each product category.
5.409.3.1 Verification of compliance. Calculations to demonstrate compliance, Type III EPDs for products required to comply, if included in the project, and Worksheet WS-5 signed by the design professional of record shall be provided on the construction documents. Updated EPDs for products used in construction shall be provided to the owner at the close of construction and to the enforcement entity upon request. The enforcing agency may require inspection and inspection reports in accordance with Sections 702.2 and 703.1 during and at completion of construction to demonstrate substantial conformance. Inspection shall be performed by the design professional of record or third party acceptable to the enforcing agency.
5.409.4 Whole building life cycle assessment – performance option. Projects shall conduct a cradle-to-grave whole building life cycle assessment performed in accordance with ISO 14040 and ISO 14044, excluding operating energy, and demonstrating a minimum 10-percent reduction in global warming potential (GWP) as compared to a reference baseline building of similar size, function, complexity, type of construction, material specification, and geographic location that meets the requirements of the California Energy Code currently in effect. Software used to conduct the whole building life cycle assessment, including reference baseline building, shall have a data set compliant with ISO 14044, and ISO 21930 or EN 15804, and the software shall conform to ISO 21931 and/or EN 15978. The software tools and data sets shall be the same for evaluation of both the baseline building and the proposed building.
Notes:
1. Software for calculating whole building life cycle assessment is available for free at Athena Sustainable Materials Institute (https://calculatelca.com/software/impact-estimator/) and OneClick LCA-Planetary (www.oneclicklca.com/planetary). Paid versions include, but are not limited to, Sphera GaBi Solutions (gabi.sphera.com), SimaPro (simapro.com), One-Click LCA (www.oneclicklca.com), and Tally for Revit (apps.autodesk.com).
2. ASTM E2921-22 “Standard Practice for Minimum Criteria for Comparing Whole Building Life Cycle Assessments for Use with Building Codes, Standards, and Rating Systems” may be consulted for the assessment.
3. In addition to the required documentation specified in Section 5.409.4.3, Worksheet WS-9 may be required by the enforcing entity to demonstrate compliance with the requirements.
5.409.4.1 Building components. Building enclosure components included in the assessment shall be limited to glazing assemblies, insulation, and exterior finishes. Primary and secondary structural members included in the assessment shall be limited to footings and foundations, and structural columns, beams, walls, roofs, and floors.
5.409.4.2 Reference study period. The reference study period of the proposed building shall be equal to the reference baseline building and shall be 60 years.
5.409.4.3 Verification of compliance. A summary of the GWP analysis produced by the software and Worksheet WS-4 signed by the design professional of record shall be provided in the construction documents as documentation of compliance. A copy of the whole building life cycle assessment which includes the GWP analysis produced by the software, in addition to maintenance and training information, shall be included in the operation and maintenance manual and shall be provided to the owner at the close of construction. The enforcing agency may require inspection and inspection reports in accordance with Sections 702.2 and 703.1 during and at completion of construction to demonstrate substantial conformance. Inspection shall be performed by the design professional of record or third party acceptable to the enforcing agency.
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS is proposing to consolidate all embodied carbon reduction provisions in Section 5.409 and rename it to Embodied Carbon Reduction, with Sections 5.409.2, 5.409.3 and 5.409.4 reorganized and renamed to identify them as “options”. This will clarify that there are three options for embodied carbon reduction compliance including Reuse of Existing Building Option, Product GWP – Prescriptive Option, and Whole Building Life Cycle Assessment – Performance Option as applicable based on project scope. ITEM 11 proposals are related to DSA-SS proposals in ITEMS 1 (SUB-ITEM 1-2), 4, 9 and 12. The proposed amendments have been coordinated with BSC and are being co-adopted. The rationale for each proposed change is listed below. 
DSA-SS proposes to rename Section 5.409 from Life Cycle Assessment to Embodied Carbon Reduction to clarify that there are three options for embodied carbon reduction compliance, rather than only the Life Cycle Assessment option.
DSA-SS proposes to amend Section 5.409.1 for coordination with the proposed Section 5.409 reorganization. Amendments include updates to the referenced section numbers and the addition of the relocated exception from Section 5.105.1, which relates to the reuse of existing building option section also relocated from Section 5.105 to Section 5.409. In addition, there are several editorial amendments to delete words “other” and “section” which are duplicative or not correct grammatically.
DSA-SS proposes to relocate Section 5.105.2, Reuse of Existing Building, along with subsection to Section 5.409.2 and rename Section 5.409.2 to add the word “option”.  This will clarify that it is the first of three options for embodied carbon reduction compliance.
DSA-SS proposes to rename Section 5.409.3 by removing the word “compliance” and replacing the word “path” with “option” to identify it as the second of three options for compliance with Section 5.409 Embodied Carbon Reduction.  
DSA-SS proposes to amend the language of Section 5.409.3 incorporating language from Section 5.409.3.1 to clarify that only the items listed in Table 5.409.3 require a type III EPD. Section 5.409.3.1 is proposed to be repealed.  
DSA-SS proposes to add Exception 1 for Salvaged Materials and Products to Section 5.409.3 to clarify that Salvaged Materials and Products comply with the GWP limits of Table 5.409.3 and are not required to have a type III EPD.
DSA-SS proposes to amend Section 5.409.3 to identify the concrete mixes exception as Exception 2 for coordination with other section amendments, and to clarify that concrete mixes may be considered individually or as a weighted average for compliance with Section 5.409.3.
DSA-SS proposes to amend Table 5.409.3 to correct the unit of measurement for flat glass. DSA is proposing to correct the unit of value from kg CO2e/MT to MT CO2e/MT. The revised unit of value for flat glass will align with the reported GWP values and industry data published in the Carbon Leadership Forum (CLF) Material Baselines for North America (2023). Additionally, subscript notes referring to the table footnotes are proposed to be revised to coordinate with changes proposed to the footnotes in SUB-ITEM 11-8.
DSA-SS proposes to remove footnotes one and two following Table 5.409.3 because they are purely information and do not provide any instructions or clarifications.  The information they provide has been misconstrued as instructional by stakeholders.  
DSA-SS proposes to amend the section number for the Verification of Compliance to Section 5.409.3.1 for coordination with other section amendments. 
DSA-SS proposes to relocate the Whole Building Life Cycle Assessment language from Section 5.409.2 to 5.409.4 and add “Performance Option” to the section name to clarify that it is the third of three options for compliance with Section 5.409 Embodied Carbon Reduction, listed in order of the least to the most complexity. 
DSA-SS proposes to amend the language of Section 5.409.4 to clarify that “location” is intended to mean “geographic location”. 
DSA-SS proposes to amend the subsections of Section 5.409.4 for coordinate with the relocation of the section from Section 5.409.2. 
This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS
This item relates to Item 01 (Salvaged Material Definition), Item 04 (Reuse of Existing Building), and Item 10 (Embodied Carbon Worksheets). These amendments are being co-adopted with BSC.  





[image: DSA]
Internal		Page 1 of 90
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
DSA Code Amendment development
TRACKING
Date Received:	
DSA Tracking Number:	10
Date Reviewed:	January 14, 2026
Status:	CAC
APPLICABLE CODE
Applicable Code Section(s):	Part 11 CALGreen, Chapter 8 Compliance Forms, Worksheets and Reference Material
Topic: 	Embodied Carbon Worksheets
CURRENT CODE LANGUAGE
WORKSHEET (WS-3)
5.105.2 BUILDING REUSE

DOCUMENTATION OF COMPLIANCE OF EXISTING BUILDING REUSE
Area of Existing Building(s)                                  _____ SF
Area of Aggregate Addition(s) (if applicable)       _____ SF

	
	EXISTING
TOTAL AREA
(A)
	RETAINED
TOTAL AREA
(B)
	% OF RETAINED
STRUCTURE
(B)/(A)

	Primary Structural Elements of Existing Building(s)
(foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements)
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF

	Building Enclosure of Existing Building(s)
(roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes only)
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF



Total % Reuse of Required Elements ≥ 45%      _____ %


WORKSHEET (WS-4)
Section 5.409.2 WHOLE BUILDING LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT

Responsible Designer’s Declaration Statement:
I attest that the Whole Building Life Cycle Analysis has been performed according to the
requirements of Section 5.409.2 and has met the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential as compared to a reference baseline building of similar size, function, complexity, type of construction, material specification, and location that meets the requirements of the California Energy Code currently in effect. Furthermore, I will ensure during construction that the material specifications will be reviewed for substantial conformance with the life cycle assessment indicated on the approved plans so at the close of construction the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential is thereby secured.
…
WORKSHEET (WS-5)
Section 5.409.3 PRODUCT GWP COMPLIANCE—PRESCRIPTIVE PATH
Responsible Designer’s Declaration Statement:
I attest that prescriptive compliance has been performed according to the requirements of Section 5.409.3 and products have met the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential as specified in Table 5.409.3. Furthermore, I will ensure during construction that the material specifications will be reviewed for substantial conformance with the global warming potential limits indicated on the approved plans so at the close of construction the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential is thereby secured.
…
WORKSHEET (WS-9)
Section 5.409.2 and Section A5.409.2 WHOLE BUILDING LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT
…
SUGGESTED TEXT OF PROPOSED AMENDMENT
WORKSHEET (WS-3)
5.105.2SECTION 5.409.2 BUILDING REUSE OF EXISTING BUILDING OPTION

DOCUMENTATION OF COMPLIANCE OF EXISTING BUILDING REUSE
Area of Existing Building(s)                                  _____ SF
Area of Aggregate Addition(s) (if applicable)       _____ SF

	
	EXISTING
TOTAL AREA
(A)
	RETAINED
TOTAL AREA
(B)
	% OF RETAINED
STRUCTURE
(B)/(A)

	Primary Structural Elements of Existing Building(s)
(foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements)
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF%

	Building Enclosure of Existing Building(s)
(roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes only)
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF%



Total % Reuse of Required Elements ≥ 45%      _____ %




WORKSHEET (WS-4)
Section 5.409.42 WHOLE BUILDING LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT – PERFORMANCE OPTION
Responsible Designer’s Declaration Statement:
I attest that the Whole Building Life Cycle Analysis has been performed according to the
requirements of Section 5.409.42 and has met the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential as compared to a reference baseline building of similar size, function, complexity, type of construction, material specification, and geographic location that meets the requirements of the California Energy Code currently in effect. Furthermore, I will ensure during construction that the material specifications will be reviewed for substantial conformance with the life cycle assessment indicated on the approved plans so at the close of construction the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential is thereby secured.
…
WORKSHEET (WS-5)
Section 5.409.3 PRODUCT GWP COMPLIANCE—PRESCRIPTIVE OPTIONPATH

Responsible Designer’s Declaration Statement:
I attest that each product listed in Table 5.409.3 and intended to be permanently installed complies with prescriptive compliance has been performed according to the requirements of Section 5.409.3 and does not exceed the maximum products have met the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential (GWP) value as specified in Table 5.409.3. 
Furthermore, I will ensure during construction that any the material specifications substitutions will be reviewed for substantial conformance with the requirements of Section 5.409.3 global warming potential limits indicated on the approved plans so at the close of construction compliance with the maximum GWP values the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential is thereby secured.
…
WORKSHEET (WS-9)
Section 5.409. 24 and Section A5.409. 24 WHOLE BUILDING LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT – PERFORMANCE OPTION
CODE TEXT IF ADOPTED
WORKSHEET (WS-3)
SECTION 5.409.2 REUSE OF EXISTING BUILDING OPTION

DOCUMENTATION OF COMPLIANCE OF EXISTING BUILDING REUSE
Area of Existing Building(s)                                  _____ SF
Area of Aggregate Addition(s) (if applicable)       _____ SF

	
	EXISTING
TOTAL AREA
(A)
	RETAINED
TOTAL AREA
(B)
	% OF RETAINED
STRUCTURE
(B)/(A)

	Primary Structural Elements of Existing Building(s)
(foundations; columns, beams, walls, and floors; and lateral elements)
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF
	
_____ %

	Building Enclosure of Existing Building(s)
(roof framing, wall framing and exterior finishes only)
	
_____ SF
	
_____ SF
	
_____ %



Total % Reuse of Required Elements ≥ 45%      _____ %


WORKSHEET (WS-4)
Section 5.409.4 WHOLE BUILDING LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT – PERFORMANCE OPTION
Responsible Designer’s Declaration Statement:
I attest that the Whole Building Life Cycle Analysis has been performed according to the
requirements of Section 5.409.4 and has met the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential as compared to a reference baseline building of similar size, function, complexity, type of construction, material specification, and geographic location that meets the requirements of the California Energy Code currently in effect. Furthermore, I will ensure during construction that the material specifications will be reviewed for substantial conformance with the life cycle assessment indicated on the approved plans so at the close of construction the minimum 10 percent reduction in global warming potential is thereby secured.
…
WORKSHEET (WS-5)
Section 5.409.3 PRODUCT GWP—PRESCRIPTIVE OPTION
Responsible Designer’s Declaration Statement:
I attest that each product listed in Table 5.409.3 and intended to be permanently installed complies with the requirements of Section 5.409.3 and does not exceed the maximum global warming potential (GWP) value specified in Table 5.409.3. Furthermore, I will ensure during construction that any material specification substitutions will be reviewed for substantial conformance with the requirements of Section 5.409.3 so at the close of construction compliance with the maximum GWP values is thereby secured.
…
WORKSHEET (WS-9)
Section 5.409.4 and Section A5.409.4 WHOLE BUILDING LIFE CYCLE ASSESSMENT – PERFORMANCE OPTION
…
STATEMENT OF REASONS
DSA-SS proposes to amend Worksheets 3 for coordination with the proposed renumbering and renaming amendments to Section 5.409.2. Additionally, the typo in the last column is corrected from “SF” to “%”.

DSA-SS proposes to amend Worksheets 4 to clarify that the term “location” is intended to mean “geographic location”, and for coordination with the proposed renumbering and renaming amendments to Section 5.409.4.
DSA-SS proposes to amend Worksheets 5 for coordination with the proposed renumbering and renaming amendments to Section 5.409.3. DSA-SS is also proposing to amend the language of the statement to align with the requirements in Section 5.409.3.  Worksheet (WS-5) as printed contains inappropriate references to “10 percent reduction in GWP” while the intent of the worksheet is to certify compliance with the maximum GWP values listed in Table 5.409.3. 
DSA-SS proposes to amend Worksheets 9 for coordination with the proposed renumbering and renaming amendments to Section 5.409.4.
This proposal is necessary for clarity of existing regulations and does not materially alter the substance or intent of the existing regulations.
DSA COMMENTS
This item relates to Item 09, Embodied Carbon Reduction. These amendments are being co-adopted with BSC.
Internal		Page 1 of 1
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA

Internal		Page 2 of 2
DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT	DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES	STATE OF CALIFORNIA
image1.png




