COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX 
STRUCTURAL DESIGN/LATERAL FORCES (SDLF) CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE – JULY 16 & 17, 2024
[bookmark: _Hlk163196908]2025 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 2, VOLUME 2, 2024 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC),
AGENCY: OFFICE OF STATEWIDE HOSPITAL PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT, OSHPD 05/24
LEGEND:
CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw
CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
[bookmark: _Hlk51752204]Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required
[bookmark: _Hlk51751202]If using assistive technology, please adjust your settings to recognize underline, strikeout, italic and ellipsis.
· Model Code language appears upright
· Existing California amendments appear in italic
· Amended model code or new California amendments appear underlined & italic
· Repealed model code language appears upright and in strikeout
· Repealed California amendments appear in italic and strikeout
· Ellipses (…) indicate existing text remains unchanged

ITEM 1
CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 2 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 1
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	1-1
	ACTIVE EARTHQUAKE FAULT
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-2
	ALTERNATIVE SYSTEM
	
	
	
	Section references corrected.
	

	1-3
	BASE
	
	
	
	OSHPD banner and section reference corrected.
	

	1-4
	DISTANCE FROM AND ACTIVE EARTHQUAKE FAULT
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-5
	FREESTANDING ACUTE PSYCHIATRIC BUILDING
	
	
	
	The definition of freestanding building is no longer in Part 1, so reference to Part 1 is repealed.
	

	1-6
	FREESTANDING BUILDING OR STRUCTURE
	
	
	
	New definition added since the term is used extensively in the California Building Code.
	

	1-7
	FREESTANDING SKILLED NURSING BUILDING (SNB)
	
	
	
	The definition of freestanding building is no longer in Part 1, , so reference to Part 1 is repealed
	

	1-8
	GENERAL ACUTE CARE BUILDING (GAC BUILDING)
	
	
	
	Clarity added to the definition based on the law.
	

	1-9
	INCIDENTAL STRUCTURAL ALTERATIONS, ADDITIONS OR REPAIRS
	
	
	
	New definition added as a pointer to the California Existing Building Code to avoid duplication.
	

	1-10
	IRREGULAR STRUCTURE
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-11
	MAJOR STRUCTURAL ALTERATIONS, ADDITIONS OR REPAIRS
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-12
	MINOR STRUCTURAL ALTERATIONS, ADDITIONS OR REPAIRS
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-13
	NEXT GENERATION ATTENUATION WEST 2 (NGAWEST 2)
	
	
	
	This defined term is repealed as it is no longer used.
	

	1-14
	NPC 1, NPC 2, NPC 3/NPC 3R, NPC 4, NPC-4D AND NPC 5.
	
	
	
	Revised to match the OSHPD type of applicable building.
	

	1-15
	OFF SITE CONSTRUCTION
	
	
	
	New definition added for use in Sections 1710 and 1710A.
	

	1-16
	RETROFIT
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-17
	SIGNIFICANT LOSS OF FUNCTION
	
	
	
	OSHPD banners corrected.
	

	1-18
	SPECIAL INSPECTION
	
	
	
	Missing banner for the periodic special inspection is added.
	

	1-19
	SURFACE MOUNTED COMPONENT
	
	
	
	OSHPD banner and section reference corrected.
	



ITEM 2
CHAPTER 14 EXTERIOR WALLS
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 14 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 2
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	2-1
	1404.1.2 1404.1.1 Additional requirements.
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise references.
	

	2-2
	1410 1413, 
1410.1 1413.1,
1410.2 1413.2 
	
	
	
	Sections renumbered.
	

	2-3
	1413.2.1 1410.2.1 Bond strength and tests.
	
	
	
	Section revised to align language with TMS 402 and require all mortar and veneer types to be tested.
	

	2-4
	1413.2.2 TMS 402, Section 13.3.2.2.
	
	
	
	New section added to replace TMS 402 Section 13.3.2.2 and  limit masonry veneers weight to 15 psf.
	



ITEM 3
CHAPTER 15 ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 15 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4,  5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 3
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	3-1
	1511.9 10 Photovoltaic (PV) panel systems. 1511.9.1 10.1 Design Installation.
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise the language removing unnecessary duplications and clarifying requirements for manufacturer’s instructions and design of PV panel systems.
	



ITEM 4
CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 16 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 4
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	4-1
	1601.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Editorial change to reflect change in organization name and other editorial revisions.
	

	4-2
	1601.1.2 Amendments in this chapter.
	
	
	
	Editorial change for clarification.
	

	4-3
	1601.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Add section to clarify identification of amendments and adopting agency. Editorial change to reflect change in organization name.
	

	4-4
	1601.1.5 1601.1.4 Additional aAmendments.
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise pointers.
	

	4-5
	Table 1604.5 RISK CATEGORY OF BUILDINGS AND OTHER STRUCTURES
	
	
	
	New amendment to retain risk category assignment in-lieu of adopting new risk category in accordance with model code.
	

	4-6
	Table 1607.1 MINIMUM UNIFORMLY DISTRIBUTED LIVE LOADS …
	
	
	
	Renumber #39 to align with model code re-organization.
	

	4-7
	1607.14.3.5 Ballasted photovoltaic panel systems.
	
	
	
	New amendment to align language with Section 1613.4.
	

	4-8
	1613.1 Scope.
	
	
	
	Delete existing exception.
	

	4-9
	1613.2 Determination of seismic design category.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment from Section 1613.2.5.
	

	4-10
	1613.2.1, 1613.2.5, 1613.2.5.1, 1613.2.5.2, & Tables 1613.2.3(1) & 1613.2.3(2)
	
	
	
	Repeal amendments in sections which are repealed in 2024 IBC.
	

	4-11
	1613.7 1613.4 Component Importance Factors.
	
	
	
	Renumber existing section.
	



ITEM 5
CHAPTER 16A STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 16 as Chapter 16A of the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 1 and 4. Adopt only section 1617A.1.18 for OSHPD 2 & 5. 
Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 5
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	5-1
	1601A.1.1
1601A.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial to reflect change in organization name.
	

	5-2
	1604A.4 Analysis.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment repealed.
	

	5-3
	1605A.1.2 Foundation resistance.
	
	
	
	New amendment to separate language and provide clarification.
	

	5-4
	1605A.3.1 ICC 300, Section 303.5.2.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment repealed.
	

	5-5
	[bookmark: _Hlk159306329]1605A.3.1 1605A.3.2
	
	
	
	Renumber and clarify the language.
	

	5-6
	1607A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment repealed.
	

	5-7
	Table 1607A.1
	
	
	
	Renumber #38 to #39.
	

	5-8
	1607A.14.3.5 Ballasted photovoltaic panel systems.
	
	
	
	New amendment added for consistency with Section 1613A.4
	

	5-9
	1607A.14.4 1607A.14.5
	
	
	
	Section renumbered.
	

	5-10
	1607A.18 Seating for assembly uses.
	
	
	
	Amendment relocated from existing Section 1607A.19.
	

	5-11
	1610A.1 Lateral pressures.
	
	
	
	New amendments to clarify language.
	

	5-12
	1613A.1 Scope.
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment deleting exceptions. Repeal part of the amendment prohibiting use of ASCE 7 to determine seismic design category.
	

	5-13
	1613A.2 Determination of seismic design category.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendments from Section 1613A.2.5.
	

	5-14
	1613A.2.5 & 1613A.2.5.1
Tables Tables 1613A.2.3(1) & 1613A.2.3(2)
	
	
	
	Relocate and repeal existing amendments in the sections and tables deleted in 2024 IBC.
	

	5-15
	1613A.3 Simplified design procedure.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment along with the model section.
	

	5-16
	1613A.4 Ballasted photovoltaic panel systems.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment along with the model section.
	

	5-17
	1617A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Revise the pointer.
	

	5-18
	1617A.1.1 ASCE 7, Section 1.3.
	
	
	
	Revise to include wind tunnel tests to the structural design criteria requirements to align with ASCE 7.
	

	5-19
	1617A.1. 3. Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 11.4.
	
	
	
	Repeal the amendment and reserve the section.
	

	5-20
	1617A.1.4 ASCE 7, Table 12.2-1.
	
	
	
	Editorial renumbering and renaming. Revise language regarding moment frames.
	

	5-21
	1617A.1.5 Reserved.
	
	
	
	Amendment repealed as it got addressed in 
ASCE 7-22.
	

	5-22
	1617A.1.10 ASCE 7, Section 12.3.3.1.
	
	
	
	Revised to align with ASCE 7-22.
	

	5-23
	1617A.1.11 ASCE 7, …
	
	
	
	Revised to align with ASCE 7.
	

	5-24
	1617A.1.12 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 12.10.2.1.
	
	
	
	New amendment to clarify exception.
	

	5-25
	1617A.1.13 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 12.13.5.2.
	
	
	
	New amendment.
	

	5-26
	1617A.1.14 Reserved.
	
	
	
	Amendment repealed.
	

	5-27
	1617A.1.16 ASCE 7, Section 12.13.9.2.
	
	
	
	Revised amendment for clarification.
	

	5-28
	1617A.1.17 ASCE 7, Section 13.1.3.
	
	
	
	Referenced section number revised to align with ASCE 7.
	

	5-29
	1617A.1.18 ASCE 7, Section 13.1.4.
	
	
	
	Header added. Editorial amendments.
	

	5-30
	1617A.1.19 ASCE 7, Section 13.4
	
	
	
	Added and revised language.
	

	5-31
	1617A.1.21 ASCE 7, Section 13.5.6.2.
	
	
	
	Section revised to add a prescriptive provision for aluminum ceiling.
	

	5-32
	1617A.1.23 ASCE 7, Section 13.6.2.1.
	
	
	
	Corrected reference and repealed existing amendments.
	

	5-33
	1617A.1.26 ASCE 7, Section 13.6.7.3.
	
	
	
	Revisions to align with ASCE 7-22. Editorial changes.
	

	5-34
	[bookmark: _Hlk164233378][bookmark: _Hlk164233327]1617A.1.37 Reserved. 1617A.1.38 ASCE 7, …
	
	
	
	Section renumbered.
	

	5-35
	1617A.1.38 ASCE 7, Section 20.3.
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	5-36
	[bookmark: _Hlk157487426]1617A.1.39 …
	
	
	
	Reference section numbers revised.
	



ITEM 6
CHAPTER 17 SPECIAL INSPECTION AND TESTS
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 17 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 6
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	6-1
	1701.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Editorial to reflect change in organization name.
	

	6-2
	1701.1.2 Amendments in this chapter.
	
	
	
	Editorial change for clarification and revision to section references.
	

	6-3
	1701.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Editorial to reflect change in organization name.
	

	6-4
	1704.2 Special inspections and tests.
	
	
	
	Editorial change to add reference to all applicable Chapters.
	

	6-5
	1704.3.2 Seismic requirements in the statement of special inspections.
	
	
	
	Editorial change to revise section references.
	

	6-6
	1705.2.1 Structural steel.
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendments and adopt model with some modifications.
	

	6-7
	1705.2.2 Structural stainless steel.
	
	
	
	New amendments.
	

	6-8
	1705.2.3 Cold-formed steel deck.
	
	
	
	New amendments.
	

	6-9
	1705.2.4.1 1705.2.3.1
1705.2.5.1 1705.2.4.1
	
	
	
	Renumbering and editorial changes.
	

	6-10
	1705.2.7 1705.2.5 Special inspection Inspections and tests of structural welding.
	
	
	
	Amendment relocated. Added references and revised existing references to align with model code re-organization. Added language.
	

	6-11
	1705.2.8 1705.2.6
	
	
	
	Renumbered amendment. Revised references.
	

	6-12
	1705.3.3.1, 1705.3.4 and 1705.3.9
	
	
	
	Editorial changes to comply with the statutory plain language mandate.
	

	6-13
	1705.4 Masonry construction.
	
	
	
	Added language to require batch plant inspection requirements for grout.
	

	6-14
	705A.4.1.1 TMS 602 Section 1.6 Quality Assurance.
	
	
	
	Added section.
	

	6-15
	1705.5.4 and 1705.5.5 Structural glued laminated and cross-laminated timber.
	
	
	
	Editorial amendment to move OSHPD banner. Reference pointer revised.
	

	6-16
	1705.13.1 Structural steel.
1705.14.1 Structural steel.
	
	
	
	Sections and subsections revised to clarify that requirements of CBC are also applicable. Clarified language for exceptions in subsections.
	

	6-17
	1705.14.2 Nonstructural components.
	
	
	
	Amendment is revised to include nationally recognized standards. Added clarifying note.
	

	6-18
	1705.14.3.1 Special seismic certification.
	
	
	
	Revised section to align with CEC Section 517.4.
	

	6-19
	SECTION 1710 OFF-SITE CONSTRUCTION
	
	
	
	New section added.
	



ITEM 7
CHAPTER 17A SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TEST
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 17 as Chapter 17A of the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 1 and 4. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 7
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	7-1
	1701A.1.1 Application.
1701A.1.2 Amendments in this chapter.
	
	
	
	Editorial to reflect change in organization name.
	

	7-2
	1701A.3 Special inspections and tests.
	
	
	
	Added reference to Chapter 14, 15 and 24.
	

	7-3
	1704A.2.4 Report requirement.
	
	
	
	Editorial changes to align with revised model code.
	

	7-4
	1704A.5 Submittals to the building official.
	
	
	
	Deleted certification requirements for manufacturer’s certificate.
	

	7-5
	1705A.2.1 Structural steel.
	
	
	
	Revised to adopt the model code provisions and aligns with current practice
	

	7-6
	TABLE 1705A.2.1
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment and adopt model.
	

	7-7
	1705A.2.2 Structural stainless steel.
	
	
	
	Section revised to clarify requirements of CBC are also applicable.
	

	7-8
	1705A.2.3 Cold-formed steel deck.
	
	
	
	Deleted pointers. Added amendment.
	

	7-9
	[bookmark: _Hlk158198627]1705A.2.4.1 1705A.2.3.1 1705A.2.5.1 1705A.2.4.1
	
	
	
	Revised section numbers and added clarifications.
	

	7-10
	1705A.2.7 1705A.2.5 Special inspections Inspection and tests of structural welding.
1705A.2.8 1705A.2.6
	
	
	
	Editorial changes to keep the sections coordinated.
	

	7-11
	TABLE 1705A.3
	
	
	
	Table is updated to match with new IBC format.
	

	7-12
	1705A.3.1 Welding of reinforcing bars.
	
	
	
	Revised pointers.
	

	7-13
	1705A.3.3.1
	
	
	
	Editorial amendments.
	

	7-14
	[bookmark: _Hlk160105003]1705A.4 Masonry construction.
	
	
	
	Added language to require batch plant inspection requirements for grout.
	

	7-15
	1705A.4.1.1 TMS 602 Section 1.6 Quality Assurance.
	
	
	
	Added section to maintain current requirement for inspection.
	

	7-16
	1705A.5.1 
	
	
	
	Revised pointers.
	

	7-17
	1705A.5.5
	
	
	
	Revised pointers.
	

	7-18
	1705A.13.1 Structural steel.
	
	
	
	Revised subsections to clarify that requirements of CBC are also applicable. 
	

	7-19
	1705A.13.5.2 Structural sealant glazing.
	
	
	
	Corrected section reference.
	

	7-20
	1705A.14.1 Structural steel.
	
	
	
	Revised subsections to clarify that requirements of CBC are also applicable.
	

	7-21
	1705A.14.2 Nonstructural components.
	
	
	
	Reference to Section 1704A.5 is deleted. Revised amendment and add a note.
	

	7-22
	1705A.14.3.1
	
	
	
	Revised exceptions 1 and 7.
	

	7-23
	SECTION 1710A OFF-SITE CONSTRUCTION
	
	
	
	New section added.
	



ITEM 8
CHAPTER 18 SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 18 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 8
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	8-1
	1801.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Organization name and other editorial changes.
	

	8-2
	1801.1.2 Amendments in this chapter.
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	8-3
	1801.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Organization name change.
	

	8-4
	1803.2 Investigations required.
	
	
	
	Added OSHPD 1R and 5 applications to the banner.
	

	8-5
	1803.5.4 Groundwater.
	
	
	
	Repealed amendment.
	

	8-6
	1803.7 Geohazard reports.
	
	
	
	Exceptions reorganized and revised for clarity. 
	

	8-7
	1807.2 Retaining walls.
	
	
	
	Deleted pointer.
	

	8-8
	1807.2.5 Freestanding cantilever walls.
	
	
	
	Deleted amendment.
	

	8-9
	1808.8.6 Seismic requirements.
	
	
	
	Redundant reference deleted.
	

	8-10
	1809.15 1809.14 
	
	
	
	Revised section number. Revised exception.
	

	8-11
	1810.3.9.4.2.1 Site Classes A through DE.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	8-12
	1810.3.12 Grade beams.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	8-13
	1812.2 Duration. 
1812.5 Construction:
	
	
	
	Editorial changes for clarity.
	



ITEM 9
CHAPTER 18A SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 18 as Chapter 18A of the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 1 and 4. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 9
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	9-1
	1801A.1.1 and 1801A.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial to reflect change in organization name.
	

	9-2
	1803A.6 Geohazard reports.
	
	
	
	Reorganized exceptions. Name of the CGS Special Publication 42 is revised to match with new name. Removed restrictions.
	

	9-3
	1807A.2 Retaining walls.
	
	
	
	Pointer repealed.
	

	9-4
	1807A.2.5 Freestanding cantilever walls.
	
	
	
	Amendment repealed.
	

	9-5
	1807A.3 Embedded posts and poles.
	
	
	
	Reference clarified.
	

	9-6
	1809A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Revised pointer.
	

	9-7
	1809A.14 and 1809A.15 1809A.14
	
	
	
	Revised section number. Revised exception.
	

	9-8
	1810A.3.3.1.2, 1810A.3.3.1.5 and 1810A.3.3.2
	
	
	
	Cyclic test requirements are removed.
	

	9-9
	1810A.3.12 Grade beams.
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	9-10
	1811A.4 Structural Requirements.
	
	
	
	Revised section reference.
	

	9-11
	[bookmark: _Hlk170282337]1812A.2, 1812A.5 and 1812A.7
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	



ITEM 10
CHAPTER 19 CONCRETE
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 19 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 10
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	10-1
	Note under chapter title
	
	
	
	Amendment repealed.
	

	10-2
	1901.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Editorial change. Revised language.
	

	10-3
	1901.1.2 
1901.1.3 
	
	
	
	Editorial change. Reorganized sections and sentences.
	

	10-4
	1901.1.4 Amendments.
	
	
	
	Deleted redundant pointer.
	

	10-5
	1901.3.2 Mechanical anchors …
	
	
	
	Added note.
	

	10-6
	1901.3.3 Post-installed adhesive …
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	10-7
	1901.3.4 with subsections
	
	
	
	Reorganized section and subsections.
	

	10-8
	1903.2 Special inspections.
	
	
	
	Deleted amendment.
	

	10-9
	1903.3
	
	
	
	Section renumbered on the model level. 
	

	10-10
	1903.5 Aggregates
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment to deleted ASTM C33 Appendix.
	

	10-11
	1903.6 Limits on Cementitious Materials.
	
	
	
	Repealed amendment.
	

	10-12
	1903.4 1903.7
1903.5 1903.8
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections. 
	

	10-13
	1905.5 and 1905.6
	
	
	
	Relocated amendments. Redundant reference deleted.
	

	10-14
	1906
	
	
	
	Clarified amendment.
	

	10-15
	1908.1 General.
	
	
	
	Existing sections merged. Added reference for clarity.
	

	10-16
	1908.2 and 1908.3
	
	
	
	Relocated existing sections.
	

	10-17
	1910.3.4 ACI 318, Table 21.2.2.
	
	
	
	Repealed amendment.
	

	10-18
	1910.3.4 ACI 318, Section 26.11.1.2.
	
	
	
	Relocated existing amendment.
	

	10-19
	1911.2 Crack repair by epoxy …
	
	
	
	Adopt newer standard.
	



ITEM 11
CHAPTER 19A CONCRETE
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 19 as Chapter 19A of the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 1 and 4. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 11
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	11-1
	Note under chapter title
	
	
	
	Amendment repealed.
	

	11-2
	1901A.1.1 & 1901A.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	11-3
	1901A.2 Reinforced concrete
	
	
	
	Retain existing amendment.
	

	11-4
	1901.2.1
	
	
	
	Model code provisions not adopted.
	

	11-5
	1901A.5 Construction documents.
	
	
	
	Deleted reference to plain concrete.
	

	11-6
	1902A.1.2 Special structural wall.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendments in deleted model code section.
	

	11-7
	1903A.2 Special inspections
	
	
	
	Repeal amendments in deleted model code section.
	

	11-8
	1903A.3
	
	
	
	Amendment moved in alignment with model section.
	

	11-9
	1903A.5 Aggregates
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	11-10
	1903A.6 Limits on cementitious materials.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	11-11
	1903A.4 1903A.7
1903A.5 1903A.8
	
	
	
	Renumbering.
	

	11-12
	1905A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Revise pointers.
	

	11-13
	1905A.2 ACI 318 Section 2.3.
	
	
	
	Keep deleting model code definitions.
	

	11-14
	1905A.3 Intermediate precast structural walls.
	
	
	
	OSHPD does not adopt. Section is reserved for DSA-SS.
	

	11-15
	1905A.4.
	
	
	
	Corrected chapter reference.
	

	11-16
	1905A.5 Detailed plain concrete structural walls. 1905.5.1
	
	
	
	Not permitted by OSHPD. Delete model code language.
	

	11-17
	1905A.6 Structural plain concrete.
1905.6.1, 1905.6.2
	
	
	
	Not permitted by OSHPD. Delete model code language.
	

	11-18
	1905A.7, 1905A.7.1 and 1905A.7.2
	
	
	
	Add “A” to numbers and editorial amendments.
	

	11-19
	1906A RESERVED.
FOOTINGS FOR LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION
	
	
	
	Reserve this section not adopted by OSHPD.
	

	11-20
	1908A.1 General.
1908A.2 Tests and inspections.
	
	
	
	Merge existing sections. Reference is added for clarity.
	

	11-21
	1908A.3
	
	
	
	Language moved to Section 1905A.19.
	

	11-22
	1909A RESERVED MODIFICATIONS TO ACI 318
through 1909A.1.10 1905A.1.11
	
	
	
	Amendments moved from 1905A to 1909A. Renumber 1905A.1 through 1905A.1.12 to 1909A.1 through 1909A.1.12 throughout the section.
	

	11-23
	1909A.1.11 1905A1.12
	
	
	
	Revise section to align with ACI 318 and use plain language.
	

	11-24
	1909A.1.12 1905A.1.13
	
	
	
	Repeal section. Reserve for DSA.
	

	11-25
	[bookmark: _Hlk164836770]1909A.1.14 1905A.1.15
1909A.1.15 1905A.1.16
1909A.17 1905A.1.17
	
	
	
	Renumbering.
	

	11-26
	1909A.1.16 ACI 318, Section 26.11.1.2.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing section.
	

	11-27
	1910A.5, 1910A.5.1, 1910A.5.2, 1910A.5.3, 1910A.5.3.1, 1910A.5.3.2,
1910A.5.4, 1910A.5.5
	
	
	
	Reorganize section and its subsections for ease of use. Revise language.
	

	11-28
	1911A.2
	
	
	
	Revise to adopt new standard.
	



ITEM 12
CHAPTER 20 ALUMINUM
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 20 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 12
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	12-1
	2001.1.1 and 2001.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial changes for clarification and to reflect change in organization name.
	

	12-2
	2001.1.3
	
	
	
	Added new section header.
	

	12-3
	2001.1.4 Reference to other chapters.
	
	
	
	Added amendment for consistency with other chapters.
	

	12-4
	2003 and 2003.1 Testing and Inspection.
	
	
	
	Revise sections.
	



ITEM 13
CHAPTER 21 MASONRY
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 21 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 13
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	13-1
	2101.1.1
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	13-2
	2101.1.2 & 2101.1.3
	
	
	
	Editorial changes. Language reorganized.
	

	13-3
	[bookmark: _Hlk157750462]2101.2.2 Prohibition.
	
	
	
	Add more prohibition items.
	

	13-4
	2103.1 Masonry units.
2103.6 Specified compressive strength of Masonry and Grout.
	
	
	
	OSHPD banner added. Existing strength limits consolidated to one section. Format is aligned with TMS 402 Table 4.3.1.
	

	13-5
	2104.2.2 TMS 602, …
	
	
	
	Revised section to align with TMS 602.
	

	13-6
	[bookmark: _Hlk157578495]2104.2.3 TMS 602, , Article 3.4 D 3.4 E Anchor bolts.
	
	
	
	Revise reference section numbers to match with TMS 402/602-22. Revise unit conversion.
	

	13-7
	2104.2.4 TMS 602, …
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	13-8
	2104.2.4 2104.2.5
	
	
	
	Renumber section. Add amendment.
	

	13-9
	2105.2 Compressive strength
	
	
	
	Requirements deleted.
	

	13-10
	2105.3 Mortar and grout tests.
	
	
	
	Remove some of the testing requirements.
	

	13-11
	2105.4 Masonry core testing.
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	13-12
	2106.1.1 TMS 402, …
	
	
	
	Revise to align with changes in TMS 402.
	

	13-13
	2106.1.2
	
	
	
	Revise references to align with changes in TMS 402.
	

	13-14
	2106.1.3
	
	
	
	Revise section for plain language.
	

	13-15
	2107.1 and 2108.1
	
	
	
	Remove references to deleted sections.
	

	13-16
	[bookmark: _Hlk157581015]2107.4 Reserved. TMS 402, Section 8.3.7, maximum bar size.
	
	
	
	Remove obsolete amendment and reserve this section.
	

	13-17
	2107.6 Modify TMS 402…
	
	
	
	Remove obsolete amendment.
	

	13-18
	2107.7 and 2108.4
	
	
	
	Delete obsolete amendments.
	


[bookmark: _Hlk163197369]
ITEM 14
CHAPTER 21A MASONRY
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 21 as Chapter 21A of the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 1 and 4. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 14
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	14-1
	2101A.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Change in the organization name.
	

	14-2
	2101A.1.3 Prohibition.
	
	
	
	Add more prohibition items.
	

	14-3
	[bookmark: _Hlk157585451]2103A.3.1 Aggregate.
	
	
	
	Revise reference section number to match TMS 602.
	

	14-4
	2103A.6 Specified compressive strength of Masonry and Grout.
	
	
	
	New section to consolidate language from multiple sections.
	

	14-5
	2104A.1.3.1 TMS 602, …
	
	
	
	Repeal section and reserve for DSA.
	

	14-6
	2104A.1.3.3
	
	
	
	Revise section to align with TMS 602.
	

	14-7
	[bookmark: _Hlk157587097][bookmark: _Hlk157585720]2104A.1.3.4 TMS 602, Article 3.4 D 3.4 E Anchor bolts.
	
	
	
	Revise reference section numbers to match with TMS 602-22.
	

	14-8
	2104A.1.3.5 and 2104A.1.3.6
	
	
	
	Repeal amendments and reserve sections for DSA.
	

	14-9
	[bookmark: _Hlk161993604]2104A.1.3.7 Reserved.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	14-10
	2104A.1.3.8
	
	
	
	Added missing language.
	

	14-11
	2104A.1.3.9
	
	
	
	Revise section to make language mandatory.
	

	14-12
	2104A.1.3.10.2 
	
	
	
	Revise amendment to align with TMS 402.
	

	14-13
	[bookmark: _Hlk157587143]2104A.1.3.10.3
	
	
	
	Revise reference numbers to match TMS 602.
	

	14-14
	2104A.1.3.10.4
	
	
	
	Language clarified to align with TMS 602.
	

	14-15
	2104A.1.3.10.5
	
	
	
	Revise section to align with TMS 602.
	

	14-16
	2104A.1.3.10.6 TMS 602, Article 3.5 C Grout pour height.
	
	
	
	Repeal section.
	

	14-17
	2104A.1.3.11.1
	
	
	
	Revise section to align with TMS 602.
	

	14-18
	2104A.1.3.11.2 TMS 602, Article 3.5 B Confinement.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment partially repealed and new amendments added.
	

	14-19
	2105A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Reference corrected.
	

	14-20
	2105A.2 Compressive strength
	
	
	
	Delete language.
	

	14-21
	2105A.3 Mortar and grout tests.
	
	
	
	Add language to remove requirement for site testing.
	

	14-22
	2105A.4 Masonry core testing.
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	14-23
	2106A.1.1
	
	
	
	Revised section to align with TMS 402.
	

	14-24
	2106A.1.2
	
	
	
	Revised section to align with TMS 402.
	

	14-25
	2106A.1.3 TMS 402, Section 7.3.2.5
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	14-26
	2106A.1.4 2106A.1.3
	
	
	
	Renumber section. Editorial changes.
	

	14-27
	2107A.5 Modify TMS402 …
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	14-28
	2107A.6 and 2108A.4
	
	
	
	Repeal amendments.
	



ITEM 15
CHAPTER 22 STEEL
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 22 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 15
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	15-1
	2201.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	15-2
	2201.1.2 and 2201.1.3
	
	
	
	Editorial change. Sections and sentences reorganized for consistency.
	

	15-3
	2201.1.4 Amendments
	
	
	
	Deleted amendment with redundant pointer.
	

	15-4
	2201.4.1 2204.1.1
	
	
	
	Renumber to align with model reorganization.
	

	15-5
	2201.5.1 2204.4 Shear transfer at column Column base plate.
	
	
	
	Renumber to align with model reorganization, add pointer to ACI 318. Editorial reorganization.
	

	15-6
	2202.1 General.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment. Editorial changes.
	

	15-7
	2202.2.1
	
	
	
	Amendments relocated.
	

	15-8
	2202.2.1.2 Seismic Design …
	
	
	
	Amendment relocated.
	

	15-9
	2202.2.2 Structural steel elements.
	
	
	
	Added amendment to section.
	

	15-10
	2202.3 2205.3 Modifications to AISC 341 and subsections
	
	
	
	Renumber sections and add editorial modifications.
	

	15-11
	2202.4 2205.4 Modifications to AISC 358
	
	
	
	Renumber sections and its subsections.
	

	15-12
	2205.4.1 Design Requirements
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	15-13
	2202.4.1
	
	
	
	New section to relocate existing amendment.
	

	15-14
	2202.4.2 2205.4.2
	
	
	
	Renumber and add new exception.
	

	15-15
	2202.4.3 2205.4.3
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise language.
	

	15-16
	2202.4.4
	
	
	
	Add new section.
	

	15-17
	2202.4.5
	
	
	
	Add new section.
	

	15-18
	2204.1 General.
	
	
	
	Amendment in existing section is repealed.
	

	15-19
	2204.2 Seismic design.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment relocated.
	

	15-20
	2206.1.1.2, 2206.1.3, 2206.2, 2207.4, 2207.6, 2208.1, 2214.1, 2216.1
	
	
	
	Relocated amendments to align with reorganization of chapter.
	

	15-21
	2216.2 2213.2 Tests of end welded studs.
	
	
	
	Revise section to align with AWS D1.1.
	



ITEM 16
CHAPTER 22A STEEL
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 22 as Chapter 22A of the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 1 and 4. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 16
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	16-1
	2201A.1.1 and 2201A.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	16-2
	2201A.2 through 2201A.5
	
	
	
	Addopt new sections added to 2024 IBC.
	

	16-3
	2201A.4.1 2204A.1.1
	
	
	
	Renumber to align with model reorganization.
	

	16-4
	2201A.5.1 2204A.4 Shear transfer at column Column base plate
	
	
	
	Renumber to align with model reorganization, add pointer to ACI 318. Editorial reorganization.
	

	16-5
	2202A
2202A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing exceptions from other section.
	

	16-6
	2202A.2 Seismic design.
	
	
	
	Added “A” for correct Chapter reference.
	

	16-7
	2202A.2.1
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment from other section.
	

	16-8
	2202A.2.1.1
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment from other section. Delete model language.
	

	16-9
	2202A.2.1.2
	
	
	
	Retain existing amendment.
	

	16-10
	2202A.2.2 Structural Steel Elements.
	
	
	
	Delete references Seismic Design Categories B and C. Align requirements with other amendments.
	

	16-11
	2202A.3 2205A.4 Modifications to AISC 341. 2205A.4.1 Glossary.
	
	
	
	Renumber existing section. Delete definition.
	

	16-12
	2202A.3.1 2205A.4.2
	
	
	
	Renumber with editorial changes.
	

	16-13
	2202A.3.2 2205A.4.3
	
	
	
	Renumber.
	

	16-14
	2205A.4.4
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-15
	2205A.4.5
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-16
	2205A.4.6
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-17
	2205A.4.7
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-18
	2205A.4.8
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-19
	2205A.4.9
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-20
	2205A.4.10
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	16-21
	2202A.4 2205A.5
Modifications to AISN 358
	
	
	
	Renumber section and subsections.
	

	16-22
	2205A.5.1
	
	
	
	Repeal prohibition on use of bolted moment connections.
	

	16-23
	2202A.4.1
	
	
	
	New section to relocate existing amendment.
	

	16-24
	2202A.4.2 2205A.5.2
	
	
	
	Renumber and add exception.
	

	16-25
	2202A.4.3 2205A.5.3
	
	
	
	Renumber with additional changes.
	

	16-26
	2202A.4.4
	
	
	
	Added new section.
	

	16-27
	2202A.4.5
	
	
	
	Added new section.
	

	16-28
	2203A and 2203A.1
	
	
	
	Adopt new model sections.
	

	16-29
	2204A.1
	
	
	
	Existing amendment repealed. Delete pointer.
	

	16-30
	2204.2 Seismic design
	
	
	
	Model code section not adopted and deleted.
	

	16-31
	2204.2.1
	
	
	
	Model code section not adopted and deleted.
	

	16-32
	2204.2.2
	
	
	
	Model code section not adopted and deleted.
	

	16-33
	2205A and 2205A.1
	
	
	
	Adopt new model code sections.
	

	16-34
	2206A, 2206A.1, and 2206A.1.1
	
	
	
	Existing model sections renumbered in 2024 IBC. No change proposed.
	

	16-35
	2206A.1.1.1
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment.
	

	16-36
	2206A.1.1.2
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment.
	

	16-37
	2206A.1.2 Prescriptive framing.
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment.
	

	16-38
	2206A.1.3
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment. 
	

	16-39
	2206A.2
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment.
	

	16-40
	2206A.3 Cutting and notching.
	
	
	
	Adopt new model code section.
	

	16-41
	[bookmark: _Hlk161143241]2207A.4 and 2207A.6
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendments.
	

	16-42
	2208A STEEL DECK
	
	
	
	Adopt new model code section.
	

	16-43
	2208A.1
	
	
	
	Relocated existing amendment.
	

	16-44
	2210A through 2213A
	
	
	
	Addopt new model code sections and subsections.
	

	16-45
	2214A.1
	
	
	
	Carry forward existing amendment.
	

	16-46
	2213A 2216A
	
	
	
	Renumber section and subsections.
	

	16-47
	2216A.1 2213A.1 and 2216A.2 2213A.2
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise to align with AWS D1.1. Add exemption.
	



ITEM 17
CHAPTER 23 WOOD
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 23 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 17
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	17-1
	2301.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	17-2
	2301.1.2 and 2301.1.3
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	17-3
	2301.1.4 2301.1.3 and subsections
	
	
	
	Renumber section and subsections.
	

	17-4
	2301.1.5 2301.1.4 Prohibition.
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise pointer.
	

	17-5
	2303.1.4.1 Additional requirements.
	
	
	
	Editorial change for consistency in terminology.
	

	17-6
	2305.1.3 2305.1.2
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise pointer.
	

	17-7
	2308.2 and 2308.2.8 2308.2.7
	
	
	
	Renumber and revise pointers.
	



ITEM 18
CHAPTER 24 GLASS AND GLAZING
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 24 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications. 
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 18
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	18-1
	2401.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Organization name change.
	

	18-2
	2401.1.2 Amendments in this …
	
	
	
	Editorial amendments for clarifications.
	

	18-3
	2410.1.3 Monitoring.
	
	
	
	Editorial amendments for use of plain language.
	



ITEM 19
CHAPTER 25 GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCTS AND PLASTER
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 25 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5  and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 19
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	19-1
	2501.1.1 Application.
	
	
	
	Organization name change.
	

	19-2
	2501.1.2 Amendments in this …
	
	
	
	Editorial amendments for clarifications.
	

	19-3
	2503.2
	
	
	
	Editorial amendments for use of plain language.
	

	19-4
	2507.3 Lath attachment to horizontal wood supports.
	
	
	
	Revise existing amendment to align with Section 2510.3. Delete exception.
	



ITEM 20
CHAPTER 26 PLASTIC
[bookmark: _Hlk165879968][bookmark: _Hlk163198061]Adopt the 2024 International Building Code Chapter 26 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 without amendments. Repeal all existing OSHPD amendments in this chapter.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 20
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	20-1
	2601.1.1, 2601.1.2, 2603.11.1, 2603.12.3, 2603.13.3
	
	
	
	Repeal all OSHPD amendments. 
	


[bookmark: _Hlk158975545]
ITEM 21
CHAPTERS 27, 28 AND 29
OSHPD does not adopt 2024 IBC Chapters 27, 28 and 29.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 21
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	21-1
	CHAPTERS 27, 28 and 29
	
	
	
	OSHPD does not adopt Chapters 27, 28 and 29.
	



ITEM 22
CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
Adopt 2024 International Building Code Chapter 30 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing amendment without modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 22
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	22-1
	Chapter 30
	
	
	
	Adopt Chapter 30 and carry forward existing amendments without modifications.
	



ITEM 23
CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION
Adopt the 2024 International Building Code Chapter 31 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6. Add new amendment as follows.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 23
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	23-1
	3114 INTERMODAL INTERMODAL SHIPPING CONTAINERS
	
	
	
	Add new amendment to clarify applicability.
	




[bookmark: _Hlk75509760]ITEM 24
CHAPTER 31D FOOD ESTABLISHMENTS
OSHPD does not adopt Chapter 31D.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 24
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	24-1
	Chapter 31D
	
	
	
	OSHPD does not adopt Chapters 31D
	



ITEM 25
CHAPTER 32 ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT OF WAY
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 32 for OSHPD 1 and 4 without modification.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 25
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	25-1
	Chapter 32
	
	
	
	Adopt Chapter 32 for OSHPD 1 and 4.
	



ITEM 26
CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION
Adopt 2024IBC Chapter 33 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 without modification.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 26
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	26-1
	Chapter 33
	
	
	
	Adopt Chapter 33 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6.
	



ITEM 27
CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS
Adopt 2024 IBC Chapter 35 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 and carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendments with the following modifications.
	[bookmark: _Hlk163199732]OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 27
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	27-1
	ACI 355.2 - 19 22
ACI 355.4—19 (21):
ACI 440.2R-08 17:
ACI 503.7—07:
ACI 506.2-13 (18):
ACI 506.4R – 94 19:
ACI 506.6T—17:
ACI 548.15-20:
	
	
	
	Update reference standards to align with changes in other chapters and propose editorial modifications.
	

	27-2
	ANSI/AISC 358—22:
	
	
	
	Editorial updates.
	

	27-3
	ASCE/SEI 7-2022
ASCE/SEI 37-2017
ASCE/SEI 41-2013
ASCE/SEI 41-2023
	
	
	
	Update reference standards to align with changes in other chapters and propose editorial modifications. 
	

	27-4
	ASHRAE 171-2027
	
	
	
	Added new ASHRAE standard.
	

	27-5
	ASTM A615/A615M - 20 22:
ASTM A706/A706M- 2016 22a:
ASTM A722/A722M - 2015:
ASTM A722/A722M - 2018:
ASTM A1064 - 17 22:
ASTM C618 – 15 23e1
ASTM C635/C635M - 13a:
ASTM C635/C635M – 2017 22:
ASTM C989—16e1 22:
ASTM C1019 - 16 20:
ASTM C1249—18 (2023):
ASTM C1401 - 14 23:
ASTM C1586 - 05(2011) 20:
ASTM C1823/C1823M – 20:
ASTM D1586 - 20 18e1:
ASTM D3966 - 07(2013) 22:
ASTM E580/E580M – 17 22:
ASTM F606/F606M - 16 21:
	
	
	
	Update reference standards to align with changes in other chapters and propose editorial modifications.
	

	27-6
	ANSI/AWC NDS-2024:
	
	
	
	Update edition of the supplement.
	

	27-7
	AWS B5.1 - 2013-AMD1:
AWS D1.1/D1.1M – 15 20:
AWS D1.3/D1.3M - 08 2018:
AWS D1.4/D1.4M - 2018-AMD1:
AWS D1.6/D1.6M – 2017:
AWS D1.8/D1.8M - 2016 2021:
AWS QC1 - 2016:
	
	
	
	Update reference standards to align with changes in other chapters and propose editorial modifications.
	

	27-8
	FM 1950 - 2016 2022:
	
	
	
	Update reference standard edition.
	

	27-9
	ICC 1200-2021:
ICC 1205-2021:
ICC 300—201723:
ICC-ES AC 01 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 58 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 70 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 106 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 125 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 156 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 178 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 193 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 232 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 308 - 21 24**:
ICC-ES AC 358 - 21 24**:
[bookmark: _Hlk154056438]ICC-ES AC 446 - 21 24*:
	
	
	
	Update reference standards to align with changes in other chapters.
	

	27-10
	FEMA P-2082—1
	
	
	
	Repeal referenced standard.
	

	27-11
	PCI MNL 120—17:
	
	
	
	Revise referenced sections.
	



[bookmark: _Hlk71537146][bookmark: _Hlk75786151]ITEM 28
APPENDICES A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, I, and J
OSHPD does not adopt Appendices A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, I and J of the 2024 IBC.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 28
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	28-1
	Appendices A through J
	
	
	
	OSHPD does not Appendices A through J.
	



ITEM 29
APPENDIX K
[bookmark: _Hlk167873943]OSHPD does not adopt Appendix K of the 2024 IBC. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendment Appendix K into the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 2.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 29
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	29-1
	APPENDIX K ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS GROUP R-3 AND GROUP R-3.1 OCCUPANCIES …
	
	
	
	OSHPD does not adopt Appendix K of the 2024 IBC. Carry forward existing 2022 CBC amendment Appendix K into the 2025 CBC for OSHPD 2
	



ITEM 30
APPENDIX L EARTHQUAKE RECORDING INSTRUMENTATION
Adopt 2024 IBC Appendix L for OSHPD 1 and 4 and carry forward existing amendments without modifications.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 30
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	30-1
	Appendix L
	
	
	
	Adopt Appendix L for OSHPD 1 and 4 and carry forward existing amendments without modifications.
	



[bookmark: _Hlk75787093]ITEM 31
APPENDICES M, N, O, and P
OSHPD does not adopt Appendices M, N, O and P of the 2024 IBC.
	OSHPD 05/24
ITEM 31
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	31-1
	Appendices M, N, O and P
	
	
	
	OSHPD does not adopt Appendices M, N, O and P
	



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 11/22) Commission Action Matrix	June 25, 2024
OSHPD 05/24 - Part 2 Vol 2 - 2024 Triennial Code Cycle	CAM - Initial
Office Of Statewide Hospital Planning and Development	Page 1 of 1
