COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX - GREEN
2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 2 VOLUME 2, 2021 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

AGENCY: OFFICE OF STATEWIDE HEALTH PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT (OSHPD 06/21)

LEGEND:

CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required

Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw

CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required

STRUCTURAL DESIGN/LATERAL FORCES (SDLF) CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE - JULY 28 & 29, 2021

CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN

Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 16 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3 and 5 and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the following modifications:

Item Number 1 Code Section ACP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
ction Response Action
1605.2
OSHPD 06/21-1-1 (Formerly Approve Accept Amend section regarding load combinations.
1605A.3.2)
TABLE Amend Table and footnote ¢ regarding ASCE
OSHPD 06/21-1-2 1613.2.3(1), Approve Accept 7
footnote ¢ '
TABLE Amend Table and footnote ¢ regarding ASCE
OSHPD 06/21-1-3 1613.2.3(2), Approve Accept 7
footnote ¢ '

CHAPTER 16A STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 16, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC Chapter 16A amendments for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:

. CAC Agency . . CBSC
Item Number 2 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
OSHPD 06/21-2-1 16054.2 Amend section regarding ASCE 7 and load
(Formerly Approve Accept combinations
1605A.3.2) '
OSHPD 06/21-2-2 1605A.3 Renumber sub sections per model code
Approve Accept -
(Renumbered) revisions.
OSHPD 06/21-2-3 1605A.3.1 Renumber sub sections per model code
Approve Accept -
(Renumbered) revisions.
OSHPD 06/21-2-4 1605A.3.2 Renumber sub sections per model code
Approve Accept -
(Renumbered) revisions.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix

OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 1 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




Item Number 2 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-2-5 1606A.6 Renumber sub sections per model code
Approve Accept -
(Renumbered) revisions.
OSHPD 06/21-2-6 1607A.14.4.5 Renumber sub sections per model code
Approve Accept -
(Renumbered) revisions.
OSHPD 06/21-2-7 1607A.14.5 Renumber sub sections per model code
Approve Accept -
(Renumbered) revisions.
OSHPD 06/21-2-8 1607A.16 Apbrove Accent Model code Section renumbered. Editorial
(Renumbered) PP P revision regarding allowable stress design.
OSHPD 06/21-2-9 Editorial revision regarding reference to
16074.19 Approve Accept Section 1605.3 for load combinations.
OSHPD 06/21-2-10 TABLE .
1613.2.3(1), Approve Accept ¢mend Table and footnote ¢ regarding ASCE
footnote ¢ '
OSHPD 06/21-2-11 TABLE .
1613.2.3(2), Approve Accept ?mend Table and footnote ¢ regarding ASCE
footnote ¢ '

CHAPTER 16A STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 16, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC Chapter 16A amendments for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:

Item Number 3 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1617A.1.3 Proposed new amendment to section
OSHPD 06/213-1 | (Formerly | Approve | Accept regarding ASCE 7, Section 11.4 and load
combinations. Coordinate hyphen in term
Reserved) o et
multi-period.
1617A.1.5
OSHPD 06/21-3-2 ASCE 7, Approve Accept Proposed new amendment.
(New)
1617A.1.5.1
OSHPD 06/21-3-3 ASCE 7, Approve Accept Proposed new amendment
Section 12.2.3. | "PP P P '
(New)
1617A.1.5.2 Reformat and revise number sub sections per
OSHPD 06/21-3-4 (Formally Approve Accept P
1617A.1.5) proposed new amendments.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

December 9, 2021
Page 2 of 23
OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 3 Code Section ACP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
ction Response Action
OSHPD proposes amending this subsection
1617A.1.5.3 regarding ASCE 7, Section 12.2.3.2 item a
ASCE 7, and adding items f, g and h.
OSHPD 06/21-3-5 Section Approve Accept OSHPD proposes to relocate 1617A1.6,
12.2.3.2. requirement fto 1617A.1.5.3 as item h.
(New) Post CAC: OSHPD Banner moved to end of
line item f.
OSHPD 06/21-3-6 1617A.1.6 Approve Accept Proposes to have Section 1617A.1.6
Reserved Reserved.
1617A.1.10,
ASCE 7, OSHPD Proposes Exception 2 regarding
OSHPD 06/21-3-7 Section Approve Accept structures having horizontal structural
12.3.3.1. irregularities.
Exceptions:
1617A.1.14
Repeal “Reserved” and relocate amendment
OSHPD 06/21-3-8 (Formally Approve Accept text from 1617A.1.15.
Reserved)
1617A.1.15
ASCE 7,
OSHPD 06/21-3-9 Section Approve Accept Renumber 1617A.1.16 to 1617A.1.15.
12.13.1.
(Renumbered)
1617A.1.16
ASCE 7, OSHPD proposes to modify ASCE 7 section
OSHPD 06/21-3-10 Section Approve | Accept 12.13.9.2 and amend item b.
12.13.9.2.
1617A.1.18 Renumbering ASCE section and revise
OSHPD 06/21-3-11 ASCE 7, Approve Accept OSHPD banner to remove 1R.
Section 13.1.4. Add Item 10.
1617A.1.26
OSHPD 06/21-3-12 ASC’T: 7 Approve Accept Amend Item 1.
Section
13.6.7.3.
1617A.1.27
OSHPD 06/21-3-13 éSCI? 7, Approve Accept Amend regarding elevatqr guide rail supports
ection and allowable stress design load.
13.6.11.1.1
1617A.1.28
ASCE 7, Amend Item 1 and Item 6 regarding retainer
OSHPD 06/21-3-14 Section Approve | Accept plates and allowable stress design load.
13.6.11.4

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 3 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




CHAPTER 17 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS

Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 17 for OSHPD 1R, 2 and 5 with the following modifications:

Item Number 4 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1705.3.9 Shoftcrete. . .
OSHPD 06/21-4-1 (Formerly 1705.19) Approve Accept Reformat and revise numbered sub sections.
1705.3.9.1
OSHPD 06/21-4-2 (Formerly Approve Accept Reformat and revise numbered sub sections.
1705.19.1)
Proposed new amendment regarding
shotcrete mockup test panels.
OSHPD 06/21-4-3 17&5;;‘;"2 Fs“t’l:';er Accept CAC Criteria #1.
y Post CAC: Sentence relocated regarding No.
5 bars. Coordinated with DSA.
Reformat and revise numbered sub sections
per proposed new amendment to the
1705.5.5, ;);ceep;;ic:)r:] ;egardlng laminated timber
OSHPD 06/21-4-4 Exception Approve Accept P '
(Renumbered) Post Public Comment Periods:
OSHPD corrected the Express Terms text to
align with Section 1705A.5.5.

CHAPTER 17A SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 17, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC Chapter 17A amendments for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:

Item Number 5 Code Section ACAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
ction Response Action
Editorial revisions to coordinate with model
OSHPD 06/21-5-1 1704A.5 Approve Accept code reformatting and renumbering.
Amend references in ltems 4 and 7.
OSHPD 06/21-5-2 1705A.2.1 Approve Accept Editorial amendments.
Structural steel.
Proposed new amendments revising Tables
1705A2.1 and Table 1705A3. Amend footnote
Further a to correct reference to Section 1705A.13.
OSHPD 06/21-5-3 | TABLE 1705A.2.1 Study Accept CAC Criteria #1.
Post CAC: Item 1c CBC reference re-
sequenced in table cell.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

December 9, 2021
Page 4 of 23
OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 5 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Amend footnote a to correct reference to
OSHPD 06/21-5-4 | TABLE 1705A.2.3 | Approve Accept Section 1705413,
OSHPD 06/21-5-5 1705A.2.5 Approve Accept Editorial amendment.
Editorial amendment.
Further Criteria #1. CAC
OSHPD 06/21-5-6 1705A.2.6 stud Accept Post CAC: Rearranged item 1.c CBC
y references, for Section 1705A.2.6 by adding
OSHPD banner. Coordinated with DSA.
Proposed new amendments revising Tables
TABLE 1705A2.1 and Table 1705A3.
OSHPD 06/21-5-7 17054.3 Approve Accept Post CAC: CAC recommendation for editorial
) correction to section reference in item 14 in
the table.
OSHPD 06/21-5-8 170§A.3.2 Approve Accept Editorial amendment and revised code
Material tests. reference.
1705A.3.9
OSHPD 06/21-5-9 ?I?:rt;ﬁtlz Approve Accept Reformat and revise numbered sub sections.
1705A.19)
1705A.3.9.1
OSHPD 06/21-5-10 (Formerly Approve Accept Reformat and revise numbered sub sections.
1705A.19.1)
Proposed new amendment regarding
shotcrete mockup test panels.
1705A.3.9.2 Relocated requirements from deleted model
Preconstruction Further code and incorporation of amendments
OSHPD 06/21-5-11 fests. Study | Aceept Chapters 19 and 19A.
(New) Criteria #1. CAC
Post CAC: Coordinated with DSA. Reformat
of sentence regarding No. 5 rebar.
1705A.5.3 Mass
OSHPD 06/21-5-12 timber Approve Accept Editorial amendment.
construction.
Editorial amendment to denote A in the Title
OSHPD 06/21-5-13 | TABLE 1705A.5.3 | Approve Accept for Table 1705A.5.3.
" Relocating 3.1-3.5 item numbering from
OSHPD 06/21-5-14 | TABLE 1705A.5.3 | Approve Accept repealed Table 1705457,

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 5 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 5 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Reformat and revise numbered sub sections
1705A.5.5 per proposed new amendment to the
OSHPD 06/21-5-15 (Renumbered) Approve Accept exception regarding laminated timber
inspections.
Repeal of Mass Timber and Tall Wood
1705A.5.7 California amendments to coordinate with
OSHPD 06/21-5-16 (Repealed) Approve Accept other agencies and the 2021 ICC model
adoption of those provisions.
TABLE 1705A.5.7 Repeal of Mass Timber and Tall Wood
OSHPD 06/21-5-17 (Repealed) Approve Accept amendment — adopt model.
OSHPD 06/21-5-18 1705A.6.3 Vibro Approve Accept Amend section reference.
stone columns.
1705A.8.1
OSHPD 06/21-5-19 | Micropile tests. Approve Accept New amendment.
(New)
1705A.9.1 Helical
OSHPD 06/21-5-20 pile tests. Approve Accept New amendment.
(New)
Editorial renumbering amendment to denote A
OSHPD 06/21-5-21 1705A.10 Approve Accept for this section in Chapter 17A.
1705A.13.4 .
OSHPD 06/21-5-22 Approve Accept Renumber and amend section reference.
(Renumbered)
1705A.13.5
OSHPD 06/21-5-23 (Renumbered) Approve Accept Renumbered.
1705A.13.5.1
OSHPD 06/21-5-24 (Renumbered) Approve Accept Renumbered.
OSHPD 06/21-5-25 170(5&%.5.2 Approve Accept New amendment.
1705A.13.14.2
OSHPD 06/21-5-26 (Renumbered) Approve Accept Renumbered.
OSHPD 06/21-5-27 1705A.13.14.2.1 Approve Accept New amendment regarding structural sealant
(New) glazing testing .
1705A.20 Repeal of Mass Timber and Tall Wood
OSHPD 06/21-5-28 (Repealed) Approve Accept amendment — adopt model.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

December 9, 2021
Page 6 of 23
OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



CHAPTER 18 SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 18 for OSHPD 1R, 2 and 5 and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the following modifications:

Item Number 6 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
a Amend section regarding helical piles and
OSHPD 06/21-6-1 1810.3.1.5.1. Approve Accept seismic requirements.
1810.3.3.1.9
OSHPD 06/21-6-2 Helical piles., | Approve Accept Amend #3 to include OSHPD banners.
#3
?rl?::sf Amend Exceptions to include OSHPD
OSHPD 06/21-6-3 concrete Piles. Approve Accept banners. Relocate Exception from
. 1810.3.8.3.4.
Exceptions
1810.3.104.1 Editorial amendment and code reference
OSHPD 06/21-6-4 Seismic Approve Accept undate
requirements. pdate.
1810.3.11.2 Amend #3 Exception 2 to include OSHPD
Seismic Design banners.
OSHPD 06/21-6-5 Categories D Approve | Accept Post CAC: OSHPD coordinated location of
through F. banner.
1810.3.12 Amend Exception to include OSHPD banners
OSHPD 06121-6-6 | & 240 peams, | APPrOve | Accept and reference to ACI standards.
1811.3 Amend Item 7 to include 2 year compliance to
OSHPD 06/21-6-7 Geotfechnlcal Approve Accept corrosion requirement,
requirements.
1811.4
OSHPD 06/21-6-8 Structural Approve Accept Amend Item 3 to include reference to ASCE 7.
Requirements.
OSHPD 06/21-6-9 181241 | Approve | Accept Amend em 6 extend temporary anchor
OSHPD 06/21-6-10 1812.4.2 Approve Accept Amend Item 2 to mclude reference to ASCE 7
for structural requirements.

CHAPTER 18A SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
SECTION 1807A FOUNDATION WALLS, RETAINING WALLS AND EMBEDDED POSTS AND POLES
SECTION 1808A FOUNDATIONS

Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 18, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Sections 1807A and 1808A for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following

modifications:
Item Number 7 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1807A.2.5 Renumber and update reference to ASCE 7,
OSHPD 06/21-7-1 (Renumbered) Approve | Accept Section 15.6.8 and add OSHPD banners.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix

OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle

California Building Standards Commission

Page 7 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 7 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1808A.8.2 Update reference to Standard ACI 318,
OSHPD 0621-7-2 | oo rete cover, | APPFOVE | Accept Section 20.5.1.3.5.
OSHPD 06/21-7-3 1;&3"5 9 Approve Accept Update references to Standard ACI 318.

CHAPTER 18A SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
SECTION 1810A DEEP FOUNDATIONS

Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 18, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Section 1810A for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:

Item Number 8 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1810A.3.1.5.1 Editorial update regarding helical piles and
OSHPD 06/21-8-1 | L osnr o a4 0 Approve Accept seismic requirements in section 1617A.1.15
1810A.3.3.1.9 .
and repeal part of item 3.
1810A.3.6 i
OSHPD 06/21-8-2 Splices. Approve Accept Repeal Exception.
18104.3.8 Repeal Exceptions
OSHPD 06/21-8-3 Precast Approve | Accept Relocate Exception from 1810A.3.8.3.4.
concrete piles.
1810.3.8.1
OSHPD 06/21-8-4 | Reinforcement. | Approve Accept Repeal subsection.
(Repealed)
o Repeal reference to Design Category C and
OSHPD 06/21-8-5 1810A.3.9.4 Approve Accept Section 1810A3.9.4 1.
OSHPD 06/21-8-6 | 1810A.3.9.41 | Approve | Accept gepea' model reference to Design Category
18104.3.10.4 Editorial revisions and update reference to
OSHPD 06/21-8-7 | Seismic Approve | Accept ACI Standard 318, Section 18.13.5
requirements.
1810A.3.11.2
Seismic Design Amend compliance requirement #3 to repeal
OSHPD 06/21-8-8 Categories D Approve Accept Exception #2.
through F.
OSHPD 06/21-8-9 1810A.3.12 Approve Accept Amend Exception to include reference to ACI

Grade beams.

Standard 318, Section 18.13.3.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 8 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




CHAPTER 18A SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
SECTION 1811A PRESTRESSED ROCK AND SOIL FOUNDATION ANCHORS

Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 18, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Section 1811A for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:

Item Number 9 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1811A.3 . .
OSHPD 06/21-9-1 Geotechnical Approve Accept Amenq ltem 7 .to include 2 year compliance to
) corrosion requirement.
requirements.
1811A.4
OSHPD 06/21-9-2 Structural Approve Accept Amend Item 3 to include reference to ASCE 7.
Requirements.
CHAPTER 18A SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
SECTION 1812A EARTH RETAINING
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 18, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Section 1812A for OSHPD 1 and 4, with the following
modifications:
Item Number 10 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-10-1 | 1812441 | Approve | Accept Amend ltem 6 extend temporary anchor
service life.
OSHPD 06/21-10-2 1812A.4.2 Approve Accept Amend ltem 2 to mclude reference to ASCE 7
for structural requirements.
OSHPD06/21-10-3 | 1812443 | Approve | Accept Relocate ltems 2 and 3 to Section 18124.5,
ltems 15 and 16, respectively.
Amend item 13 to reference Section 1812A41,
OSHPD 06/21-10-4 1812A.5 Approve Accept Item 7. Relocate ltems 2 and 3 to Section
1812A.5, Items 15 and 16, respectively.
Amend section regarding periodic visits to job
sites.
* Post CAC: OSHPD Disagrees with CAC
. approval. In further review and coordination,
OSHPD 06/21-10-5 1812A.6 Approve | Accept OSHPD requested (and DSA agreed) to
remove a phrase from the Express Terms
based on Criteria #1 and related to other CAC
recommendations for Further Study. See
Section 1910A.5.5.
Repeal adoption and remove banners from
OSHPD 06/21-10-6 1812A.7 Approve Accept Section 1812A.7.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 9 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



CHAPTER 18A SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS
SECTION 1813A VIBRO STONE COLUMNS FOR GROUND IMPROVEMENT
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 18, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Section 1813A for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:

Item Number 11 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-11-1 1813A.3 Approve Accept Amend ltem 2 to repeal phrase referring to
deep foundation elements.
Add Item 6 regarding reference to Section
OSHPD 06/21-11-2 1813A.5 Approve Accept 1813A.2, Item 9.
CHAPTER 19 CONCRETE
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 19 for OSHPD 1R, 2 and 5, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the following modifications
Item Number 12 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Amend Section to include new Exception ltem
1901.3.4.3 Test %rgesri::&g 2B. Further Study based on
OSHPD 06/21-12-1 Frequepcy, Further Study Accept Post CAC: Re-word amendment for dlarity
Exceptions . : T
regarding grammar and intent to align with
DSA amendment.
Amend Section regarding anchor embedment
OSHPD 06/21-12-1.1 1901.3.4.5 T.est. Approve Accept depth and add a new Exception under #1
acceptance criteria. Hydraulic ram method.
ltem 12.1 added during CAC.
OSHPD 06/21-12-2 1905.1'.7 ACI 318, Approve Accept Add OSHPD panners. New amendment
Section 14.1.4 regarding plain concrete.
Amend Item 6 to include reference to ACI for
OSHPD 06/21-12-3 1908.1 General. Approve Accept structural requirements.
Post CAC: Include ACI to reference 506.4R.
New amendment to section regarding
OSHPD 06/21-12-4 1908.2_Tests and Approve Accept shotcrete application and references to ACI
Inspections. (New)
318 standards.
OSHPD 06/21-12-5 | 1908.3 (Renumbered) Approve Accept Renumbered from 1908.11.
1908.12 Placing.
OSHPD 06/21-12-6 [OSHPD 1R, 2 & 5] Approve Accept Repeal subsection.
(Repealed)
1910.3.4 ACI 318, Amend Table 21.2.2 for Net tensile strain.
OSHPD 06/21-12-7 Table 21.2.2. Approve Accept Amend footnote 2

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 10 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




CHAPTER 19A CONCRETE
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 19, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Chapter 19A for OSHPD 1 & 4 with the following modifications:

. CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 13 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
* This item was not reviewed by CAC.
Post CAC: OSHPD coordination effort with
) DSA as part of Further Study of sub-items in
1901A.2 Reinforced * * ltem 13. OSHPD has added this section to the

*
OSHPD 06/21-13-0 concrete. Express Terms. BSC has assigned an Item

number to include this section for review by
the Commission. Associated with Item 13-4

below.
* ltem was a correction to CAM discussed
1903A.2 Special at CAC and Approve as Submitted.
OSHPD 06/21-13-0.1* inspectigns. Approve Accept Post CAC: No amendment is proposed.

BSC has assigned an Item number to match
Express Terms.

4. Update ACI 318 reference from Section
OSHPD 06/21-13-1 1903A.8 Approve Accept 26.6.4.1(b) to Section 26.6.4.2(b)

Update reference from Section 1905A.1.15 10

OSHPD 06/21-13-2 1905A.1 General. Approve Accept Section 1905A.1.17.
1905A.1.3 ACI 318, Modify format and amend section to add Items
OSHPD 06/21-13-3 Section 9.6.1.3. Approve Accept 1and 2.
* Post CAC: BSC added this item to the
1905A.1.8 ACI 318, CAM to coordinate with the Express Terms.
OSHPD 06/21-13-4.1* Section 17.10. * * B$C hag assigned an Itgm number to include
this section for a correction to a referenced
section in ACI 318.
1905A.1.9
1905A.1.10 Renumber from_1905A.1.10 to 1905A.1.9

OSHPD 06/21-13-5 Approve Accept Renumber from_1905A.1.11 to 1905A.1.10

1905A.1.11 Renumber from_1905A.1.12 to 1905A.1.11.
(Renumbered)
1905A.1.12 ACI 318,
Section 19.2.1.1 and Renumber from_1905A.1.9 to 1905A.1.12.
OSHPD 06/21-13-6 Table 19.2.1.1. Approve Accept Reorganization of provisions.
Renumbered)
1905A.1.13 ACI 318, Amend Table 21.2.2 for Net tensile strain.
OSHPD 06/21-13-7 Table 21.2.2 Approve Accept Amend footnote 2
Language added back in regarding previously
1905A.1.15 ACI 318, . X
OSHPD 06/21-13-8 Section 25.2.10. Approve Accept delete.d language from IBC for spirally tied
rebar in columns.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix December 9, 2021
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle Page 11 of 23

California Building Standards Commission OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 13 Code Section CP:C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
1905A.1.16 ACI 318, Text Relocated from 2019 CBC 1908A.7
OSHPD 06/21-13-9 | ™ section 26.5.2. Approve | Accept Text Relocated from 2019 CBC 1908A.1
1905A.1.17 ACI 318,
Section ACI 318,
OSHPD 06/21-13-9.1 Section 26.12.2.1(a). Approve Accept Renumber from_1905A.1.15 to 1905A.1.17.
(Renumbered)
OSHPD 06/21-13-10 | 1908A.1 General. | Approve | Accept Amend ltem 6 to include reference to AC for
structural requirements.
New amendment to section regarding
OSHPD 06/21-13-11 Lgé)sfétzio,:sst(sNZ% Approve Accept shotcrete application and references to ACI
P ) 318 standards.
1908A.3 Editorial reformatting. Renumbered from
OSHPD 06/21-13-12 (Renumbered) Approve Accept 1908A.11.
1908A.12 Placing.
OSHPD 06/21-13-13 [OSHPD 1R, 2 & 5] Approve Accept Repeal subsection.
(Repealed)
New amendment to section to add Exception
1910A.5.3, Test 6 w[th OSHPD 4.banner regarding tension
frequency. testing and post installed anchors.
OSHPD 06/21-13-14 , Further Study Accept Further Study based on Criteria #6.
Exception 6. . ;
Post CAC: Re-word amendment for clarity
(New) . . T
regarding grammar and intent to align with
DSA amendment.
Amend section and add Exception regarding
adhesive anchors and documentation of
compliance with ACI 318 on construction
1910A.5.5 Test drawings.
OSHPD 06/21-13-15 acceptance criteria. Further Study | Accept Further Study based on Criteria #1.
Post CAC: Re-word amendment for clarity
regarding grammar and intent to align with
DSA amendment.
CHAPTER 20 ALUMINUM
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 20 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments without modifications.
Item Number 14 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-14-1 | CHAPTER20 | Approve | Accept Adopt 2021 Chapter 20 and carry forward

2019 CBC amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix

OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle

California Building Standards Commission

Page 12 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




CHAPTER 21 MASONRY
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 21 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the following modifications:

Item Number 15 Code Section CAC R Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-15-1 2101.2.2 Approve | Accept Add reference to TMS402/602
Prohibition. '
Relocated OSHPD bannered amendment
OSHPD 06/21-15-2 2103.1 Approve Accept from 2104 1.
OSHPD 06/21-15-3 2103.4 Approve Accept Add bannered OSHPD amendment.
OSHPD 06/21-15-4 21035 Approve | Accept OSHPD proposes to strike stipulation of
compliance.
OSHPD 06/21-15-5 2104.1 Approve Accept ;{f(l)%c?te OSHPD bannered amendment from
OSHPD 06/21-15-6 2104.2 Reinforced Approve Accept Add term “Reinforced” to section title.
Grouted masonry.
OSHPD proposes to amend TMS402/602 by
OSHPD 06/21-15-7 2104.2.1 through Approve Accept reorganizing these sections.
2104.2.5
See ISOR.
Amend this section to update and revise
references to various TMS and ASTM
standards.
OSHPD 06/21-15-9 2105',"; x‘;g:"tg and Fs“t’l:';e' Accept Further Study based on Criteria #1,

9 ’ y Post CAC: Coordinate language of
amendment with DSA. Coordinate with CAM
ltem 16-10 below.

2105.5 Masonry
A5 prism method OSHPD proposes to repeal this section.
OSHPD 06/21-15-11 festing. Approve Accept See ISOR.
Repealed
s 2105.6 Unit strength OSHPD proposes to repeal this section.
OSHPD 06/21-15-12 method testing. Approve Accept See ISOR.
OSHPD proposes to amend TMS402/602 by
OSHPD 06/21-15-13 2106.1 through Approve Accept reorganizing these sections.
2106.1.3
See ISOR.
OSHPD 06/21-15-14 2107.1 General. Approve Accept Revise section numbering.
OSHPD proposes to amend TMS402/602 by
OSHPD 06/21-15-15 2107.5 Approve Accept reorganizing this section.
See ISOR.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

December 9, 2021
Page 13 of 23
OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 15 Code Section CA.C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
2107.7 Masonry
OSHPD 06/21-15-16 Cosntvr;; ;Zsts,: ve Approve Accept New amendment. Include text from 2105.2.
(New)
Editorial revision and OSHPD proposes to
OSHPD 06/21-15-17 2108.1 General. Approve Accept delete model Exception regarding compliance
to specific standards.
OSHPD 06/21-15-18 2108.4 Approve Accept Amend TMS402/602 to include revised

strength values and text from Section 2105.2.

(Repealed)

See ISOR.

CHAPTER 21A MASONRY
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 21, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Chapter 21A for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:
Item Number 16 Code Section CA.C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action | Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-16-1 2101A.3 Prohibition. | Approve Accept Add reference to TMS402/602.
OSHPD 06/21-16-2 2103A1 Approve Accept Relocated amendment from 2104A.1.
OSHPD 06/21-16-3 2103A.4 Approve Accept Amend section regarding bar reinforcement.
OSHPD 06/21-16-4 2103A.5 Approve |  Accept OSHPD proposes to strike sipulation of
compliance.
OSHPD 06/21-16-5 2104A1 Approve Accept Relocate amendment from 2103A.1.
OSHPD 06/21-16-7 2104A.2 Reinforced Approve Accept Add term “Reinforced” to section title.
Grouted masonry.
OSHPD proposes to amend TMS402/602 by
OSHPD 06/21-16-8 2104A.1.3.1 through Approve Accept reorganizing these sections.
2104A.1.3.11.2
See ISOR.
Amend this section to update and revise
references to various TMS and ASTM
standards.
OSHPD 06/21-16-10 2105A.3 Mortar and Further Accept Further Study based on Criteria #1.
grout tests. Study
Post CAC: Coordinate language of
amendment with DSA. Coordinate with CAM
ltem 15-9 above.
2105A.5 Masonry . .
OSHPD 06/21-16-12 | prism method testing. | Approve Accept OSHPD proposes to repeal this section.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 14 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




Item Number 16 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action | Response Action
2105A.6 Unit strength . .
OSHPD 06/21-16-13 |  method testing. | Approve | Accept OSHPD proposes to repeal this section.
See ISOR.
(Repealed)
OSHPD proposes to amend TMS402/602 by
OSHPD 06/21-16-14 2106A.1 through Approve Accept reorganizing these sections.
2106A.1.3
See ISOR.
OSHPD proposes to reorganize this section to
OSHPD 06/21-16-15 2197'4'4 TS 402, Approve Accept coordinate with revised standard.
Section 8.3.4.4 Walls.
See ISOR.
2107A.6 Masonry
OSHPD 06/21-16-16 C%’Zg ;c;st;lve Approve Accept New amendment. Include text from 2105A.2.
(New)
Editorial revision and OSHPD proposes to
OSHPD 06/21-16-17 2108A.1 General. Approve Accept delete model Exception regarding compliance
to specific standards.
New amendment to TMS402/602 in this
OSHPD 06/21-16-18 2108A.4 Approve Accept section to include revised strength values and
text from Section 2105A.2.
CHAPTER 22 STEEL
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 22 for OSHPD 1R, 2 and 5, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments without modifications.
Item Number 17 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Adopt 2021 Chapter 22 and carry forward
OSHPD 06/21-17-1 CHAPTER 22 Approve Accept 2019 CBC amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 22A STEEL
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 22, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments to Chapter 22A for OSHPD 1 and 4 with the following modifications:
Item Number 18 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-18-1 221 1:.1:3 Truss Approve Accept Amenq section regarding engineering
esign. analysis.
Add reference to Section 1705A.2.6.
Further Further Study based on Criteria #1.
OSHPD 06/21-18-2 221341 study Accept Post CAC: Coordinated with DSA to add

OSHPD banner.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 15 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




CHAPTER 23 WOOD

Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 22 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 4 and 5, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the following modifications:

Item Number 19 Code Section CP:C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
2304.10.1.2
OSHPD 06/21-19-2 (Repealed) Approve Accept Repeal amendment. Adopt model.
2304.10.2.1
OSHPD 06/21-19-3 Approve Accept Renumber from 2304.10.1.1 to 2304.10.2.1
(Renumbered)

CHAPTER 24 GLASS AND GLAZING
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 24 for OSHPD 2, and Chapter 24 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 4, and 5 and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the

following modifications:

Item Number 20 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
2410.1.2 Testing . .
. ; Renumber items and amend #1 to include
OSHPD 06/21-20-1 and;gzﬁ);c;tlon. Approve Accept relocated amendment from Section 2410.1.2.f.
. Update and revise references to include
OSHPD 06/21-20-2 | 2410.1.3 Monitoring. Approve Accept ASTM C1394.
2410.1.4 , .
OSHPD 06/21-20-3 Construction Approve Accept Add ltem 15 with reference to Section
d 2410.1.3.
ocuments.
CHAPTER 25 GYPSUM BOARD, GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCTS AND PLASTER
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 25 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 4, and 5 and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments without modifications.
Item Number 21 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Adopt IBC Chapter 25 and carry forward 2019
OSHPD 06/21-21-1 CHAPTER 25 Approve Accept CBC existing amendments without
modifications.
CHAPTER 26 PLASTIC
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 26 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, and 5 and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments without modifications.
Item Number 22 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Adopt IBC Chapter 26 and carry forward 2019
OSHPD 06/21-22-1 CHAPTER 26 Approve Accept CBC existing amendments without
modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 16 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




CHAPTER 27 ELECTRICAL

CHAPTER 28 MECHANICAL SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS

OSHPD does not adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapters 27, 28, 29.

Item Number 23 Code Section CAC I Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
CHAPTER 27 .
OSHPD 06/21-23-1 | CHAPTER28 | Approve |  Accept OSHPD does nol adopt 2021 ermationa
CHAPTER 29 uilding Code (IBC) Chapters 27, 28, 29.

CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 30 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5, and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments for OSHPD 1 without modifications.

Item Number 24 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Adopt Chapter 30 and carry forward 2019
OSHPD 06/21-24-1 CHAPTER 30 Approve Accept CBC existing amendments without
modification.

CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 31 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 3, 4 and 5 with a new amendment as follows:

Item Number 25 Code Section CA.C AT Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-25-1 CHAPTER 31 Approve Accept Adopt 2021 IBC Chapter 31.

Add amendment to section to provide a note

OSHPD 06/21-25-2 Section 3115 Approve Accept that this section is not permitted by OSHPD.

CHAPTER 31A SYSTEMS FOR WINDOW CLEANING OR EXTERIOR BUILDING MAINTENANCE
CHAPTER 31B PUBLIC POOLS

CHAPTER 31C RADIATION
OSHPD does not adopt Chapters 31A, 31B and 31C.
Item Number 26 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
CHAPTER 31A
OSHPD 06/21-26-1 | CHAPTER31B | Approve | Accept gns d"';%d"es not adopt Chapters 314, 318
CHAPTER 31C '
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix December 9, 2021
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle Page 17 of 23

California Building Standards Commission OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



CHAPTER 31D FOOD ESTABLISHMENTS
Adopt Chapter 31D for OSHPD 1 and 4 without modification.

Item Number 27 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-27-1 | CHAPTER31D | Approve | Accept Adopt Chapter 31D for OSHPD 1 and 4
without modification.
CHAPTER 31F [SLC] MARINE OIL TERMINALS
OSHPD does not adopt Chapter 31F.
Item Number 28 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-28-1 CHAPTER 31F | Approve Accept OSHPD does not adopt Chapters 31F.
CHAPTER 32 ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 32 for OSHPD 1 and 4 without modification.
Item Number 29 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-29-1 CHAPTER 32 Approve Accept Adopt 2021 IBC Chapter 32.
CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 33 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 and 5 without modification.
Item Number 30 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-30-1 CHAPTER 33 Approve Accept Adopt 2021 IBC Chapter 33.

CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS
Adopt 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Chapter 35 for OSHPD 3, and Chapter 35 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 4, and 5 and carry forward existing 2019 CBC amendments with the

following modifications:

Item Number 31 Code Section A(éﬁgn R‘:gsgﬁlsle Public Comments Annotations Xgia?\
osHPD 06213100 | AAUEPHAT | Approve | Accept haae and amend AAMA 50140910
OSHPD 06/21-31-0b AA('ﬂﬁ :;lf)'w Approve | Accept sae anc amend AAMA 501.6-09 10
OSHPD 0921911 | “liidreq) | APProve | Accept incude reference to Secton 150132

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix

OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle

California Building Standards Commission

Page 18 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




Item Number 31 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
ACI 355.4-19 Update ACI 355.4-11 to ACI 355.4-19
OSHPD 06/21-31-2 (Updated) Approve | Accept Include reference to Section 1901.3.3
OSHPD 06/21-31-3 ACI 506R-16 Approve Accept Update per revisions to Code references.
OSHPD 06/21-31-4 ACl (5"?:‘:)’? -94 Approve Accept New Referenced Standard.
OSHPD 06/21-31-5 ACI (‘5"?:‘;87-'17 Approve Accept New Referenced Standard.
OSHPD 06/21-316 | AISC358/s118 | Approve | Accept e sade reforences {0 nlude Secton
APA
OSHPD 06/21-31-7 AN?;’Q:’:;RG Approve Accept Update per revisions to Code references.
(Updated)
a1 ASCE/SEI 7-16 Amendment to adopt Supplements 2 and 3, in
OSHPD 06/21-31-8 (Updated) Approve Accept addition to Supplement 1.
a1 ASCE/SEI 49-12 Repeal California amendment and update to
OSHPD 06/21-31-9 (Updated) Approve Accept adopt model.
ASTM
OSHPD 06/21-31-10 A153/1153M— Approve Accept Update code reference from 2304.10.1 to
2304.10.2.
2016A
ASTM Update and amend ASTM A722/A722M-12 to
OSHPD 06/21-31-11 AT22/A722M-15 Approve Accept
AT22/A722M-15,
(Updated)
OSHPD 06/21-31-12 ASTM A1064-17 Approve Accept Add code reference.
a4, ASTM B 695 (2016) Repeal California amendment and update to
OSHPD 06/21-31-13 (Updated) Approve Accept adopt model and revise code reference.
a1 ASTM C 94/C94M- Repeal California amendment and update to
OSHPD 06/21-31-14 2017 (Updated) Approve Accept adopt model.
ASTM C150-2018 Repeal California amendment and update to
OSHPD 06/21-31-15 (Updated) Approve Accept adopt model,
ASTM C270-14a Repeal California amendment and update to
OSHPD 06/21-31-16 (Updated) Approve Accept adopt model,
v ASTM C595-2018 Repeal California amendment and update to
OSHPD 06/21-31-17 (Updated) Approve Accept adopt model.
ASTM i
OSHPD 06/21-31-18 | C1157/C1157M- | Approve | Accept Repeal Cellomia amendment and update to
2017 (Updated) P '
ASTM C 1249-18 Update and amend ASTM C1249-06a (2010)
OSHPD 06/21-31-19 (Updated) Approve Accept 10 C1249-18.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

December 9, 2021
Page 19 of 23
OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 31 Code Section A?:ﬁgn Rﬁg:gze Public Comments Annotations leso?‘
OSHPD 06/21-31-20 AS(TL':"pgzti?)'zo Approve | Accept Update and amend ASTM C1392-00 o
OSHPD 06/21.31.22 As(TLl:npccl::tg:;-zo roprove | Accept Update and amerd ASTHI C1294-03 (201]
OSHPD 06/21-31-23 AS(TL'}"pg:ti?)'zo Approve | Accept Update and amend ASTM D1586-1110
OSHPD 06/21-31-24 AS'(I'lIJVIp([j)aStZS)-ZO Approve |  Accept gg‘;%e zagd amend ASTM D5778-12 to
OSHPD 06/21-31-25 A(Wuzﬁal::(-jfo Approve Accept Bﬂ)d;(t)e and amend AWPA U1-17 to AWPA
OSHPD 06/21-31-26 A\(QI]?) (ﬂf&r Approve Accept g;;fiza_t;efnd amend AWS D1.2-15 to AWS
OSHPD 06/21-31-27 AWS D1.4-2018 Approve Accept Delete code reference.

OSHPD 06/21-31-28 ANSI /FII;,N; 950-16 Approve Accept Revise code references.

OSHPD 06/21-31-29 | ! gf;fgpﬁgtz;)' Approve | Accept ke o anen [CCES ACOT 1810
OSHPD 06/21-31-30 ’g?;’fgpﬁgtgg)‘ Approve | Accept Update and amend ICC-ES AC 26 - 18 o
OSHPD 06/21-31-31 | gf;’fgp'zgtzg)‘ Approve | Accept Update and amerd ICC-ESAC 70- 1610
OSHPD 06/21-31-32 'C2C1E(fj :&:eod";‘ Approve | Accept pdate and amand ICG-ES AG 106 1810
OSHPD 06/21-31-33 ";ﬁ'ﬁﬁ:ég:)‘ Approve | Accept pdate and amend ICC-ES AC 125 - 1610
osPD0G21-3134 | iR T | Approve | Accept (CCES AC 156 21+ Revise code

reference.

OSHPD 06/21-31-35 'C2C1E(fj :&:;8)‘ Approve | Accept pdate and amand ICG-ES AC 1781810
OSHPD 06/21-31-36 'C2C1E(fl :&:egj)‘ Approve | Accept Updato and amend ICC-ES AC 163~ 1810
OSHPD 06/21-31-37 ’CZC;E(ﬁ Scf;f::)' Approve |  Accept e e aend CCESAC 2321810
OSHPD 06/21-31-38 ’Czi',,’s(ﬁ:ﬁe"(g‘ Approve | Accept pdate and amend ICG-ES AC 308 18 o
OSHPD 06/21-31-39 'C2C1E(fj :&fds)‘ Approve | Accept pdate and amand ICG-E5 AC 558 - 1810
OSHPD 06/21-31-39 'C2C1E(fj :&f:d";‘ Approve | Accept pdate and amand ICG-ES AC 446 - 18 1o

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

December 9, 2021
Page 20 of 23
OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



Item Number 31 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-31-40 1SO 9001-15 Approve Accept Revise code reference.
NEHRP Adopt New NEHRP standard regarding
OSHPD 06/21-31-41 FEMA P-2082-1 Approve Accept recommended seismic conditions.
OSHPD 06/21-31-42 TMS 402-2016 Approve Accept Revise and update code references.
OSHPD 06/21-31-43 TMS 602-2016 Approve Accept Revise and update code references.
OSHPD 06/21-31-44 UL 587 - 13 Approve Accept Revise code reference.
OSHPD 06/21-31-45 61730-1—2017: Approve Accept Revise code reference.
OSHPD 06/21-31-46 61730-2—2017: Approve Accept Revise code reference.
APPENDIX A EMPLOYEE QUALIFICATIONS
APPENDIX B BOARD OF APPEALS
APPENDIX C GROUP U—AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS
APPENDIX D FIRE DISTRICTS
APPENDIX E RESERVED
APPENDIX F RODENTPROOFING
APPENDIX G FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION
APPENDIX H SIGNS
APPENDIX | PATIO COVERS
APPENDIX J GRADING
OSHPD does not adopt APPENDICES A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, I and J.
Item Number 32 Code Section CA(.: Agency Public Comments Annotations CB$C
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-32-1 Apfhﬁ'igéﬁﬁs Al Approve | Accept OSHPD does not Appendices A through J.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix
OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle
California Building Standards Commission

Page 21 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




APPENDIX K ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS

OSHPD proposes to not adopt the 2021 IBC Appendix K Administrative Provisions.

APPENDIX K GROUP R-3 AND GROUP R-3.1 OCCUPANCIES PROTECTED BY THE FACILITIES OF THE CENTRAL VALLEY FLOOD PROTECTION PLAN
OSHPD proposes to carry forward existing amendments of the 2019 CBC and adopt Appendix K for OSHPD 2 into the 2022 CBC.

ET and ISOR language.

Item Number 33 Code Section CA(.: Agency Public Comments Annotations CB$C
Action Response Action
Adopt Appendix K for OSHPD 2.
Further Further study based on Criteria #6.
OSHPD 06/21-33-1 APPENDIX K Study Accept Post CAC: Coordinated with BSC for revised

APPENDIX L EARTHQUAKE RECORDING INSTRUMENTATION
Adopt entire 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Appendix L and carry forward existing amendments of the 2019 California Building Code (CBC) for OSHPD 1 and 4.

Item Number 34 Code Section CA(.: Agency Public Comments Annotations CBS."C
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-34-1 APPENDIX L Approve Accept Adopt Appendix L for OSHPD 1 and 4.
APPENDIX M TSUNAMI-GENERATED FLOOD HAZARD
APPENDIX N REPLICABLE BUILDINGS
APPENDIX O PERFORMANCE-BASED APPLICATION
APPENDIX P EMERGENCY HOUSING (FORMALLY 2019 CBC APPENDIX 0)
OSHPD does not adopt APPENDICES M, N, N O and P.
Item Number 35 Code Section CA(.: Agency Public Comments Annotations CB$C
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-35-1 APPIEaTZIEES M Approve Accept OSHPD does not adopt Appendices M and N.
OSHPD 06/21-352 | APPENDIXO | Approve | Accept OSHPD does not adopt 2021 1BC Appendix
OSHPD 06/21-35-3 | APPENDIXP | Approve | Accept OSHPD does not adopt 2022 CBC Appendix

P.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix

OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle

California Building Standards Commission

Page 22 of 23

December 9, 2021

OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN




RESOURCE A RECOMMENDED PRACTICES FOR REMOTE VIRTUAL INSPECTIONS (RVI)
OSHPD does not adopt RESOURCE A of the 2021 IBC.

Iltem Number 36 Code Section CA(.: Agency Public Comments Annotations CB$C
Action Response Action
OSHPD 06/21-36-1 | RESOURCEA | Approve | Accept SSHPD does not adopt 2021 1BC Resource
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix December 9, 2021

OSHPD - Part 2 Volume 2 -2021 Triennial Code Cycle Page 23 of 23
California Building Standards Commission OSHPD 06-21-CAM-PT2V2-GREEN



	2022 California BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 2 Volume 2, 2021 iNTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
	AGENCY: Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development (OSHPD 06/21)
	STRUCTURAL DESIGN/LATERAL FORCES (SDLF) CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE – JULY 28 & 29, 2021
	CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN
	CHAPTER 16A STRUCTURAL DESIGN
	CHAPTER 16A STRUCTURAL DESIGN
	CHAPTER 17 special inspections and tests
	CHAPTER 17A special inspections and tests
	CHAPTER 18 Soils and foundations
	CHAPTER 18a Soils and foundations SECTION 1807A FOUNDATION WALLS, RETAINING WALLS AND EMBEDDED POSTS AND POLES SECTION 1808A FOUNDATIONS
	CHAPTER 18a Soils and foundations SECTION 1810A DEEP FOUNDATIONS
	CHAPTER 18a Soils and foundations SECTION 1811A PRESTRESSED ROCK AND SOIL FOUNDATION ANCHORS
	CHAPTER 18a Soils and foundations SECTION 1812A EARTH RETAINING
	CHAPTER 18a Soils and foundations SECTION 1813A vibro stone columns for ground improvement
	CHAPTER 19 concrete
	CHAPTER 19a concrete
	CHAPTER 20 aluminum
	CHAPTER 21 masonry
	CHAPTER 21A masonry
	CHAPTER 22 Steel
	CHAPTER 22A Steel
	CHAPTER 23 wood
	CHAPTER 24 glass and glazing
	CHAPTER 25 GYPSUM BOARD, GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCTS AND PLASTER
	CHAPTER 26 plastic
	CHAPTER 27 electrical chapter 28 MECHANICAL SYSTEMS chapter 29 plumbing systems
	CHAPTER 30 elevators and conveying systems
	CHAPTER 31 special construction
	CHAPTER 31A SYSTEMS FOR WINDOW CLEANING OR EXTERIOR BUILDING MAINTENANCE chapter 31B PUBLIC POOLS chapter 31c RADIATION
	CHAPTER 31A SYSTEMS FOR WINDOW CLEANING OR EXTERIOR BUILDING MAINTENANCE chapter 31B PUBLIC POOLS chapter 31c RADIATION
	CHAPTER 31D food ESTABLISHMENTS
	CHAPTER 31F [SLC] marine oil terminals
	CHAPTER 32 encroachments into the public right-of-way
	CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION
	CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS
	APPENDIX A EMPLOYEE QUALIFICATIONS APPENDIX B BOARD OF APPEALS APPENDIX C GROUP U—AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS APPENDIX D FIRE DISTRICTS APPENDIX E RESERVED APPENDIX F RODENTPROOFING  APPENDIX G FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION APPENDIX H SIGNS APPENDIX I PATIO...
	Appendix K Administrative Provisions
	APPENDIX K GROUP R-3 AND GROUP R-3.1 OCCUPANCIES PROTECTED BY THE FACILITIES OF THE CENTRAL VALLEY FLOOD PROTECTION PLAN
	APPENDIX L EARTHQUAKE RECORDING INSTRUMENTATION
	APPENDIX M TSUNAMI-GENERATED FLOOD HAZARD  APPENDIX N REPLICABLE BUILDINGS APPENDIX O PERFORMANCE-BASED APPLICATION APPENDIX P EMERGENCY HOUSING (Formally 2019 CBC APPENDIX O)
	resource A RECOMMENDED PRACTICES FOR REMOTE VIRTUAL INSPECTIONS (RVI)




