
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  June 8, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 1 of 3 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX 
2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 2, 2021 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
AGENCY: DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT – STRUCTURAL SAFETY/COMMUNITY COLLEGES (DSA-SS/CC 05/21) 
 
LEGEND: 
CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required 
Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw 
CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required 
Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required 

BUILDING, FIRE, AND OTHER CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
CHAPTER 1, SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below 

Item Number 1 Code 
Section 

CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-1-1 106.1    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-1-2 110.3.12    Repeal section  
 
CHAPTER 2, DEFINITIONS  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below 

Item Number 2 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-1 EQUIPMENT    Repeal DSA-SS/CC definition and incorporate 
with OSHPD definition  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-2 EQUIPMENT    Incorporate DSA-SS/CC definition to existing 
OSHPD definition  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-3 MASS 
TIMBER    Repeal definition  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-4 WALL, LOAD 
BEARING    Amend definition  

 
  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  June 8, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 2 of 3 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

CHAPTERS 3 THROUGH 10, 12, AND 14  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapters listed below without amendment 

Item Number 3 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-3-1 CHAPTERS 
3-10, 12, 14    Adopt chapters without amendment  

 
CHAPTERS 15, ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 4 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-4-1 1511.9    Relocate text   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-4-2 1511.9.1    Amend section  
 

ITEMS 5 THROUGH 19 HEARD BY SD/LF COMMITTEE 
 
CHAPTERS 30, ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapter and carry forward existing amendments  

Item Number 20 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-20-1 Chapter 30    Adopt chapter and carry forward existing 
amendments  

 
CHAPTERS 31, SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to add, amend sections listed below  

Item Number 21 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-1 3102.3    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-2 3102.6.1.1    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-3 3111.1.1 & 
Exception    Amend section and exception  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  June 8, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 3 of 3 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 21 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-4 3111.3    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-5 3115.1 & 
Exceptions    Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-6 3115.6 & 
Exceptions    Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-7 3115.8.2    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-8 3115.8.4.1    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-9 3115.8.4.2    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-10 3115.8.4.3    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-11 3115.8.5    Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-12 3115.9    Add section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-13 3115.9.1    Add section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-14 3115.9.2    Add section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-15 3115.9.3    Add section  
 
CHAPTERS 32, ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt Chapter 32 without amendment 

Item Number 22 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-22-1 Chapter 32    Adopt without amendment  
 

ITEM 23 HEARD BY SD/LF COMMITTEE  


	2022 California Building Code, TITLE 24, PART 2, 2021 International Building Code
	AGENCY: Division of the state architect – structural safety/community colleges (dsa-ss/cc 05/21)
	building, fire, and other CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE
	Chapter 1, scope and administration
	Chapter 2, definitions
	Chapters 3 through 10, 12, and 14
	Chapters 15, roof assemblies and rooftop structures
	Chapters 30, Elevators and conveying systems
	Chapters 31, special construction
	Chapters 32, encroachments INTO the public right-of-way


