COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX

2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, TITLE 24, PART 9 (2021 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE)
AGENCY: OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL (SFM 06/21)

LEGEND:

CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw
CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required

Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required
BUILDING, FIRE, AND OTHER CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE

CHAPTER 1 -- ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION I -- CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 1 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward Division 1 and Division Il of 2019 CFC existing amendments with additional modifications as listed below.

Item Number 1 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-1-1 1'1'1”1”;’ ; gh Approve Accept Adopt and carry forward amendments
SFM 06-21-1-2 1.1.1 Title Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-1-3 1'1; ;I;r(;;lgh Approve Accept Carry forward existing amendments
Add definition per Senate Bill 85: Specified
State Occupied Buildings. Further Study,
Criteria #6.
Post CAC: SFM modified the amendment by
SFM 06-21-1-4 1.11.1 Further Study Accept adding application for residential facilities for
the elderly; by adding a stipulation for spaces
5,00 square feet or more; editorial corrections
for clarity; and added Item 9 regarding real
property.
SFM 06-21-1-5 1.11.4.4 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-1-6 1.11.4.5 Approve Accept Amend section

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 1 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day



Item Number 1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-1-7 Eiggb‘:ign Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-1-8 1.11.11 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 1, Division Il
Sections 102.1 - 102.5, 102.7-102.12, 104.2,
Chapter 1 104.5,104.8 - 104.8.2, 104.11-104.11.1,
SFM 06-21-1-9 Division "’ Approve Accept 105.1-105.2.2, 105.2.4, 105.3, 105.3.3 -
105.5.9, Table 105.5.9, 105.5.11, Table
105.5.11, 105.5.12- 105.5.13, and carry
forward existing amendments.
Adopt model code Section 105.5.14 and
SFM 06-21-1-10 105.6.52 Approve Accept repeal Section 105.6.52.
Subsections Adopt only these subsections within Section
SFM 06-21-1-11 within Approve Accept 105, Permits: 5.5.15 through 105.5.19,
Secti 105.5.22, Table 105.5.22, 105.5.23 through
ection 105
105.5.31
Renumbering Renumber Section 105.6.16.1 through Section
105.5.32. Delete model code language for
SFM 06-21-1-12 1315'6'1661 A Accent 105.5.32. SFM will not adopt Model text in
el Sectior pprove ceep Section 105.5.32.
105.5.32 Relopate existing amendment from 2019 CFC
T Section 105.6.6.16.1 to 105.5.32.
Adopt Sections 105.5.33, 105.5.38, 105.5.40,
105.5.42, 105.5.47, 105.5.49, 105.5.51, and
Subsections carry forward existing 2019 CFC
SFM 06-21-1-13 within Approve Accept amendments.
Section 105 Renumber Section 105.6.51 to Section
105.5.53, carry forward existing 2019 CFC
amendments.
105.6 through Adopt Sections 105.6 through 105.6.24 and
SFM06-21-1-14 105.6.24 Approve Accept carry forward existing amendments.]
Repeal amendments to Section 105.6.2.
Replace with model code language and adopt
SFM 06-21-1-15 105.6.2 Approve Accept the section.
Amend referenced section 105.6.8 to read as
105.5.9

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Page 2 of 34



Item Number 1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action

Repeal amendments to Section 105.7.2.

SFM 06-21-1-16 105.6.5 Approve Accept Replace with model code language and adopt
model text in Model Section 105.6.5.

SFM 06-21-1-17 105.6.52 Approve Accept Add section

SFM 06-21-1-18 105.5.51 Approve Accept Renumber section

SFM 06-21-1-19 105.7.3 Approve Accept Repeal and delete section

106, 108.2
through 108.4,
SFM 06-21-1-20 | 112.1 through- Approve Accept Adopt Sections
112.3.4, 113,
114

CHAPTER 2 -- DEFINITIONS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 2 of 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below.

Item Number 2 Code Section CAC ST Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Adopt Chapter 2 of the 2021 IFC and carry
SFM 06-21-2-1 CHAPTER 2 Approve Accept forward existing 2019 CFC amendments.
ADDITIVE o ,
SFM 06-21-2-2 MANUFACTURING Approve Accept Editorial correction
SFM 06-21-2-3 [BG] ATRIUM. Approve Accept Amend definition.
SFM 06-21-2-4 BATTERY TYPES. Approve Accept Amend section
CAPACITOR ENERGY
SFM 06-21-2-5 STORAGE SYSTEM Approve Accept Adopt model definition
(Capacitor ESS).
CARBON DIOXIDE .
SFM 06-21-2:6 ENRICHMENT Approve Accept Repeal 2019 CFC amendment of tis term.
Adopt Model definition of this term.
SYSTEM
SFM 06-21-2-7 CHILD CARE Approve Accept Add definition
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 3 of 34



Item Number 2 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-2-8 DAY-CARE Approve Accept Amend definition
ENERGY STORAGE
SFM 06-21-2-9 MANAGEMENT Approve Accept Amend definition
SYSTEMS.
ENERGY STORAGE Repeal the California defined term and adopt
SFM 06-21-2-10 SYSTEM (ESS). Approve Accept Model code defined term.
ENERGY STORAGE v
SFM 06-21-2-11 SYSTEM, Approve Accept Repeal the Caflorna defined term and adop!
ELECTROCHEMICAL. '
ENERGY STORAGE Repeal the California defined term and adopt
SFM06-21-212 | 5ysTEM, MOBILE. Approve Accept Mode! code defined term.
ENERGY STORAGE o
SFM 06-21-2-13 SYSTEM, Approve Accept Repeal the Calfora defined term and adopt
STATIONARY. '
ENERGY STORAGE o
Repeal the California defined term and adopt
SFM 06-21-2-14 SYSTEll\JIIr,‘I:I.I\_IALK-IN Approve Accept Model code defined term.
ENERGY STORAGE Repeal the California defined term and adopt
SFMO06-21-2-15 | gySTEM CABINET. Approve Accept Mode! code defined term.
SFM 06-21-2-16 ENERSGYYS?.E(I\)ARAGE Apbrove Accent Repeal the California defined term and adopt
COMMISSIONING PP P Model code defined term.
ENERGY STORAGE v
Repeal the California defined term and adopt
SFM 06-21-2-17 DECOhSIITVI?.SrEIIgI)NING Approve Accept Model code defined term.
INFLATABLE -
SFM 06-21-2-18 AMUSEMENT DEVICE. Approve Accept Add definition
Larae-Scale Fire Add definition. CAC disapproval based on
SFM 06-21-2-19 gTestin Disapprove Withdraw Criteria #7.
g- Post CAC: Withdrawn.
MOBILE FOOD
SFM 06-21-2-20 PREPARATION Approve Accept Delete definition
VEHICLES.
sFM 0621221 | [BCTBusiess Group | gy Accept Amend definition

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Page 4 of 34



Item Number 2 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM06-21-2-22 | [BGIGroupE, child | 050 Accept Amend definition
care facilities.
[BG] Factory
Industrial F-1 Repeal 2019 CFC amendment of defined term
SFM 06-21-2-23 Moderate-hazard Approve Accept and adopt Model code language.
occupancy
SFM 0621224 | InSttutionalGroupl | ppproye Accept Amend definition
SFM 06-21-2-25 | Institutional Group 14, |, 0 Accept Amend definition
day care facilities.
SFM 06-21-2-26 | Residential Group R-2 Approve Accept Amend definition
Photovoltaic (PV)
SFM 06-21-2-27 Support Structure, Approve Accept Add definition
Ground-Mounted
Photovoltaic (PV)
SFM 06-21-2-28 Support Structure, Approve Accept Add definition
Elevated
040, [BG]SMOKE -
SFM 06-21-2-29 COMPARTMENT Approve Accept Amend definition
SFM 06-21-2-30 Toddler Approve Accept Add definition
CHAPTER 3 - GENERAL REGULATIONS
SFM proposes to adopt sections of Chapter 3 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below:
Item Number 3 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt the sections listed in
SFM 06-21-3-1 CHAPTER 3 Approve Accept the ET of Chapter 3 of the 2021 IFC with
existing 2019 CFC amendments.
Repeal and Strike term “Mobile food
SFM 06-21-3-2 User Note Approve Accept preparation vehicles” from this User Note.
SFM 06-21-3-3 301.2 Approve Accept Amend section
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 5 of 34



Item Number 3 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
TABLE Repeal existing 2019 CFC amended values in
SFM 06-21-3-4 315.7.6(1) Approve Accept this table and adopt 2021 IFC Model code
" values.
Adopt Section 310.2. Delete Exception and
SFM 06-21-3-5 310.2 Approve Accept 10.2.1 Group -2
Delete entire text and Title of Section 319 of
SFM 06-21-3-6 319 Approve Accept 2021 IFC Model code. Amend Section 319
Title to “Reserved.”
Adopt new amendment: SECTION 322
Storage of Lithium-ion and Lithium Metal
SFM 06-21-3-7 322 Approve Accept Batteries. Sections 322.1 through 322.4.3.3
inclusive.
CHAPTER 4 - EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS
SFM proposes to adopt sections of Chapter 4 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below:
Item Number 4 Code Section CAC ) Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt the sections listed in
SFM 06-21-4-1 CHAPTER 4 Approve Accept the ET of Chapter 4 of the 2021 IFC with
existing 2019 CFC amendments.
SFM 06-21-4-2 403.1 Approve Accept Editorial update of referenced section.
Section 403 Renumber sections, based on changes in the
SFM 06-21-4-3 Renumbering Approve Accept model code.
SFM 06-21-4-4 403.10 Approve Accept Editorial update of referenced section.
SFM 06-21-4-5 403.10.6 Approve Accept Add section

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Page 6 of 34



CHAPTER 5 - FIRE SERVICE FEATURES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 5 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below:

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Iltem Number 5 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 5 of the 2021

SFM06-21-5-1 | CHAPTERS | Approve | Accept IFC with existing 2019 CFC amendments.

Amend section regarding storage and housing

SFM 06-21-5-2 508.1.5, 508.1.6 Approve Accept of specific equipment within Fire Command
Center space.
Renumber
508.1.7 to Renumber section based on changes in the
SFM 06-21-5-3 508.1.8 Approve Accept model code.
Ventilation

CHAPTER 6 - BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 6 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below:

Item Number 6 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
P SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 6 of the 2021
SFM 06-21-6-1 CHAPTER 6 Approve Accept IFC with existing 2019 CFC amendments.
SFM 06-21-6-2 603.1.2 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-6-3 603.4 Approve Accept Amend section
Amend section to repeal references to Group
SFM 06-21-6-4 603.5.1.1 Approve Accept -2 Condition 1 and Condition 2.
Renumber . .
SFM 06-21-6-5 606.2.5 to Approve Accept Renumber section based on changes in the
model code.
604.3.5
(Repeal R I
epeal 2019 CFC California amendment and
SFM 06-21-6-6 606.1.1) Approve Accept :
Adopt 604.5.3 adopt 2021 IFC Model code Section 604.5.3.
Renumber . .
SFM 06-21-6-7 606.8.5 to Approve Accept Renumber section based on changes in the
model code.
604.6.3
Section 604.6.4 . .
SFM 06-21-6-8 through Approve Accept Renumber sections based on changes in the
Model code.
604.6.4.4
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 7 of 34



Item Number 6 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-6-9 605.7 Approve Accept Amend section
CHAPTER 7 - FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 7 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below:
Item Number 7 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
047, SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 7 of the 2021
SFM06-21-7-1 | CHAPTER7 | Approve Accept IFC with existing 2019 CFC amendments.
701.6 Repeal 2019 CFC California amendment and
SFM 06-21-7-2 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code language.
Renumber 708 Renumber Section and subsections in Section
SFM 06-21-7-3 to0 709 Approve Accept 708 to Section 709 based on changes in the
Model code.

CHAPTER 8 - INTERIOR FINISH, DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS

SFM proposes to adopt sections in Chapter 8 of the 2021 IFC listed in the Express Terms and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as

listed below.
Item Number 8 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 8 sections of

SFM 06-21-8-1 CHAPTER 8 Approve Accept the 2021 IFC listed in the ET with existing
2019 CFC amendments.
Delete 2021 IFC Model code text and Title

SFM 06-21-8-2 805.1 Reserved Approve Accept and subsections of Section 805.1.
Amend to show this section being “Reserved.”

SFM 06-21-8-3 806.1.4 Approve Accept Amend Section

SFM 06-21-8-4 807.4 Approve Accept Amend section

SFM 06-21-8-5 807.5.3 Approve Accept Amend section

SFM 06-21-8-6 807.5.3.3 Approve Accept Amend section

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 8 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day



Item Number 8 Code Section CAC I Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-8-7 807.5.3.4 Approve Accept Amend section
CHAPTER 9 - FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 9 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below.
Item Number 9 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
040, SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 9 of the 2021
SFM 06-21-9-1 CHAPTER 9 Approve Accept IFC with existing 2019 CFC amendments.
SFM 06-21-9-2 901.5 Approve Accept Editorial amendment to Title of Model section.
SFM 06-21-9-3 901.6.1 Approve Accept Amend Table
SFM 06-21-9-4 901.7 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-9-5 903.1.1 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-9-6 903.2 Approve Accept Amend section with editorial update.
903.3.1.1 & Amend section with editorial update and
SFM 06-21-9-7 903.31.1.1& Approve Accept relocate sub-items regarding photovoltaic
903.3.1.1.3 systems.
Repeal 2019 CFC California amendment and
SFM 06-21-9-8 903.2.10.2 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code language.
Repeal 2019 CFC amendments to this table —
SFM 06-21-9-9 TABLE 903.2.11.6 Approve Accept adopt 2021 CFC Model values.
New section for sprinkler protection of exterior
entrance covers. SFM will coordinate with
SFM 06-21-9-10 903.2.21 Approve Accept OSHPD a response in the ISOR to CAC
comment regarding non-sprinklered buildings.
SFM 06-21-9-11 903.3.1.1.1 Approve Accept Repeal and relocate amendment
SFM 06-21-9-12 903.5 Approve Accept Amend section

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 9 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




Item Number 9 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Adopt 2021 IFC Model code text and carry
SFM 06-21-9-13 906.1 Approve Accept forward 2019 CFC deletions.
SFM 06-21-9-14 907.2 Approve Accept Amend section
Adopt 2021 IFC Model text with modifications
SFM 06-21-9-15 907.2.3 Approve Accept and carry forward existing 2019 CFC
amendments in Exceptions.
New amendment regarding automatic smoke
detection systems. Further Study based on
SFM 06-21-9-16 907.2.6.4 Further Study | Accept Criteria #6.
e y P Post CAC: SFM accepted CAC
recommendation and added reference to
Section 436.1 for conditions above first story.
Renumber 907.2.6.4 Renumber Section based on changes in the
SFM 06-21-9-17 through 907.2.6.5 Approve Accept Model code and Group |-4 requirements.
Renumber Renumber Section based on changes in the
SFM 06-21-9-18 | 907.2.11.2.1 through Approve Accept - chang
Model code revisions and revise references.
907.2.11.2.5
907.2.11.3 and ,
SFM 06-21-9-19 907.1.11.4 Approve Accept Revise references.
Renumber 907.2.10.8 to 907.2.11.8 and
Renumber modify existing 2019 CFC amendments and
SFM 06-21-9-20 907.2.10.8 to Approve Accept amend the reference Section number based
907.2.11.8 on changes to both the NFPA 72 standards
and the model code.
Repeal 2019 CFC amendment — adopt 2021
SFM 06-21-9-21 [F]1907.2.23 Approve Accept IFC Model code section.
Amend and revise references to correlate with
SFM 06-21-9-22 907.5 Approve Accept CBC code sections.
SFM 06-21-9-23 907.5.1.1 Approve Accept Qarry forwarq existing 2019 CFC amendment
in the Exception.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Page 10 of 34



Item Number 9 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Carry forward existing 2019 CFC and
renumber references to California
SFM 06-21-9-24 907.5.24 Approve Accept amendments based on changes in the model
code and Group I-2 Condition 2 revisions.
Renumber . .
SFM06-21-925 |  907.52.1.3t0 Approve Accept Renumber Section based on changes in the
Model code revision.
907.5.2.1.4
. Modify and amend section regarding Group I-
SFM 06-21-9-26 907'53'; .r3m\25|ble Approve Accept 2, Condition 2 revisions. Update code
) references.
SFM 06-21-9-27 007.6.4.4 Approve Accept Editorial update to correct a reference
number.
Renumber 907.6.6.3 Renumber Section based on changes in the
SFM 06-21-9-28 to 907.6.6.4 Approve Accept Model code revision.
Renumber Renumber Section based on changes in the
SFM06-21-9-29 | 998 310 908.4 Approve Accept Model code revision,
Repeal 2019 CFC amendment — adopt 2021
SFM 06-21-9-30 9111 Approve Accept IFC Model code section.
Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment in this
SFM 06-21-9-31 TABLE 911.1 Approve Accept table and adopt Model values.
Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment and
SFM 06-21-9-32 911.4 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code.
Revise to correlate the exception reference
SFM 06-21-9-33 913.1 General. Approve Accept section to CRC Section R313.
SFM 06-21-9-34 913.6 Approve Accept Repeal references to obsplete code sections
or that are no longer applicable.
Amend section to correlate with Tall Wood
SFM 06-21-9-35 914.3.1.2 Approve Accept Work Group amendments in previous code
adoption cycle.
04 0. Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment and
SFM 06-21-9-36 914.7 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code.
04 0. Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment and
SFM 06-21-9-37 914.71 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code.
1.0, Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment and
SFM 06-21-9-38 914.7.2 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 11 of 34



Item Number 9 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment and
SFM 06-21-9-39 916 Approve Accept adopt 2021 IFC Model code throughout
Section 916.
CHAPTER 10 - MEANS OF EGRESS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 10 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below.
Item Number 10 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 10 of the
SFM 06-21-10-1 CHAPTER 10 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments.
Editorial amendment to remove the term
SFM 06-21-10-2 1001.1 Approve Accept “townhouse.”
Repeal 2019 CFC amendment to exception 1
Further and adopt 2021 IFC Model code language.
SFM 06-21-10-3 [BE] 1003.5 stud Disagree Further Study based on Criteria #6.
y Post CAC: SFM disagreed with CAC. No
Change to Express Terms.
Delete 2021 IFC Model code Exception
YTy Further . language. Further Study based on Criteria #1.
SFM06-21-10-4 | [BE]1005.7.2 Study Disagree Post CAC: SFM disagreed with CAC. No
Change to Express Terms.
PYRTY [BE] 1006.2.1, Renumber Exception 3 based on revisions to
SFM 06-21-10-5 Exception 3. Approve Accept the Model code.
SFM 06-21-10-6 TABLE 1006.2.1 Approve Accept Amendment to add footnote i to Table.
1006.2.2.2 & Amendment to simplify the egress
SFM 06-21-10-7 o Approve Accept requirements for refrigerated rooms and
1006.2.2.3 i i
associated machinery rooms
New amendment to correspond with Table
SFM 06-21-10-8 1006.2.2.8 Approve Accept 1006.2.1 for all -4 occupancies.
SFM proposes to amend this section to
SFM 06-21-10-9 [BE] 1009.6.3 Approve Accept correlate with 2017 ICC A117.1 documents.
SFM 06-21-10-10 1009.12 Approve Accept Amendment tp cqordmate with OSHPD for 2-
way communication systems.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 12 of 34

SFM 06-21-

August 20, 2021
CAM-PT9-45Day



adopt 2021 IFC Model code language.

Item Number 10 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Amendment to coordinate with OSHPD for
SFM 06-21-10-11 [BE] 1010.1.1 Approve Accept corridor capacity.
Amendment to coordinate with OSHPD for
reference to CBC Chapters 11A and 11B.
Further . CAC recommendation of Further Study based
SFM 06-21-10-12 [BE] 1010.1.4 Study Disagree on criteria #1 and #6.
Post CAC: SFM mad no change to the
Express Terms.
PYRTY [BE] 1010.2.5 Bolt Amendment to coordinate with OSHPD for
SFM 06-21-10-13 locks. Approve Accept clear opening width.
Renumber
SFM 06-21-10-14 1010.1.4.5.1 to Approve Accept Renumbering based on model code revisions.
1010.2.8.1
Carry forward existing 2019 CFC amendment
SFM 06-21-10-15 1010.1.14 Approve Accept to coordinate with OSHPD for controlled
egress doors in I-2 Occupancies.
PYRTY Carry forward Existing 2019 CFC amendment
SFM 06-21-10-16 [BE] 1010.2.13 Approve Accept and modify ltem 3 and Exception.
Amendment to coordinate with OSHPD for
SFM 06-21-10-17 [BE] 1013.6.3 Approve Accept Group I-2, Condition 2 deletions.
SFM 06-21-10-18 | [BE] TABLE 1020.2 Approve Accept Revise taple to require a 1-hour fire resistance
rated corridor.
Amendment to Table to revise the width of
SFM 06-21-10-19 | [BE] TABLE 1020.3 Approve Accept corridors serving nonambulatory persons,
including footnote a.
Proposed amendment to coordinate with
SFM 06-21-10-20 [BE] 1020.5 Approve Accept Condition 2 and Group I-2 revisions.
Carry forward existing 2019 CFC amendment
SFM 06-21-10-21 1020.6 Approve Accept to coordinate with 2021 IFC Model code
language.
Renumber Renumber and amend referenced sections
SFM06-21-10-22 | 4154622 t0 1022.3 Approve Accept based on model code revisions.
SFM 06-21-10-23 [BE] 1024.6 Approve Accept Repeal 2019 CFC amendment to item 1 and

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 13 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day



Item Number 10 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Renumber Renumber and amend referenced sections
SFM 06-21-10-24 1029.6.4 to Approve Accept -
based on model code revisions.
1030.6.3.2
1032.21.2 8 New amendments to correspond with
SFM 06-21-10-25 Py Approve Accept requirements that are also in Chapter 11 for
1032.2.1.3 = o
Existing Buildings.
CHAPTER 11 - CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 11 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications as listed below:
Item Number 11 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 11 sections
of the 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
SFM 06-21-11-1 CHAPTER 11 Approve Accept amendments that are listed in the Express
Terms.
1113.1.1 Editorial correction to refenced Health and
SFM 06-21-11-2 Application. Approve Accept Safety Code.

CHAPTER 12 - ENERGY SYSTEMS
SFM proposes to repeal many sections in Chapter 12 2019 CFC. SFM also proposes to adopt Chapter 12 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC,
with additional modifications as listed below:

Item Number 12 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 12 of the
SFM 06-21-12-1 CHAPTER 12 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments.
Repeal 2019 CFC amendment and adopt
SFM 06-21-12-2 1201.1,1201.3 Approve Accept 2021 IFC Model code language.
Repeal 2019 CFC amended defined terms
SFM 06-21-12-3 Section 1202 Approve Accept and adopt 2021 IFC Model code defined terms
in 12-4A through 12-4 T below.
CAPACITOR
12-3A ENERGY STORAGE Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
SYSTEM.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 14 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




Item Number 12 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3B MANAGEMENT Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
SYSTEMS.
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3C SYSTEM. Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3D SYSTEM, Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
ELECTROCHEMICAL
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3E SYSTEM, MOBILE. Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3F SYSTEM, WALK-IN Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
UNIT.
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3G SYSTEM CABINET. Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
ENERGY STORAGE
12-3H SYSTEM Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
COMMISSIONING.
ENERGY STORAGE
SYSTEM
12-31 DECOMMISSION- Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
ING.
SFM 06-21-12-4 1203.1.2 Approve Accept Amend section for I-2 Occupancy condition.
1203.2.6 Gas
SFM 06-21-12-5 detection systems. Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.
Repeal amendment/Adopt Model. New
SFM 06-21-12-6 1203.2.19 Approve Accept location is 1203.2.5.
Renumber 1204.2.3 Renumber amendment based on Model code
SFM 06-21-12-7 t0 1205.2.4 Approve Accept revisions.
Renumber 1204.3.4 Renumber amendment based on Model code
SFM 06-21-12-8 to 1205.3.3.4 Approve Accept revisions. Amend section title to include R-3.
SFM 06-21-12-9 120?'21651 ?ge.s, Approve Accept Repeal amendment/Adopt Model.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix

Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 15 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




Item Number 12 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-12-10 1207.1.5 Approve Accept Repeal amendments/Adopt Model.
1207.11 through Carry forward amendments, repeal and
SFM 06-21-12-11 1207.11.5 Approve Accept replace with model code text
SFM 06-21-12-12 1207.11.6 Approve Accept Carry forward amendments, repeal and
replace with model code text
1207.11.7 through ,
SFM 06-21-12-13 1207.11.7.3 Approve Accept Amend sections
CHAPTER 20 - AVIATION FACILITIES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 20 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.
. CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 20 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 20 of the
SFM 06-21-20-1 CHAPTER 20 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 21 - DRY CLEANING
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 21 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.
Item Number 21 Code Section CAC I Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 21 of the
SFM 06-21-21-1 CHAPTER 21 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 22 - COMBUSTIBLE DUST-PRODUCING OPERATIONS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 22 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.
Item Number 22 Code Section CAC I Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 22 of the
SFM 06-21-22-1 CHAPTER 22 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC

amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix

Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 16 of 34

August 20, 2021

SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




CHAPTER 23 - MOTOR FUEL-DISPENSING FACILITIES AND REPAIR GARAGES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 23 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

CAC AT Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 23 Code Section e Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 23 of the
SFM 06-21-23-1 CHAPTER 23 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 24 - FLAMMABLE FINISHES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 24 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

Item Number 24 Code Section CAC ST Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 24 of the
SFM 06-21-24-1 CHAPTER 24 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 25 - FRUIT AND CROP RIPENING
SFM does NOT adopt Chapter 25.
Item Number 25 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-25-1 CHAPTER 25 Approve Accept SFM does NOT adopt Chapter 25.
CHAPTER 26 - FUMIGATION AND INSECTICIDAL FOGGING
SFM does NOT adopt Chapter 26.
Item Number 26 Code Section CA.C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-26-1 CHAPTER 26 Approve Accept SFM does NOT adopt Chapter 26.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 17 of 34



CHAPTER 27 — SEMICONDUCTOR FABRICATION FACILITIES
SFM does NOT adopt Chapter 27.

Item Number 27 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-27-1 CHAPTER 27 Approve Accept SFM does NOT adopt Chapter 27.

CHAPTER 28 - LUMBER YARDS AND AGRO-INDUSTRIAL
SOLID BIOMASS AND WOODWORKING FACILITIES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 28 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

CAC A Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 28 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 28 of the
SFM 06-21-28-1 CHAPTER 28 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 29 - MANUFACTURE OF ORGANIC COATINGS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 29 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Iltem Number 29 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 29 of the
SFM 06-21-29-1 CHAPTER 29 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 30 — INDUSTRIAL OVENS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 30 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations cBSC

Item Number 30 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 30 of the
SFM 06-21-30-1 CHAPTER 30 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 18 of 34



CHAPTER 31 -- TENTS, TEMPORARY SPECIAL EVENT STRUCTURES
AND OTHER MEMBRANE STRUCTURES

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 31 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications listed below.

Item Number 31 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 31 of the

SFM 06-21-31-1 CHAPTER 31 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments.

SFM 06-21-31-2 3101.1 Scope. Approve Accept Amgnd Scope to include inflatable amusement
devices.
Repeal existing 2019 CFC amendment

SFM 06-21-31-3 3103.8.2 Approve Accept regarding Title 19, Parking of vehicles.

SFM 06-21-31-4 3103.9.1 Approve Accept New amendment regarding anchoring tent
structures.
New Section amendment regarding anchoring
Inflatable Amusement Devices.

SFM 06-21-31-5 3106 Approve Accept Add subsections:
3106.1, 3106.2, 3106.3, 3106.4, 3106.5,
3106.6 and 3106.7.

CHAPTER 32 -- HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 32 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications listed below.
Item Number 32 Code Section CAC ) Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 32 of the

SFM 06-21-32-1 CHAPTER 32 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments.

SFM06-21-32-2 | TABLE3203.8 | Approve Accept Amend Table in Product column to include an
exclusion regarding Lithium-ion batteries.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 19 of 34

August 20, 2021

SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day



CHAPTER 33 - FIRE SAFETY DURING CONSTRUCTION AND DEMOLITION

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 33 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

: CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 33 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 33 of the
SFM 06-21-33-1 CHAPTER 33 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
SFM 06-21-33-2 3308.9 Approve Accept Repeal California amendment
(Repeal) '
SFM 06-21-33-3 3303.5 Approve Accept Adopt model code section.
CHAPTER 34 - TIRE REBUILDING AND TIRE STORAGE
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 34 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with minor modifications.
Item Number 34 Code Section CP:C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 34 of the
2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
SFM 06-21-34-1 CH%Z;ISET 34, Approve Accept amendments without modifications.
3408.1 - Correction: Change Code reference
from Section 508 to Section 507.
CHAPTER 35 - WELDING AND OTHER HOT-WORK
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 35 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.
Item Number 35 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 35 of the
SFM 06-21-35-1 CHAPTER 35 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC

amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix

Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle

Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 20 of 34

August 20, 2021

SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




CHAPTER 36 — MARINAS

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 36 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.

: CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 36 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 36 of the
SFM 06-21-36-1 CHAPTER 36 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 37 - COMBUSTIBLE FIBERS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 37 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.
Item Number 37 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 37 of the
SFM 06-21-37-1 CHAPTER 37 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 38 - HIGHER EDUCATION LABORATORIES (DELETE) -- RESERVED (PROPOSED)
SFM proposes to DELETE entire 2021 IFC Chapter 38. Proposes to Reserve this chapter.
Item Number 38 Code Section CP:C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to DELETE entire 2021 IFC
SFM 06-21-38-1 CHAPTER 38 Approve Accept Chapter 38. SFM proposes to Reserve
Reserved
Chapter 38.
CHAPTER 39 - PROCESSING AND EXTRACTION FACILITIES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 39 sections of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without modifications.
Item Number 39 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 39 of the
SFM 06-21-39-1 CHAPTER 39 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC

amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle

Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 21 of 34

SFM 06-21-

August 20, 2021
CAM-PT9-45Day




CHAPTER 40 — STORAGE OF DISTILLED SPIRITS AND WINES

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 40 sections of the 2021 without modifications.

: CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 40 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 40 of the
SFM 06-21-40-1 CHAPTER 40 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTERS 41 THROUGH 47 - RESERVED
SFM proposes to adopt Chapters 41 through 47 as RESERVED.
Item Number 41 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
CHAPTERS 41
Y SFM proposes to repeal Model code Chapter
SFM 06-21-41-1 through 47 Approve Accept Title 40 and adopt Chapter 41 Reserved Title.
Reserved
CHAPTER 48 — MOTION PICTURE AND TELEVISION PRODUCTION
STUDIO SOUND STAGES, APPROVED PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PRODUCTION LOCATIONS
SFM proposes to bring forward Chapter 48 of the 2019 CFC without modifications.
Item Number 48 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to bring forward Chapter 48 of
SFM06-21-48-1 | CHAPTER48 | Approve Accept the 2019 CFC without modifications.
CHAPTER 49 -- REQUIREMENTS FOR WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREAS
SFM proposes to bring forward and add new amendments to Chapter 49 as listed below
Item Number 49 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes a “New User Note” to be added
SFM 06-21-49-1 User note Approve Accept as a commentary for Chapter 49.
Amend the Scope to clearly describe
Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area, Fire Area
SFM 06-21-49-2 4901.1 Approve Accept is being changed in WUI term below — not
consistent within the chapter.
Amend the Purpose to clearly describe SRA
SFM 06-21-49-3 4901.2 Approve Accept and LRA conditions described within this
chapter.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Page 22 of 34



Item Number 49 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-49-4 4902.1 Approve Accept Amend defined term.
FIRE
SFM 06-21-49-5 PROTECTION Approve Accept Amend defined term.
PLAN.
FIRE RESISTANT ,
SFM 06-21-49-6 VEGETATION Approve Accept Amend defined term.
IGNITION-
SFM 06-21-49-7 RESISTANT Approve Accept Amend defined term.
MATERIAL.
LOCAL AGENCY
VERY HIGH FIRE -
SFM 06-21-49-8 HAZARD Approve Accept Repeal and replace definition
SEVERITY ZONE
STATE
SFM 06-21-49-9 RESPONSIBILITY Approve Accept Amend defined term.
AREA (SRA).
WILDLAND-
URBAN ,
SFM 06-21-49-10 INTERFACE FIRE Approve Accept Amend defined term.
AREA (WUI).
SFM 06-21-49-11 SECTION 4903 Approve Accept Amend Title
SFM 06-21-49-12 4903.1 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-13 4903.2 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-14 4903.2.1 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-15 4903.2.1.1 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-16 4903.2.1.2 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-17 4904.1 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-49-18 4904.2 Approve Accept Amend section
SFM 06-21-49-19 4904.3 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-20 4904.3.1 Approve Accept Add section
SFM 06-21-49-21 4904.3.2 Approve Accept Add section

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 23 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




Item Number 49 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-49-22 4905.2, 4905.3 Approve Accept Amend sections
4906.1 through .
SFM 06-21-49-23 4906.4.2.1 Approve Accept Add and amend sections
SFM 06214924 | HOTIIIOUIN | ppprove | Accept Add and amend sections
SFM 06-21-49-25 4908.1, 4908.2 Approve Accept Add sections
SFM 06214926 | “OSTIOUIN | ppprove | Accept Add sections
SFM06-21-49-7 | 4910.1though 1 oo ive | Accept Add sections
49104
CHAPTER 50 - HAZARDOUS MATERIALS - GENERAL PROVISIONS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 50 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward amendments.
Item Number 50 Code Section CA.C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
0 B SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 50 of the
SFM 06-21-50-1 CHAPTER 50 Approve Accept 2021 IFC and carry forward amendments
CHAPTER 51 - AEROSOLS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 51 of the 2021 IFC without modifications.
Item Number 51 Code Section CA.C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 51 of the
SFM 06-21-51-1 CHAPTER 51 Approve Accept 2021 IFC without modifications.
CHAPTER 53 - COMPRESSED GASES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 53 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.
Item Number 53 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 53 of the
SFM 06-21-53-1 CHAPTER 53 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC

amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 24 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




CHAPTER 54 - CORROSIVE MATERIALS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 54 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 54 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 54 of the
SFM 06-21-54-1 CHAPTER 54 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 55 - CRYOGENIC FLUIDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 55 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations cBSC

Item Number 55 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 55 of the
SFM 06-21-55-1 CHAPTER 55 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 56 — EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 56 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC A Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 56 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 56 of the
SFM 06-21-56-1 CHAPTER 56 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 57 - FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS FLAMMABLE GASES AND FLAMMABLE COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 57 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC A Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 57 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 57 of the
SFM 06-21-57-1 CHAPTER 57 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 25 of 34



CHAPTER 58 - FLAMMABLE GASES AND FLAMMABLE CRYOGENIC FLUIDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 58 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 58 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 58 of the
SFM 06-21-58-1 CHAPTER 58 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 59 - FLAMMABLE SOLIDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 59 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC AT Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 59 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 59 of the
SFM 06-21-59-1 CHAPTER 59 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 60 - HIGHLY TOXIC AND TOXIC MATERIALS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 60 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC AT Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 60 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 60 of the
SFM 06-21-60-1 CHAPTER 60 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 61 - LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 61 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations cBsc

Item Number 61 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 61 of the
SFM 06-21-61-1 CHAPTER 61 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 26 of 34



CHAPTER 62 — ORGANIC PEROXIDES
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 62 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 62 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 62 of the
SFM 06-21-62-1 CHAPTER 62 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 63 - OXIDIZERS, OXIDIZING GASES AND OXIDIZING CRYOGENIC FLUIDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 63 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations cBSC

Item Number 63 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 63 of the
SFM 06-21-63-1 CHAPTER 63 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 64 - PYROPHORIC MATERIALS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 64 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations cBsc

Item Number 64 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 64 of the
SFM 06-21-64-1 CHAPTER 64 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

CHAPTER 65 - PYROXYLIN (CELLULOSE NITRATE) PLASTICS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 65 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Item Number 65 Code Section Action Response Action

SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 65 of the
SFM 06-21-65-1 CHAPTER 65 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 27 of 34



CHAPTER 66 — UNSTABLE (REACTIVE) MATERIALS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 66 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.

: CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 66 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 66 of the
SFM 06-21-66-1 CHAPTER 66 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 67 - WATER-REACTIVE SOLIDS AND LIQUIDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 67 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, without additional modifications.
: CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number 67 Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 67 of the
SFM 06-21-67-1 CHAPTER 67 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments without modifications.
CHAPTER 80 - REFERENCED STANDARDS
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 80 of the 2021 IFC and carry forward existing amendments from 2019 CFC, with additional modifications.
Item Number 80 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 80 of the
SFM 06-21-80-1 CHAPTER 80 Approve Accept 2021 IFC with existing 2019 CFC
amendments.
SFM06-21-80-2 | ASTMF2374 | Approve | Accept Update and revise with NEW amendment
regarding inflatable amusement devices.
SFM 06-21-80-3 NFPA 2-20 Approve Accept Update NFPA 2-19 to NFPA 2-20.
SFM 06-21-80-4 NFPA 10-21 Approve Accept Update NFPA 10-18 to NFPA 10-21.
Update NFPA 13-19 to NFPA 13-22.
Renumber and revise subsections as listed in
SFM 06-21-80-5 NFPA 13-22 Approve Accept Express Terms.
Add NEW subsections as listed in Express
Terms.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 28 of 34



Item Number 80 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
Update NFPA 13D-19 to NFPA 13D-22.
Renumber and revise subsections as listed in
SFM 06-21-80-6 NFPA 13D-22 Approve Accept Express Terms.
Revise subsections as listed in Express
Terms.
Update NFPA 13R-19 to NFPA 13R-22.
Renumber and revise subsections as listed in
SFM 06-21-80-7 NFPA 13R-22 Approve Accept Express Terms.
Revise subsections as listed in Express
Terms.
Adopt 2021 IFC NFPA 14-19 and Carry
SFM 06-21-80-8 NFPA 14-19 Approve Accept forward 2019 CFC amendments without
modifications.
Adopt 2021 IFC NFPA 24-19 and Repeal
SFM 06-21-80-9 NFPA 24-19 Approve Accept 2019 CFC amendments.
SFM 06-21-80-10 | NFPA 25-13CA Approve Accept Update NFPA 25-20 to NFPA 25-13CA.
SFM 06-21-80-11 Repeal Approve Accept Repealidelete 2021 IFC NFPA 45-19
NFPA 45-19 '
Adopt Repeal/delete 2019 CFC NFPA 68-13.
SFM06-21-80-12 | \pppgg.q3 | APprove Accept Adopt Model 2021 IFC NFPA 68-13,
Update NFPA 72-19 to NFPA 72-20.
Adopt Adopt 2021 IFC 72 and Carry forward 2019
SFM 06-21-80-13 NFPA 72 Approve Accept CFC amendments with modifications as listed
in Express Terms.
Adoot Repeal/delete 2019 CFC NFPA 76-16.
SFM 06-21-80-14 P Approve Accept Adopt Model 2021 IFC NFPA 76-16 with
NFPA 76-16 P
modifications.
SFM 06-21-80-15 Adopt Approve Accept Update NFPA 111-16 to NFPA 111-19
NFPA 111-19 '
SFM 06-21-80-16 Adopt Approve |  Accept Update NFPA 241-13 to NFPA 241-19
NFPA 241-19 '
SFM 06-21-80-17 Adopt Approve |  Accept Update NFPA 260-13 to NFPA 260-19
NFPA 260-19 '

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix

Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle

Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 29 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




Item Number 80 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-80-18 Adopt Approve Accept Update NFPA 289-18 to NFPA 289-19
NFPA 289-19 :
Adopt Repeal 2019 CFC NFPA 1124-17 text and
SFM06-21-80-19 | Nppa 1124.47 |  APProve Accept update to 2021 IFC NFPA 1124-17 fext,
Adopt Adopt and amend 2021 IFC NFPA 2001-18
SFM 06-21-80-20 NFPA 2001-18 Approve Accept fext.
Adopt
SFM 06-21-80-21 UL 9540 Approve Accept 3Eg?Zeoaé‘?;t?orﬂe?dz%o%“o 201610
Edition 2-2020 ’ '
Adopt Update and amend UL 9540A-17 to
SFM 06-21-80-22 UL 9540A Approve Accept o
e UL9540 Edition 4, 2019.
Edition 4 2019

APPENDIX CHAPTER 4 — SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY
SFM proposes to adopt and carry forward Appendix Chapter 4 of the 2019 CFC and carry forward existing amendments into the 2022 CFC, with additional modifications listed

below.

Item Number A4-1 | Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
APPENDIX SFM proposes to adopt Appendix 4 of the
SFM 06-21-A4-1 CHAPTER 4 Approve Accept 2021 IFC
SFM 06-21-A4-2 436.1 Approve Accept Amend Section
SFM 06-21-A4-3 436.1.1 Approve Accept Amend Section
SFM 06-21-A4-4 Section 452 Approve Accept Amend title
SFM 06-21-A4-5 452.1.4 Approve Accept Amend Section
SFM 06-21-A4-6 455.2, 455.6 Approve Accept Amend Sections
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 30 of 34



APPENDIX A - BOARD OF APPEALS
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix A.

Item Number A-1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-A-1 APPENDIX A Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix A.
APPENDIX B - FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
SFM proposes to adopt 2021 IFC Appendix B without modifications.
Item Number B-1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM06-21-B-1 | APPENDIXB | Approve Accept Adopt 2021 IFC Appendix B without
modifications.
APPENDIX BB - FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
SFM proposes to carry forward 2019 CFC Appendix BB without modifications.
. CAC Agency . : CBSC
Item Number BB-1 | Code Section Action Response Public Comments Annotations Action
SFM 06-21-BB-1 APPENDIX Approve Accept Carry.for\./vard 2019 CFC Appendix BB without
BB modifications.
APPENDIX C - FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
SFM proposes to adopt 2021 IFC Appendix C without modifications.
Item Number C-1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM06-21-C-1 | APPENDIXC | Approve Accept Adopt 2021 IFC Appendix C without
modifications.
APPENDIX CC - FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
SFM proposes to carry forward 2019 CFC Appendix CC without modifications.
Item Number CC-1 | Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-CC-1 APPENDIX Approve Accept Carr.y.for\./vard 2019 CFC Appendix CC without
cc modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 31 of 34

August 20, 2021
SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day



APPENDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix A.

Item Number D-1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-D-1 APPENDIX D Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix D.
APPENDIX E - HAZARD CATEGORIES
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix E.
Item Number E-1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-E-1 APPENDIX E Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix E.
APPENDIX F - HAZARD RANKING
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix F.
Item Number F-1 Code Section CP:C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-F-1 APPENDIX F Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix F.

APPENDIX G - CRYOGENIC FLUIDS - WEIGHT AND VOLUME EQUIVALENTS
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix G.

Item Number G-1 | Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-G-1 APPENDIX G Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix G.

APPENDIX H - FIRE- HAZARDOUS MATERIALS MANAGEMENT PLAN (HMMP)
AND HAZARDOUS MATERIALS INVENTORY STATEMENT (HMIS) INSTRUCTIONS FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
SFM proposes to adopt 2021 IFC Appendix H without modifications.

CAC ST Public Comments Annotations CBSC

Iltem Number H-1 Code Section Action Response Action

Adopt 2021 IFC Appendix H without

SFM 06-21-H-1 APPENDIX H Approve Accept modifications.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day
Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 32 of 34



APPENDIX | - FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS—NONCOMPLIANT CONDITIONS

SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix I.

Item Number I-1 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-1-1 APPENDIX | Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix I.
APPENDIX J - BUILDING INFORMATION SIGN
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix J.
Item Number J-1 Code Section CAC ST Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-J-1 APPENDIX J Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix J.
APPENDIX K - CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING AMBULATORY CARE FACILITIES
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix K.
Item Number K-1 Code Section CA.C CERE Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-K-1 APPENDIX K Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix K.
APPENDIX L - REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE FIGHTER AIR REPLENISHMENT SYSTEMS
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix L.
Item Number L-1 Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-L-1 APPENDIX L Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix L.
APPENDIX M - HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS—RETROACTIVE AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER REQUIREMENT
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix M.
Item Number M-1 | Code Section CAC A Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-M-1 APPENDIX M Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix M.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle
Office of the State Fire Marshal

Page 33 of 34

August 20, 2021

SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day




APPENDIX N - INDOOR TRADE SHOWS AND EXHIBITIONS
SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix N.

Item Number N-1 Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-N-1 APPENDIX N Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2021 IFC Appendix N.

APPENDIX O - TEMPORARY HAUNTED HOUSES, GHOST WALKS AND SIMILAR AMUSEMENT USES
SFM does not adopt 2019 CFC Appendix O.

Item Number O-1 | Code Section CAC Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-0-1 APPENDIX O Approve Accept SFM does not adopt 2019 CFC Appendix O.

APPENDIX P - COMMUNITY WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE (WUI) FIRE HAZARD EVALUATION FRAMEWORK
SFM does not adopt 2022 CFC Appendix P.

Item Number P-1 Code Section CA.C Agency Public Comments Annotations CB.SC
Action Response Action
SFM 06-21-P-1 APPENDIX P Approve Accept SFM does not adopt Appendix P.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 07/2019) Commission Action Matrix August 20, 2021
Rulemaking File SFM 06/21 — Part 9 — 2021 Triennial Code Adoption Cycle SFM 06-21-CAM-PT9-45Day

Office of the State Fire Marshal Page 34 of 34



	2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, TITLE 24, PART 9 (2021 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE)
	AGENCY: OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL (SFM 06/21)
	BUILDING, FIRE, AND OTHER CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE
	CHAPTER 1 -- ADMINISTRATION DIVISION I -- CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION
	CHAPTER 2 -- DEFINITIONS
	CHAPTER 3 – GENERAL REGULATIONS
	CHAPTER 4 – EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS
	CHAPTER 5 – FIRE SERVICE FEATURES
	CHAPTER 6 – BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS
	CHAPTER 7 – FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES
	CHAPTER 8 – INTERIOR FINISH, DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS
	CHAPTER 9 – FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
	CHAPTER 10 – MEANS OF EGRESS
	CHAPTER 11 – CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS
	CHAPTER 12 – ENERGY SYSTEMS
	CHAPTER 20 – AVIATION FACILITIES
	CHAPTER 21 – DRY CLEANING
	CHAPTER 22 – COMBUSTIBLE DUST-PRODUCING OPERATIONS
	CHAPTER 23 – MOTOR FUEL-DISPENSING FACILITIES AND REPAIR GARAGES
	CHAPTER 24 – FLAMMABLE FINISHES
	CHAPTER 25 –FRUIT AND CROP RIPENING
	CHAPTER 26 – FUMIGATION AND INSECTICIDAL FOGGING
	CHAPTER 27 – SEMICONDUCTOR FABRICATION FACILITIES
	CHAPTER 28 – LUMBER YARDS AND AGRO-INDUSTRIAL SOLID BIOMASS AND WOODWORKING FACILITIES
	CHAPTER 29 – MANUFACTURE OF ORGANIC COATINGS
	CHAPTER 30 – INDUSTRIAL OVENS
	CHAPTER 31 -- TENTS, TEMPORARY SPECIAL EVENT STRUCTURES AND OTHER MEMBRANE STRUCTURES
	CHAPTER 32 -- HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE
	CHAPTER 33 – FIRE SAFETY DURING CONSTRUCTION AND DEMOLITION
	CHAPTER 34 – TIRE REBUILDING AND TIRE STORAGE
	CHAPTER 35 – WELDING AND OTHER HOT-WORK
	CHAPTER 36 – MARINAS
	CHAPTER 37 – COMBUSTIBLE FIBERS
	CHAPTER 38 – HIGHER EDUCATION LABORATORIES
	CHAPTER 39 – PROCESSING AND EXTRACTION FACILITIES
	CHAPTER 40 –STORAGE OF DISTILLED SPIRITS AND WINES
	CHAPTERs 41THROUGH 47 – RESERVED
	CHAPTER 48 – MOTION PICTURE AND TELEVISION PRODUCTION STUDIO SOUND STAGES, APPROVED PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PRODUCTION LOCATIONS
	CHAPTER 49 -- REQUIREMENTS FOR WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREAS
	CHAPTER 50 – HAZARDOUS MATERIALS – GENERAL PROVISIONS
	CHAPTER 51 – AEROSOLS
	CHAPTER 53 – COMPRESSED GASES
	CHAPTER 54 – CORROSIVE MATERIALS
	CHAPTER 55 – CRYOGENIC FLUIDS
	CHAPTER 56 – EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS
	CHAPTER 57 – FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS FLAMMABLE GASES AND FLAMMABLE COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS
	CHAPTER 58 –FLAMMABLE GASES AND FLAMMABLE CRYOGENIC FLUIDS
	CHAPTER 59 – FLAMMABLE SOLIDS
	CHAPTER 60 -HIGHLY TOXIC AND TOXIC MATERIALS
	CHAPTER 61 – LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES
	CHAPTER 62 – ORGANIC PEROXIDES
	CHAPTER 63 – OXIDIZERS, OXIDIZING GASES AND OXIDIZING CRYOGENIC FLUIDs
	CHAPTER 64 – PYROPHORIC MATERIALS
	CHAPTER 65 – PYROXYLIN (CELLULOSE NITRATE) PLASTICS
	CHAPTER 66 – UNSTABLE (REACTIVE) MATERIALS
	CHAPTER 67 – WATER-REACTIVE SOLIDS AND LIQUIDS
	CHAPTER 80 – REFERENCED standards
	APPENDIX CHAPTER 4 – SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY
	APPENDIX A A – BOARD OF APPEALS
	APPENDIX B – FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
	APPENDIX BB – FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
	APPENDIX C – FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
	appendix cc – FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
	APPENDIX CC – FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
	APPENDIX E – HAZARD CATEGORIES
	APPENDIX F – HAZARD RANKING
	APPENDIX G – CRYOGENIC FLUIDS – WEIGHT AND VOLUME EQUIVALENTS
	APPENDIX H – FIRE- HAZARDOUS MATERIALS MANAGEMENT PLAN (HMMP) AND HAZARDOUS MATERIALS INVENTORY STATEMENT (HMIS) INSTRUCTIONS FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
	APPENDIX I – FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS—NONCOMPLIANT CONDITIONS
	APPENDIX J – BUILDING INFORMATION SIGN
	APPENDIX K – CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING AMBULATORY CARE FACILITIES
	APPENDIX L – REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE FIGHTER AIR REPLENISHMENT SYSTEMS
	APPENDIX M – HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS—RETROACTIVE AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER REQUIREMENT
	APPENDIX N – INDOOR TRADE SHOWS AND EXHIBITIONS
	APPENDIX O – TEMPORARY HAUNTED HOUSES, GHOST WALKS AND SIMILAR AMUSEMENT USES
	APPENDIX P – COMMUNITY WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE (WUI) FIRE HAZARD EVALUATION FRAMEWORK




