
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 1 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX 
2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 2, 2021 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
AGENCY: DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT – STRUCTURAL SAFETY/COMMUNITY COLLEGES (DSA-SS/CC 05/21) 
 
LEGEND: 
CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required 
Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw 
CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required 
Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required 

STRUCTURAL DESIGN / LATERAL FORCES CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE 
BUILDING, FIRE, AND OTHER CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE 

 
ITEMS 1 THROUGH 4 HEARD BY THE BFO COMMITTEE 
 
CHAPTER 1, SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below 

Item Number 1 Code 
Section 

CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-1-1 106.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-1-2 110.3.12 Approve Accept  Repeal section  
 
CHAPTER 2, DEFINITIONS  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below 

Item Number 2 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-1 EQUIPMENT Approve Accept  Repeal DSA-SS/CC definition and incorporate 
with OSHPD definition  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-2 EQUIPMENT Approve Accept  Incorporate DSA-SS/CC definition to existing 
OSHPD definition  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-3 MASS 
TIMBER Approve Accept  Repeal definition  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-2-4 WALL, LOAD 
BEARING Approve Accept  Amend definition  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 2 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

CHAPTERS 3 THROUGH 10, 12, AND 14  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapters listed below without amendment 

Item Number 3 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-3-1 CHAPTERS 
3-10, 12, 14 Approve Accept  Adopt chapters without amendment  

 
CHAPTER 15, ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 4 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-4-1 1511.9 Approve Accept  Relocate text   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-4-2 1511.9.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

 
ITEMS 5 THROUGH 19 HEARD BY THE SDLF COMMITTEE 
 
CHAPTER 16, STRUCTURAL DESIGN  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, add, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 5 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-1 1617.3.2 Approve Accept  Add new” Alternative allowable stress design 
load combination”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-2 1617.3.3 Approve Accept  Amend section number  
DSA-SS/CC 05/21-

5.2.1 1617.3.3.1 Approve  Accept  Amend section number  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-3 1617.3.3.2 Approve  Accept  Amend section number  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-4 1617.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-5 1617.5.1.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-6 1617.5.1.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-7 1617.5.1.5 Approve  Accept  Amend section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 3 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 5 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-8 1617.5.1.6 Approve  Accept  Repeal section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-9 1617.5.3 Approve  Accept  Add new section “Seating for assembly uses”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-10 1617.6 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-11 1617.9.1 Approve  Accept  Add section    

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-12 1617.9.2 Approve  Accept  Add section       

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-13 

1617.9.3, 
1617.9.4, 
1617.9.5, 

1617.9.5.1, 
1617.9.5.2, 

1617.9.6 

Approve  Accept  Renumber sections  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-14 1617.11.2 Approve  Accept  Add text to “Reserved” section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-15 1617.11.4 Approve  Accept  Relocate existing text in section to 
1617.11.4.2, add new text to this section.  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-16 1617.11.4.1 Approve  Accept  Add new section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-17 1617.11.4.2 Approve  Accept  Relocated text from 1617.11.4   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-18 1617.11.4.3 Approve  Accept  Add new section. Relocate text from 
1617.11.5 to h).  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-19 1617.11.5 Approve  Accept  Repeal, relocate text and provide “Reserved”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-20 1617.11.9 Approve  Accept  Amend section to add new exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-21 1617.11.13 Approve  Accept  Repeal “Reserved” and Relocate text from 
1617.11.14  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-22 1617.11.14 Approve  Accept  Add new text to existing section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-23 1617.11.15 Approve  Accept  Repeal and replace text  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-24 1617.11.19 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-25 1617.11.20 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-5-26 1617.11.21 Approve  Accept  Amend section, Repeal Table 1224.4.11 and 
relocate to section 1617.11.21 item number 3  

 



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 4 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Chapter 16A, structural design  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 6 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-1 1603A.1 Approve  Accept  Amend Section to remove the “A” from 2308  
DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-

1.1 1604A.3.1 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-2 Table 
1604A.5 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing Table  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-3 1605A.2 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-4 1605A.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-5 1605A.3.1 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-6 1605A.3.2 Approve  Accept  Renumber section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-7 1606A.6 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-8 TABLE 
1607A.1 Approve  Accept  Amend table and footnotes  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-9 1607A.14.5 Approve  Accept  Renumber section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-10 1607A.16 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-11 1607A.19 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-12 1608A.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendments  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-13 TABLE 
1608.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing deletion of table  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-14 1612A.3 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-15 1613A.1 & 
Exceptions Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-16 1613A.2.1 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-17 1613A.2.3 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-18 TABLE 
1613A.2.3(1) Approve  Accept  Amend table and footnotes  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-19 TABLE 
1613A.2.3(2) Approve  Accept  Amend footnotes  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 5 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 6 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-20 1613A.2.5 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-21 TABLE 
1613.2.5(1) Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-22 TABLE 
1613.2.5(2) Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-23 1613A.2.5.1 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-24 1613A.2.5.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-25 1613A.3 & 
Exception 

Further 
Study Disagree  Amend exception.    

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-26 1617A.1.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-27 1617A.1.5 Approve  Accept  Relocate text from 1617A.1.5 to 1617A.1.5.2, 
add new text to this section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-28 1617A.1.5.1 Approve  Accept  Add new section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-29 1617A.1.5.2 Approve  Accept  Text relocated from 1617A.1.5  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-30 1617A.1.5.3 Approve  Accept  Add new section, relocate text from 1617A.1.6 
item f. to new item g in 1617A.1.5.3  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-31 1617A.1.6 Approve  Accept  Repeal section, mark “Reserved” and relocate 
text from item f to 1617A.1.5.3 item g  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-32 1617A.1.10 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Amend exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-33 1617A.1.14 Approve  Accept  OSHPD’s amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-34 1617A.1.15 Approve  Accept  Amend section, relocated from 1617A.1.16  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-35 1617A.1.16 Approve  Accept  Amend section, relocated from 1617A.1.15  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-36 1617A.1.18 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-37 1617A.1.19 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Amend exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-38 1617A.1.26 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-39 1617A.1.27 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing language  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-6-40 1617A.1.28 Approve  Accept  Amend section  
 



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 6 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

 
CHAPTER 17A, SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, add, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 7 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-1 1704A.2 & 
Exceptions Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-2 1704A.2.3 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-3 1704A.2.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-4 1704A.2.5 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-5 1704A.2.5.1 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-6 1704A.3.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-7 1704A.4 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-8 1704A.5 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-9 1704A.6 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-10 1704A.6.1 Further 
Study Withdraw  New amendment added (relocated from Part 

10 section 319.10.2.1)  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-11 1704A.6.2 Further 
Study Withdraw  New amendment added (relocated from Part 

10 section 319.10.2.2)  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-12 1705A.2.1 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendments  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-13 TABLE 
1705A.2.1 

Further 
Study Accept  Amend table and footnotes  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-14 1705A.2.2 Approve  Accept  Items missed from previous 2019 CBC  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-15 TABLE 
1705A.2.3 Approve  Accept  Amend footnote  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-16 1705A.2.5 Further 
Study Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-17 1705A.2.6 Further 
Study Disagree  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-18 1705A.3 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-19 TABLE 
1705A.3 Approve  Accept  Amend table  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 7 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 7 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-20 1705A.3.2 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-21 1705A.3.9 Approve  Accept  New section relocated from 1705A.19  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-22 1705A.3.9.1 Approve  Accept  New section relocated from 1705A.19.1  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-23 1705A.3.9.2 Approve  Accept  
New section relocated from 1908.5/1908A.5 
deleted by model code and modifying, 
including incorporation of 1908.4.1/1908A.4.1, 
and 1909.4.2 and amendment in 1908A.10.2. 

 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-24 1705A.4 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment.    

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-25 1705A.4.1 Approve  Withdraw  Carry forward existing amendment. CAC 
suggested editorial amendment.  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-26 TABLE 
1705A.5.3 Approve  Accept  Amend heading and table  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-27 1705A.5.5 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Renumber & Amend exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-28 1705A.5.7 Approve  Accept  Repeal section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-29 TABLE 
1705A.5.7 Approve  Accept  Repeal table  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-30 1705A.6.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-31 1705A.8.1 Approve  Accept  Add new section “Micropile tests”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-32 1705A.9.1 Approve  Accept  Add new section “Helical pile tests”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-33 1705A.12 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-34 1705A.12.1 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-35 1705A.12.2 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-36 1705A.13 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-37 1705A.13.1 Approve  Accept  No amendments  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-38 1705A.13.1.1 
& Exceptions Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 8 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 7 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-39 1705A.13.1.2 
& Exceptions Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-40 1705A.13.2 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-41 1705A.13.3 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-42 1705A.13.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-43 1705A.13.5 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-44 1705A.13.5.2 Approve  Accept  Add new section “Structural sealant glazing  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-45 1705A.13.6 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-46 1705A.13.8 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-47 1705.13.9 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-48 1705A.14 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-49 1705A.14.1.1 
& Exceptions Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-50 1705A.14.1.2 
& Exceptions Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-51 1705A.14.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-52 1705A.14.2.1 Approve  Accept  Add new section “structural sealant glazing 
testing”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-53 1705A.14.3 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-54 1705A.14.4 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-7-55 1705A.20 Approve  Accept  Repeal section  
 
  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 9 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

 
CHAPTER 18A, SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 8 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-1 1803A.1 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-2 1803A.2 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-3 1803A.5.4 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-4 1805A.2 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-5 1807A.1.1 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-6 1807A.1.3 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-7 1807A.1.4 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-8 1807A.1.5 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-9 1807.1.6 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-10 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-11 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-12 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-13 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-14 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-15 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-16 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-17 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-18 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-19 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-20 RESERVED      



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 10 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 8 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-21 1807A.2.2 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-22 1807A.2.5 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-23 1808A.8 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-24 TABLE 
1808A.8.1 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-25 1808A.8.6 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-26 1809A.7 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-27 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-28 1809A.8 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-29 1809A.9 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-30 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-31 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-32 1809A.10 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-33 1809A.12 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-34 1809A.15 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-35 1810A.3.1.5.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-36 1810.3.2.1.2 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment    

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-37 1810A.3.2.4 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-38 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-39 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-40 1810A.3.3.1.9 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-41 1810A.3.6 Approve Accept  Amend to repeal exception  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 11 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 8 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-42 1810A.3.8 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Amend to repeal model code exceptions, add 

CA amendment exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-43 1810A.3.9.4 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-44 1810A.3.9.4.1 
& Exceptions Approve Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-45 1810A.3.9.4.2
.1 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-46 1810A.3.9.4.2
.2 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-47 1810A.3.10.4 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-48 1810A.3.11.2 
& Exceptions Approve Accept  Amend section and exceptions  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-49 1810A.3.12 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-50 1810A.4.1.5 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-51 1811A.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-52 1811A.4 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-53 1812A.4.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-54 1812A.4.2 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-55 1812A.4.3 Approve Accept  Relocate items 2 & 3 to section 1812A.5  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-56 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-57 1812A.5 Further 
Study Accept  

Amend item 13. Items 15 and 16 relocated 
from section 1812A.4.3.  Phrase added 
pursuant to CAC recommendation. 

 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-58 1812A.6 Approve Disagree  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-59 1813A.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-8-60 1813A.5 Approve Accept  Amend section  
 
  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 12 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

CHAPTER 19, CONCRETE  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, add, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 9 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-1 1909.2.7.5 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Amend section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-2 1909.2.8 Approve Accept  Add section “Flat wall insulating concrete form 
(ICF) systems.  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-3 1909.3.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-4 1909.3.6 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-5 1909.3.7 Approve Accept  Add new section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-6 1909.3.8 Approve Accept  Add new section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-7 1909.3.9 Approve Accept  Amend section number  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-8 1909.4.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-9 1909.4.2 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-10 
1909.4.3 
through 
1909.4.6 

Approve Accept  Repeal sections  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-11 1909.4.3 Approve Accept  Amend section number from 1909.4.7 to 
1909.4.3  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-9-12 1909.4.8 Approve Accept  Repeal section  
 
CHAPTER 19A, CONCRETE  
DSA-SS/CC proposes to add, amend, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 10 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-1 1901A.7.1 & 
Exceptions Approve Accept  Amend section and exception 2  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-2 1903A.2 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-3 1903A.4 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-4 1903A.8 Approve Accept  Amend section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 13 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 10 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-4.1 1904A.1 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-5 1905A.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-6 1905.1.1 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-7 1905.1.2 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-8 1905.1.3 Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-9 1905A.1.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-10 
1905.1.4, 
1905.1.5, 
1905.1.6, 
1905.1.7 

Approve Accept  Repeal sections   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-11 
1905A.9, 

1905A.10, 
1905A.11 

Approve Accept  Carry forward existing amendments and 
renumber sections.  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-12 1905A.1.12 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-13 1905A.1.13 Approve Accept  Amend section which includes Table 21.22 
and footnotes.    

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-14 1905A.1.15 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-15 1905A.1.16 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-16 1905A.1.17 Approve Accept  Renumber section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-17 1908A.1 Approve Accept  Amend section, relocate paragraph (located 
under the exception) to 1905A.1.16  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-18 1908A.2 Approve Accept  Add new section “Tests and Inspections”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-19 1908A.3 Approve Accept  Renumber section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-20 1908A.12 Approve Accept  Repeal section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-10-21 1910A.5.5 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Amend section and add new exception  

 
  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 14 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

CHAPTER 20, ALUMINUM 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapter and carry forward existing amendments  

Item Number 11 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-11-1 Chapter 20 Approve  Accept  Adopt chapter and carry forward existing 
amendments  

 
CHAPTER 21, MASONRY 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 12 Code 
Section 

CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-12-0 2115.1.1 Approve  Accept  Amend section to add reference to TMS 
402/602  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-12-1 2115.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-12-2 2115.8.1 & 
2115.8.2 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-12-3 2115.10.1 Approve  Accept  Amend section  
 
CHAPTER 21A, MASONRY 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 13 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-0 2101A.1.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section to add reference to TMS 
402/602  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-1 2101A.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-2 2103A.1 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-2.1 2103A.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-3 2103A.5 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-3.1 2104A.1 Approve  Accept  Amend section to relocate last sentence 
to 2103A.1  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-3.2 2104A.1.3 Approve  Accept  Amend to add “Reinforced” to section title  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 15 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 13 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-3.3 
2104A.1.3.1 

through 
2104A.1.3.11.2 

Approve  Accept  
Reorganize, modify associated section in 
TMS 402/602 and repeal amendment 
language duplicative of TMS.  See ISOR. 

 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-4 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-5 2105A.2 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-6 2105A.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-6.1 2105A.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-7 2105A.5 Approve  Accept  Repeal section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-8 2105A.6 Approve  Accept  Repeal section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-8.1 
2106A.1 
through 

2106A.1.3 
Approve  Accept  

Reorganize, modify associated section in 
TMS 402/602 and repeal amendment 
language duplicative of TMS.  See ISOR. 

 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-9 2107A.4 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-10 2107A.6 Approve  Accept  Add new section “Masonry compressive 
strength”  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-11 2108A.1 & 
Exception Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-11.1 2108A.4 Approve  Accept  Add new section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-13-12 2109A Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  
 
CHAPTER 22, STEEL 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 14 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-14-1 2212.5.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-14-2 2212.6.1 Further 
Study Disagree  Amend section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-14-3 2212.6.2 Further 
Study Withdraw  Amend section   



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 16 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

 
CHAPTER 22A, STEEL 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 15 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-1 2205A.2.1.1 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-2 2205A.2.1.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-3 2205A.2.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-4 2207A.4 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-5 2210A.1 Approve  Accept  Items brought forward from the 2018 Triennial 
Code cycle that were missed in codification  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-6 2210A.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-7 2211A.1.1.1  Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-8 2211A.1.2 Approve  Accept  Carry forward existing amendment  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-9 2211A.1.3 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-10 2212A.1.2 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-11 2212A.2.1 Approve  Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-12 2213A.1 Further 
Study Disagree  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-13 RESERVED      

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-15-14 2213A.2 Further 
Study Withdraw  Amend section  

 
CHAPTER 23, WOOD 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend, repeal sections listed below  

Item Number 16 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-16-1 2303.1.3.1 Disapprove Withdraw  Amend section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-16-2 2304.10.1.2 Approve  Accept  Repeal section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 17 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 16 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-16-3 2304.10.2.1 Approve  Accept  Renumber section  
 
CHAPTER 24, GLASS AND GLAZING 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 17 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-17-1 2410.1.2 & 
Exception Approve Disagree  

Amend section and add new exception to item 
1.  Renumber items from alphabetical to 
numerical.  Amend item 6. 

 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-17-2 2410.1.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-17-3 2410.1.4 Approve Accept  Amend section  

 
CHAPTER 25, GYPSUM BOARD, GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCTS AND PLASTER 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapter and carry forward existing amendments  

Item Number 18 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-18-1 Chapter 25 Approve  Accept  Adopt chapter and carry forward existing 
amendments  

 
CHAPTER 26, PLASTIC 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapter and carry forward existing amendments  

Item Number 19 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-19-1 Chapter 26 Approve  Accept  Adopt chapter and carry forward existing 
amendments  

 
  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 18 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

ITEMS 20 THROUGH 22 HEARD BY THE BFO COMMITTEE 
 
CHAPTER 30, ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt chapter and carry forward existing amendments  

Item Number 20 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-20-1 Chapter 30 Approve Accept  Adopt chapter and carry forward existing 
amendments  

 
CHAPTER 31, SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to add, amend sections listed below  

Item Number 21 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-1 3102.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-2 3102.6.1.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-3 3111.1.1 & 
Exception Approve Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-4 3111.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-5 3115.1 & 
Exceptions Approve Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-6 3115.6 & 
Exceptions Approve Accept  Amend section and exception  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-7 3115.8.2 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-8 3115.8.4.1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-9 3115.8.4.2 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-10 3115.8.4.3 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-11 3115.8.5 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-12 3115.9 Approve Accept  Add section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-13 3115.9.1 Approve Accept  Add section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-14 3115.9.2 Approve Accept  Add section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 19 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 21 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-21-15 3115.9.3 Approve Accept  Add section  
 
CHAPTER 32, ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to adopt Chapter 32 without amendment 

Item Number 22 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-22-1 Chapter 32 Approve Accept  Adopt without amendment  
 
 
ITEM 23 HEARD BY THE SDLF COMMITTEE 
 
CHAPTER 35, REFERENCED STANDARDS 
DSA-SS/CC proposes to amend sections listed below  

Item Number 23 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-1 355.2-19 Approve Accept  Amend section   

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-2 
ANSI/AISC 

358—16/s1—
18/s2—20 

Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-3 

ANSI/APA 
PRG 320-

2019: 
ANSI/APA 

PRG 320-18: 

Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-4 
ASCE/SEI 
7—16 with 

Supplement 
1, 2 and 3: 

Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-5 41—17: Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-6 49—12 Approve Accept  Amend section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 20 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 23 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-7 A153/153M—
2016A Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-8 B695—
2004(2016): Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-9 C94/C94M─2
017A Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-10 C595/C595M
─18 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-11 C618─19 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-12 C635/C635M
—2017 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-13 C989—18a: Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-14 C1019─16 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-15 C1157/C1157
M─17 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-16 C1249─18 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-17 C1392─20 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-18 C1394—20: Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-19 D1586─20 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-20 D3498/D3498
M—03(2011) Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-21 D5778─20 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-22 E580/E580M
─17 Approve Accept  Amend section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 21 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 23 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-23 E605/E605M
—93(2015)e1 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-24 U1─20 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-25 D1.1/D1.1M─
15 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-26 D1.2/D1.2M─
14 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-27 D1.4/D1.4M─
2018 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-28 D1.8/D1.8M─
2016 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-29 QC1─2016 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-30 FM 
1950─2016 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-31 ICC-ES 
AC125─21* Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-32 ICC-ES 
AC156—21*  Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-33 ICC-ES 
AC178─21* Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-34 ICC-ES 
AC358─21* Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-35 602─2016 Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-36 857—13 Approve Accept  Amend section  



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 10/20) Commission Action Matrix  August 25, 2021 
DSA-SS/CC 05-21 – Part 2 – 2021 Tri Code Cycle Page 22 of 22 
Division of the State Architect, Structural Safety / Community Colleges 
 

Item Number 23 Code Section CAC 
Action 

Agency 
Response Public Comments Annotations CBSC 

Action 

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-37 61730-1—2017: Approve Accept  Amend section  

DSA-SS/CC 05/21-23-38 61730-2—2017: Approve Accept  Amend section  

  


	2022 California Building Code, TITLE 24, PART 2, 2021 International Building Code
	AGENCY: Division of the state architect – structural safety/community colleges (dsa-ss/cc 05/21)
	STRUCTURAL DESIGN / LATERAL FORCES CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE Building, Fire, and other code advisory committee
	ITEMS 1 THROUGH 4 HEARD BY THE BFO COMMITTEE
	Chapter 1, scope and administration
	Chapter 2, definitions
	Chapters 3 through 10, 12, and 14
	Chapter 15, roof assemblies and rooftop structures
	ITEMS 5 THROUGH 19 HEARD BY THE SDLF COMMITTEE
	Chapter 16, structural design
	Chapter 17a, special inspections and tests
	Chapter 18a, soils and foundations
	Chapter 19, concrete
	Chapter 19a, concrete
	Chapter 20, aluminum
	Chapter 21, masonry
	Chapter 21A, masonry
	Chapter 22, Steel
	Chapter 22a, Steel
	Chapter 23, wood
	Chapter 24, glass and glazing
	Chapter 25, gypsum board, gypsum panel products and plaster
	Chapter 26, plastic
	Chapter 30, Elevators and conveying systems
	Chapter 31, special construction
	Chapter 32, encroachments INTO the public right-of-way
	Chapter 35, referenced standards




