COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX

AGENCY: OFFICE OF STATEWIDE HEALTH PLANNING & DEV. [01/17]

LEGEND:

Item numbers refer to those presented to the Code Advisory Committees (CAC)s

(CAC)s:
ACCESS = Accessibility
BFO = Building, Fire & Other
HF = Health Facilities

PEME = Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, and Energy

SDLF = Structural Design/Lateral Forces
GB = Green Building

PEME CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE (OSHPD)

ARTICLE 89 — ADMINISTRATION

CAC Actions:
AA = Approve as amended
AS = Approve as submitted
D = Disapprove
FS = Further Study
STFS = Short Term Further Study

Agency Response:
A = Accept
D = Disagree
W/D = Withdraw

2019 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE

CCR, TITLE 24, PART 3 (2017 NEC)

Amendments, if indicated by agency:
S = Statutory
E = Existing
N =New

Matrix Paper Color (Used for Comm. Action Only):

GREEN = uncontested items
YELLOW = challenged items
SALMON = W/D, no action required

Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code (NEC) Article, carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 California Electrical Code (CEC) for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 & 5, and make

amendments as shown below

Type of : CBSC
Amena; (ACSAiA Régsgrige 45-Day Comments Action
[tem Number Code Section (rgerét D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
I\]) ' STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-1 | ARTICLE 89 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(NEC) Article, carry forward existing
amendments of the 2016 California Electrical
Code (CEC) for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3,4 &5,
and make the following amendments below
OSHPD 01/17-2 | 89.110.1 OSHPD 1 E AS A Amend
and OSHPD 1R.
OSHPD 01/17-3 | 89.110.1; E AS A Add OSHPD 1R
Application
OSHPD 01/17-4 | 89.110.1.1; item 2 E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-5 | 89.110.1.2 E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-6 | 89.110.2 OSHPD 2 N AS A New section
OSHPD 01/17-7 | 89.110.2 OSHPD2; E AS A Amend
Application
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 1 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development




OSHPD 01/17-8 | 89.110.2.1; ltem 2 E AS A Amend

OSHPD 01/17-9 | 89.110.2.2 E AS A Amend

OSHPD 01/17-10| 89.110.3.1; ltem 2 E AS A Amend

OSHPD 01/17-11| 89.110.3.2 E AS A Amend

OSHPD 01/17-12| 89.110.4.1; ltem 2 E AS A Amend

OSHPD 01/17-13| 89.110.4.2 E AS A Amend

OSHPD 01/17-14| 89.110.5 OSHPD 5 N AS A New section

OSHPD 01/17-15| 89.110.5; N AS A New language
Application

OSHPD 01/17-16 | 89.110.5; N AS A New language
Enforcing Agency

OSHPD 01/17-17| 89.110.5.1 w/ ltems N AS A New section
182

OSHPD 01/17-18 | 89.110.5.2 N AS A New section

ARTICLE 90 - INTRODUCTION
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without amendments for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3,4 & 5.

amendments for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3,4 & 5.

Type of CAC: Agency /i:Btii
. amend- (AS, AA, | Response 45-Day Comments .
Item Number Code Section ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-19 | ARTICLE 90 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without

CHAPTER 1 - GENERAL
Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code (NEC) Article, carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 California Electrical Code (CEC) for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 & 5, and make
amendments as shown below

Type of CAC: Agency ACCBt%i
. amend- (AS, AA, | Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) | STFS) | (A D, WD) FS)
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 2 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development




OSHPD 01/17-20| ARTICLE 100 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2,3 &4 &5.
OSHPD 01/17-21| ARTICLE 110 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article and carry
forward existing amendments of the 2016
CECfor OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-22| 110.2 Approval; E AS A Amend to add 1R & 5
[OSHPD 1, 1R, 2,
3485
OSHPD 01/17-23| 110.13;HemC E AS A Repeal
[oSHRD1,2.3&
4} Hespitals
OSHPD 01/17-24| 110.13;-#em-(C) E/IN STFS A New revised language
OSHPD 1, 1R, 2 CAC: STFS
3,48&5
Anchorage and
Bracing

CHAPTER 2 - WIRING AND PROTECTION

Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code (NEC) Article, carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 California Electrical Code (CEC) for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2,3,4 &5

Type of CAC: Agency CB.SC
Action
Item Number Code Section SMEIE SRR, RSO 00 CRl B Annotations (AS
ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-25| ARTICLE 200 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-26| ARTICLE 210 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-27| ARTICLE 215 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-28| ARTICLE 220 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-29| ARTICLE 220 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article and carry
forward existing amendments of the 2016
CEC for OSHPD 1
OSHPD 01/17-30| ARTICLE 225 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-31| ARTICLE 230 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 3 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development




OSHPD 01/17-32| ARTICLE 240 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-33| ARTICLE 250 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-34| ARTICLE 280 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-35| ARTICLE 285 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

CHAPTER 3 - WIRING METHODS AND MATERIALS
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3, 4 & 5.

Type gf CAC: Agency Acgi’)i
- amend- AS, AA, | Response 45-Day Comments ]
[tem Number Code Section ment ( D, FS, o % AC ( AS,yA A, D, FS) Annotations A(AASD
(S,E,N) STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-36| ARTICLE 300 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-37| ARTICLE 310 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-38| ARTICLE 312 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-39| ARTICLE 314 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-40| ARTICLE 320 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-41| ARTICLE 322 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-42| ARTICLE 324 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-43| ARTICLE 326 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-44| ARTICLE 328 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-45| ARTICLE 330 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-46| ARTICLE 332 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-47| ARTICLE 334 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 4 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



OSHPD 01/17-48| ARTICLE 336 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-49| ARTICLE 338 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-50| ARTICLE 340 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-51| ARTICLE 342 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-52| ARTICLE 344 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-53| ARTICLE 348 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-54| ARTICLE 350 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-55| ARTICLE 352 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-56| ARTICLE 353 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-57| ARTICLE 354 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-58| ARTICLE 355 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-59| ARTICLE 356 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-60| ARTICLE 358 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-61| ARTICLE 360 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-62| ARTICLE 362 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-63| ARTICLE 366 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-64| ARTICLE 368 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-65| ARTICLE 370 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-66| ARTICLE 372 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-67| ARTICLE 374 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-68| ARTICLE 376 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 5 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



OSHPD 01/17-69| ARTICLE 378 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-70|  ARTICLE 380 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-71| ARTICLE 382 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-72| ARTICLE 384 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-73| ARTICLE 386 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-74| ARTICLE 388 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-75| ARTICLE 390 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-76| ARTICLE 392 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-77| ARTICLE 393 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-78| ARTICLE 394 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-79| ARTICLE 396 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-80| ARTICLE 398 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-81| ARTICLE 399 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without

amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

CHAPTER 4 - EQUIPMENT FOR GENERAL USE
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Articles and carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 CEC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 & 5 and amend Sections as shown below

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Type of CAC: Agency Acgi’)i
. amend- (AS, AA, | Response 45-Day Comments .
[tem Number Code Section ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(:SD
(S,E,N) STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-82 | ARTICLE 400 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-83 | ARTICLE 402 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-84 | ARTICLE 404 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article for OSHPD 3.
(OSHPD 3)
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 6 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3




OSHPD 01/17-85 | ARTICLE 404 AS Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(OSHPD 1, 1R, (NEC) Article and carry forward existing
2,4&5) amendment of the 2016 California Electrical
Code (CEC) for OSHPD 1, IR, 2, 4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-86 | 404.4 switches AS Amend to add 1R &5
(OSHPD 1,1R,
2,48&5)
OSHPD 01/17-87 | ARTICLE 406 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article for OSHPD 3.
(OSHPD 3)
OSHPD 01/17-88 | ARTICLE 406 AS Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(OSHPD 1,1R, (NEC) Article and carry forward existing
2,4&5) amendment of the 2016 CEC for OSHPD 1,
1R, 2, 4 and 5.
OSHPD 01/17-89 406.9 Item C AS Amend to add 1R &5
OSHPD 01/17-90 | ARTICLE 408 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-91 | ARTICLE 409 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-92 | ARTICLE 410 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-93 | ARTICLE 411 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-94 | ARTICLE 422 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-95 | ARTICLE 424 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-96 | ARTICLE 425 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-97 | ARTICLE 426 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-98 | ARTICLE 427 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-99 | ARTICLE 430 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-100| ARTICLE 440 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-101| ARTICLE 445 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without

amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle
Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Page 7 of 17

8/31/18

OSHPD-01-17-Pt3




OSHPD 01/17-102|  ARTICLE 450 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-103| ARTICLE 455 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-104| ARTICLE 460 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-105| ARTICLE 470 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-106| ARTICLE 480 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-107| ARTICLE 490 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

CHAPTER 5 - SPECIAL OCCUPANCIES
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Articles and carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 CEC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 & 5 and amend Sections as shown below

Type of CAC: Agency CB.SC
b Code Secti amend- (AS, AA, | Response 45-Day Comments . Actg)n
Item Number ode Section ment D.FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) Annotations A(,ﬁ‘ D
(S,E/N) | STFS) | (A D, WD) FS)
OSHPD 01/17-108| ARTICLE 500 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-109| ARTICLE 501 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-110| ARTICLE 502 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-111| ARTICLE 503 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-112| ARTICLE 504 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-113| ARTICLE 505 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-114| ARTICLE 506 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-115| ARTICLE 510 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-116| ARTICLE 511 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 8 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



OSHPD 01/17-117| ARTICLE 513 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-118| ARTICLE 514 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-119| ARTICLE 515 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-120| ARTICLE 516 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-121| ARTICLE 517 AS Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(see annotations (NEC) Article, carry forward existing
for amended amendments of the 2016 California Electrical
sections) Code (CEC) for OSPHD 1, IR, 2, 3,4 & 5,
and make the following amendments below
OSHPD 01/17-122 517.2; AS Amend to add 1R & 5
General Care
(Category 2)
Space
OSHPD 01/17-123 517.2; AS Amend to add 1R & 5
Critical Care
(Category 1)
Space
OSHPD 01/17-124 517.2; AS Repeal OSHPD definitions
Support
(Category 4)
Space
OSHPD 01/17-125| 517.4 [OSHPD 1, AS Amend to add 1R & 5
1R, 2,4 & 5]
OSHPD 01/17-126 517.10 AS Amend
Applicability;
B)2)
OSHPD 01/17-127 10 AS Repeal OSHPD amendment
OSHPD 01/17-128| 517.12 Wiring AS Amend to add 1R & 5
Methods-(A)
OSHPD 01/17-129| 517.18 General AS Amend
Care Areas
(Category 2)
Spaces-(A),
Exception 2

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle
Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Page 9 of 17

8/31/18

OSHPD-01-17-Pt3




OSHPD 01/17-130| 517.18 General E/N AS Amend and add new Exception 5
Care Areas
(Category 2)
Spaces-(B),
Exception 1,3,4 &
5
OSHPD 01/17-131| 517.18 General E AS Amend
Care Areas
(Category 2)
Spaces-(D)
OSHPD 01/17-132| 517.19 Critical E/N AS Amend to add OSHPD exceptions
Care (Category 1)
Spaces-(B)(1)
OSHPD
Exception
OSHPD 01/17-133| 517.22 [OSHPD E AS Amend to add 1R &5
1,1R,2,3,4&5]
Artificial Lighting
OSHPD 01/17-134|  517.22 (B)(1) E AS Amend to add 1R &5
OSHPD 01/17-135| 517.24 [OSHPD E AS Amend to add 1R &5
1,1R, 2,3,4&5]
Mobile Medical
Facilities
OSHPD 01/17-136| 517.26 E AS Amend to add 1R &5
Application of
Other Articles
OSHPD 01/17-137 | 517.29 (A.1) E AS Amend
OSHPD 01/17-138 | 51%35517.30 E AS Amend, renumber
OSHPD 01/17-139 | 51735 517.30(B) E/N AS Amend and new OSHPD code section for
11 OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 &5.
OSHPD 01/17-140 | 53%35-517.30(B) E AS Repeal OSHPD amendment
(4)- [OSHPB L
284}
OSHPD 01/17-141| 54735 517.30(C) E AS Amend
OSHPD 01/17-142 | 51730 517.31 E AS Amend-2014 NEC Article 517.30 has been
renumbered to 517.31 in the 2017 NEC
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 10 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



OSHPD 01/17-143 | 51730 AS Amend
517.31(B)(1)(3)
OSHPD 01/17-144 | 51730 AS Amend
517.31(B)5)(3)
Bypass Isolation
OSHPD 01/17-145 | 51730 517.31 AS Amend
©)R)(3)(a)
OSHPD 01/17-146 | 51730 AS Amend
517.31(D)(D.1)
OSHPD 01/17-147 | 53730 517.31(E) AS Amend
OSHPD 01/17-148 | 51733 517.34 AS Amend-2014 NEC Article 517.33 has been
renumbered to 517.34 in the 2017 NEC
OSHPD 01/17-149 | 53733 517.34 (A) AS Amend
()
OSHPD 01/17-150 | 53733 517.34 (A) AS Amend
(@)()
OSHPD 01/17-151 | 53733 517.34 (A) AS Repeal items A(8i, 8k & 8I)
(B)rk-&+H
OSHPD 01/17-152 | 53733 517.34 (A) AS Renumber items 8m to 8j and 8n to 8k
(B)m [ &n k)
OSHPD 01/17-153 | 54733 517.34 (A) AS Amend and add new sub items
(10)(a through g)
OSHPD 01/17-154 | 51733 517.34 (A) AS Repeal items A1l
&
OSHPD 01/17-155| 51734 517.35 AS Amend-2014 NEC Article 517.34 has been
renumbered to 517.35 in the 2017 NEC
OSHPD 01/17-156 | 51%34 517.35 AS Amend
(A)(9 &10)
OSHPD 01/17-157 | 51734 517.35 AS Amend
(B)(1.1&1.2)
OSHPD 01/17-158 | 517.40 AS Amend
OSHPD 01/17-159 | 517.40(A.1) AS Amend
OSHPD 01/17-160 | 517.41(B.1) w/ AS Amend
Exc.1&2
OSHPD 01/17-161| 517.42 42 AS Relocate
OSHPD 01/17-162 | 517.4% 42 (B)(3) AS Amend
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 11 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



OSHPD 01/17-163 | 517.4% 42(E) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-164 | 517.42 43 E AS A Relocate
OSHPD 01/17-165| 517.42 43 (C)43) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-166 | 517.43 44 E AS A Relocate
OSHPD 01/17-167 | 517.43 44 (A)(6) E AS A Amend and add exception
OSHPD 01/17-168 | 517.43 44 (A)(7) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-169 | 517.43 44(A) (8) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-170 | 517.43 44 (A)(9) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-171| 517.43 44 (A)(10) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-172 | 517.43 44 E AS A Amend
(B)(1.1)
OSHPD 01/17-173| 517.45 (E.1) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-174 | 517.45 (F) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-175| 517.45 (G) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-176 | 517.45 (H) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-177 | 537123-{A E AS A Repeal OSHPD amendments
through-G)
OSHPD 01/17-178 | 517.123 [OSHPD EIN AS A New OSHPD amendment Items A through H
11R,2,3,4&5
Call Systems (A
through H)
OSHPD 01/17-179 | 517.124 E AS A Amend to add 1R & 5
OSHPD 01/17-180| ARTICLE 518 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-181| ARTICLE 520 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-182| ARTICLE 522 E AS A Avrticle is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4
&5.
OSHPD 01/17-183| ARTICLE 525 E AS A Avrticle is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4

&5.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle
Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Page 12 of 17

8/31/18

OSHPD-01-17-Pt3




OSHPD 01/17-184| ARTICLE 530 E AS A Avrticle is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4
&5.

OSHPD 01/17-185| ARTICLE 540 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

OSHPD 01/17-186| ARTICLE 545 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

OSHPD 01/17-187| ARTICLE 547 E AS A Avrticle is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4
&5.

OSHPD 01/17-188| ARTICLE 550 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

OSHPD 01/17-189| ARTICLE 551 E AS A Article is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4
&5.

OSHPD 01/17-190|  ARTICLE 552 E AS A Adopt entire 2014 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1, 2, 3, & 4.

OSHPD 01/17-191| ARTICLE 553 E AS A Avrticle is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4
&5.

OSHPD 01/17-192|  ARTICLE 555 E AS A Article is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4
&5.

OSHPD 01/17-193| ARTICLE 590 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without

amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

CHAPTER 6 - SPECIAL EQUIPMENT
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Articles and carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 CEC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 & 5 and amend Sections as shown below

Type of CAC: Agency Acgi)i
Item Number Code Section | 2mend- | (AS,AA, | Response DY GRS Annotations (AS
ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-194| ARTICLE 600 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-195| ARTICLE 604 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-196 | ARTICLE 605 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-197 | ARTICLE 610 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-198| ARTICLE 620 E AS A Adopt entire 2014 NEC Article for OSHPD 1R,
(OSHPD 2,3, & 2,3,48&5.
4)

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle
Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Page 13 of 17

8/31/18

OSHPD-01-17-Pt3




OSHPD 01/17-199| ARTICLE 620 AS Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(OSHPD 1) (NEC) Article and carry forward existing
amendment of the 2016 California Electrical
Code (CEC) for OSHPD 1.
OSHPD 01/17-200| ARTICLE 625 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-201| ARTICLE 626 AS Article is not adopted for OSHPD 1, 1R 2, 3,
&5.
OSHPD 01/17-202| ARTICLE 630 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-203| ARTICLE 640 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-204 | ARTICLE 645 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-205| ARTICLE 646 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-206 | ARTICLE 647 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-207 | ARTICLE 650 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-208| ARTICLE 660 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-209| ARTICLE 665 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-210| ARTICLE 668 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-211| ARTICLE 669 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-212| ARTICLE 670 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-213| ARTICLE 675 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-214| ARTICLE 680 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-215| ARTICLE 682 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-216| ARTICLE 685 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1, 1R 2, 3, 4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-217 | ARTICLE 690 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without

amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle
Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Page 14 of 17

8/31/18

OSHPD-01-17-Pt3




OSHPD 01/17-218| ARTICLE 691 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1, 1R 2, 3, 4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-219| ARTICLE 692 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-220| ARTICLE 694 AS Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-221| ARTICLE 695 AS Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(see annotations (NEC) Article for OSPHD 1, 1R, 2, 3,4 & 5,
for amended carry forward existing amendments of the
section) 2016 California Electrical Code (CEC), and
make amendments to 695.3

CHAPTER 7 - SPECIAL CONDITIONS
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Articles and carry forward existing amendments of the 2016 CEC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 & 5 and amend Sections as shown below

Type of CAC: Agency X(I:Bti)(r:]
[tem Number Code Section CSTE: (55 sy R Rt ACSITCHEE Annotations (AS
ment D, FS, CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) STFS) (A, D, WID) Fé) '
OSHPD 01/17-222 ARTICLE 700 (see E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Articles and carry
annotations for forward existing amendments of the 2016
amended section) CEC for OSHPD 1, 2, 3 & 4 and amend
Sections below
OSHPD 01/17-223 700.3 (A) E AS A Amendtoadd IR &5
OSHPD 01/17-224 700.3 (B) E AS A Amendto add 1R & 2
OSHPD 01/17-225 700.5 (C) E AS A Amend
OSHPD 01/17-226 700.12 (B) (2) E AS A Amend to add 1R &5
Exceptions 1-3
OSHPD 01/17-227 ARTICLE 701 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-228 ARTICLE 702 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-229 ARTICLE 705 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-229.1 ARTICLE 706 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-230 ARTICLE 708 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 National Electric Code
(NEC) Article and carry forward existing
amendments of the 2016 California Electrical
Code (CEC) for OSPHD 1, 1R, 2, 3,4 &5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18

Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle
Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development

Page 15 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3



OSHPD 01/17-231 ARTICLE 710 N AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-232 ARTICLE 712 N AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-233 ARTICLE 720 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-234 ARTICLE 725 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-235 ARTICLE 727 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-236 ARTICLE 728 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-237 ARTICLE 750 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-238 ARTICLE 760 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-239 ARTICLE 770 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

CHAPTER 8 - COMMUNICATIONS SYSTEMS
Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3, 4 & 5.

Type of CAC: Agency ACB.SC
ction
[tem Number Code Section CSTE: (8 o, | RETIESE SR LB Annotations (AS
ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
(S,E,N) | STFS) | (A D, WD) FS)
OSHPD 01/17-240 ARTICLE 800 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-241 ARTICLE 810 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-242 ARTICLE 820 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-243 ARTICLE 830 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
OSHPD 01/17-244 ARTICLE 840 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 16 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



CHAPTER 9 - TABLES
Adopt entire 2014 NEC Article without amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.

Type of CAC: Agency CB.SC
Action
ltem Number Code Section SMEIE SRR, RSO 00 CRl B Annotations (AS
ment D, FS, to CAC (AS, AA, D, FS) AA D
S,E.N) | STFS) | (A D, WD) FS)
OSHPD 01/17-245 Chapter 9 E AS A Adopt entire 2017 NEC Article without
amendments for OSHPD 1,1R 2, 3,4 & 5.
BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/2015) Commission Action Matrix 8/31/18
Rulemaking file OSHPD 01/17 - Part 3 — 2018 Tri Code Cycle Page 17 of 17 OSHPD-01-17-Pt3

Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development



